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RAC and Recreation Resource Advisory 
Council (RRAC) business; BLM State 
Director’s update on statewide issues; 
Update on Solar Energy Rights-of-Way 
Applications, and the Arizona 
Renewable Resources and 
Transportation Information System 
Project; a presentation on Mapping Land 
Health Achievements and Non- 
Achievements on BLM Lands: 
Improving Land Management, Planning, 
and Reporting of Land Condition; RAC 
review and discussion of the 2009 RAC 
Annual Work Plan; questions on BLM 
District/Field Manager reports; and 
reports by the RAC working groups. A 
public comment period will be provided 
at 11:30 a.m. on June 25, 2009, for any 
interested publics who wish to address 
the Council on BLM programs and 
business. 

Under the Federal Lands Recreation 
Enhancement Act, the RAC has been 
designated as the RRAC, and has the 
authority to review all BLM and Forest 
Service (FS) recreation fee proposals in 
Arizona. The afternoon meeting agenda 
on June 25 will include review and 
discussion of the Recreation 
Enhancement Act (REA) Working Group 
Report, and one BLM fee proposal in 
Arizona. 

The BLM Kingman Field Office is 
proposing to increase fees for use of its 
recreation facilities beginning October 1, 
2009. The fee sites and proposed 
changes are: Burro Creek Individual 
Sites ($10 to $14), Burro Creek Group 
Site ($30 to $50), Wild Cow Springs 
Individual Sites ($5 to $8), Wild Cow 
Springs Group Site ($15 to $20), and 
Windy Point Individual Sites ($4 to $8). 
The purpose of the BLM fee increase is 
to continue maintenance and improve 
its campground facilities. 

Following the BLM proposal, the 
RRAC will open the meeting to public 
comments on the fee proposal. After 
completing their RRAC business, the 
BLM RAC will reconvene to provide 
recommendations to the RAC 
Designated Federal Official on the fee 
proposal and discuss future RAC 
meetings and locations. 

DATES: Effective Date: June 25, 2009. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Deborah Stevens, Bureau of Land 
Management, Arizona State Office, One 
North Central Avenue, Suite 800, 
Phoenix, Arizona 85004–4427, 602– 
417–9504. 

Joanie Losacco, 
Acting Arizona State Director. 
[FR Doc. E9–12528 Filed 5–28–09; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4310–32–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

Fish and Wildlife Service 

[FWS–R9–IA–2009–N0114; 96300–1671– 
0000–P5] 

Receipt of Applications for Permit 

AGENCY: Fish and Wildlife Service, 
Interior. 
ACTION: Notice of receipt of applications 
for permit. 

SUMMARY: We, the U.S. Fish and 
Wildlife Service, invite the public to 
comment on the following applications 
for permits to conduct certain activities 
with endangered species and/or marine 
mammals. Both the Endangered Species 
Act and the Marine Mammal Protection 
Act require that we invite public 
comment on these permit applications. 
DATES: Written data, comments or 
requests must be received by June 29, 
2009. 

ADDRESSES: Documents and other 
information submitted with these 
applications are available for review, 
subject to the requirements of the 
Privacy Act and Freedom of Information 
Act, by any party who submits a written 
request for a copy of such documents 
within 30 days of the date of publication 
of this notice to: U.S. Fish and Wildlife 
Service, Division of Management 
Authority, 4401 North Fairfax Drive, 
Room 212, Arlington, Virginia 22203; 
fax 703/358–2281. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Division of Management Authority, 
telephone 703/358–2104. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Endangered Species 

The public is invited to comment on 
the following application for a permit to 
conduct certain activities with 
endangered species. This notice is 
provided pursuant to Section 10(c) of 
the Endangered Species Act of 1973, as 
amended (16 U.S.C. 1531 et seq.). 
Submit your written data, comments, or 
requests for copies of the complete 
applications to the address shown in 
ADDRESSES. 

Applicant: Dr. Paul D. Bienasz, New 
York, NY, PRT–212201 

The applicant requests a permit to 
acquire from Coriell Cell Repositories, 
Camden, NJ, in interstate commerce 
fibroblast cell lines from lesser dwarf 
lemurs (Cheirogaleus medius) for the 
purpose of scientific research. 

Marine Mammals 

The public is invited to comment on 
the following application for a permit to 

conduct certain activities with 
endangered marine mammals and/or 
marine mammals. The application was 
submitted to satisfy requirements of the 
Endangered Species Act of 1973, as 
amended (16 U.S.C. 1531 et seq. and/or 
the Marine Mammal Protection Act of 
1972, as amended (16 U.S.C. 1361 et 
seq.), and the regulations governing 
endangered species (50 CFR Part 17) 
and/or marine mammals (50 CFR Part 
18). Submit your written data, 
comments, or requests for copies of the 
complete applications or requests for a 
public hearing on these applications to 
the address shown in ADDRESSES. If you 
request a hearing, give specific reasons 
why a hearing would be appropriate. 
The holding of such a hearing is at the 
discretion of the Director. 

Applicant: University of Illinois 
Veterinary Diagnostic Laboratory, 
Maywood, IL, PRT–192878 

The applicant requests a permit to 
acquire and import unlimited numbers 
of biological specimens of manatees 
(Trichechus spp.), dugong (Dugong 
dugon), sea otters (Enhydra lutris), 
marine otter (Lontra felina), walrus 
(Odobenus rosmarus), and polar bear 
(Ursus maritimus) from animals in the 
wild and in captivity for the purpose of 
scientific research. This notification 
covers activities to be conducted by the 
applicant over a five-year period. 

Concurrent with publishing this 
notice in the Federal Register, we are 
forwarding a copy of the above 
application to the Marine Mammal 
Commission and the Committee of 
Scientific Advisors for their review. 

Dated: May 22, 2009. 
Lisa J. Lierheimer, 
Senior Permit Biologist, Branch of Permits, 
Division of Management Authority. 
[FR Doc. E9–12490 Filed 5–28–09; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4310–55–S 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

Bureau of Land Management 

Establishment of Interim Final 
Supplementary Rules Within the South 
Spit Cooperative Management Area, 
Managed by the Arcata Field Office, 
California 

AGENCY: Bureau of Land Management, 
Interior. 
ACTION: Establishment of Interim Final 
Supplementary Rules with request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The Bureau of Land 
Management (BLM) Arcata Field Office, 
California, is issuing interim final 
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