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Miscellaneous Wireless Communication 
Services: 2.3 GHz Band. 

Form No.: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for 

profit entities. 
Number of Respondents and 

Responses: 155 respondents and 5,761 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.5–40 
hours. 

Frequency of Response: 
Recordkeeping requirement, Third Party 
Disclosure, and On occasion and 
Quarterly reporting requirements. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. The statutory 
authority for this information collection 
is 47 U.S.C. 154, 301, 302(a), 303, 309, 
332, 336, and 337 unless otherwise 
noted. 

Total Annual Burden: 24,065 hours. 
Annual Cost Burden: $370,250. 
Needs and Uses: The information 

filed by Wireless Communications 
Service (WCS) licensees in support of 
their construction notifications will be 
used to determine whether licensees 
have complied with the Commission’s 
performance benchmarks. Further, the 
information collected by licensees in 
support of their coordination obligations 
will help avoid harmful interference to 
Satellite Digital Audio Radio Service 
(SDARS), Aeronautical Mobile 
Telemetry (AMT) and Deep Space 
Network (DSN) operations in other 
spectrum bands. 

Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–09941 Filed 5–9–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0975; FR ID 85420] 

Information Collection Being 
Submitted for Review and Approval to 
Office of Management and Budget 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995, the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
public and other Federal Agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 

Pursuant to the Small Business 
Paperwork Relief Act of 2002, the FCC 
seeks specific comment on how it can 
further reduce the information 
collection burden for small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 
DATES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be 
submitted on or before June 9, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: Comments should be sent to 
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain. 
Find this particular information 
collection by selecting ‘‘Currently under 
30-day Review—Open for Public 
Comments’’ or by using the search 
function. Your comment must be 
submitted into www.reginfo.gov per the 
above instructions for it to be 
considered. In addition to submitting in 
www.reginfo.gov also send a copy of 
your comment on the proposed 
information collection to Cathy 
Williams, FCC, via email to PRA@
fcc.gov and to Cathy.Williams@fcc.gov. 
Include in the comments the OMB 
control number as shown in the 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information or copies of the 
information collection, contact Cathy 
Williams at (202) 418–2918. To view a 
copy of this information collection 
request (ICR) submitted to OMB: (1) Go 
to the web page http://www.reginfo.gov/ 
public/do/PRAMain, (2) look for the 
section of the web page called 
‘‘Currently Under Review,’’ (3) click on 
the downward-pointing arrow in the 
‘‘Select Agency’’ box below the 
‘‘Currently Under Review’’ heading, (4) 
select ‘‘Federal Communications 
Commission’’ from the list of agencies 
presented in the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box, 
(5) click the ‘‘Submit’’ button to the 
right of the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box, (6) 
when the list of FCC ICRs currently 
under review appears, look for the Title 
of this ICR and then click on the ICR 
Reference Number. A copy of the FCC 
submission to OMB will be displayed. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Commission may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) control number. No person shall 
be subject to any penalty for failing to 
comply with a collection of information 
subject to the PRA that does not display 
a valid OMB control number. 

As part of its continuing effort to 
reduce paperwork burdens, as required 
by the Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) 
of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 3501–3520), the FCC 
invited the general public and other 
Federal Agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on the 

following information collection. 
Comments are requested concerning: (a) 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimates; (c) ways to enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; and (d) ways to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. Pursuant to the 
Small Business Paperwork Relief Act of 
2002, Public Law 107–198, see 44 U.S.C. 
3506(c)(4), the FCC seeks specific 
comment on how it might ‘‘further 
reduce the information collection 
burden for small business concerns with 
fewer than 25 employees.’’ 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0975. 
Title: Sections 68.105 and 1.4000, 

Promotion of Competitive Networks in 
Local Telecommunications Markets 
Multiple Tenant Environments (MTEs). 

Form Number: Not applicable. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit entities, not-for-profit institutions, 
and State, local, or Tribal governments. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 5,022 respondents; 217,658 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.5 
hour–10 hours. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement and third-party 
disclosure requirement. 

Obligation To Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. Statutory 
authority for this information collection 
is contained in 47 U.S.C. 151 and the 
Telecommunications Act of 1996, 
Public Law 104–104. 

Total Annual Burden: 144,217 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: No cost. 
Needs and Uses: This information 

facilitates efficient interaction between 
premises owners and local exchange 
carriers (LECs) regarding the placement 
of the demarcation point, which marks 
the end of wiring under control of the 
LEC and the beginning of wiring under 
the control of the premises owner or 
subscriber. The demarcation point is a 
critical point of interconnection where 
competitive LECs can gain access to the 
inside wiring of the building to provide 
service to customers in the building. 
This collection also helps ensure that 
fixed wireless antennas covered by the 
OTARD rule comply with the 
Commission’s limits on radiofrequency 
exposure and provides the Commission 
with information on the state of the 
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1 12 U.S.C. 1844(c)(1)(A). 2 83 FR 42680 (August 27, 2018). 

market. In short, this collection helps 
foster competition in local 
telecommunications markets by 
ensuring that competing 
telecommunications providers can 
provide services to customers in 
multiple tenant environments. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–09940 Filed 5–9–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Announcement of Board 
Approval Under Delegated Authority 
and Submission to OMB 

AGENCY: Board of Governors of the 
Federal Reserve System. 
SUMMARY: The Board of Governors of the 
Federal Reserve System (Board) is 
adopting a proposal to extend for three 
years, without revision, the Report of 
Institution-to-Aggregate Granular Data 
on Assets and Liabilities on an 
Immediate Counterparty Basis (FR 2510; 
OMB No. 7100–0376). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Federal Reserve Board Clearance 
Officer—Nuha Elmaghrabi—Office of 
the Chief Data Officer, Board of 
Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, Washington, DC 20551, (202) 
452–3829. 

Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) Desk Officer for the Federal 
Reserve Board, Office of Information 
and Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
Management and Budget, New 
Executive Office Building, Room 10235, 
725 17th Street NW, Washington, DC 
20503, or by fax to (202) 395–6974. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: On June 
15, 1984, OMB delegated to the Board 
authority under the Paperwork 
Reduction Act (PRA) to approve and 
assign OMB control numbers to 
collections of information conducted or 
sponsored by the Board. Board- 
approved collections of information are 
incorporated into the official OMB 
inventory of currently approved 
collections of information. The OMB 
inventory, as well as copies of the PRA 
Submission, supporting statements, and 
approved collection of information 
instrument(s) are available at https://
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain. 
These documents are also available on 
the Federal Reserve Board’s public 
website at https://www.federalreserve.
gov/apps/reportforms/review.aspx or 
may be requested from the agency 

clearance officer, whose name appears 
above. 

Final Approval Under OMB Delegated 
Authority of the Extension for Three 
Years, Without Revision, of the 
Following Information Collection 

Report title: Report of Institution-to- 
Aggregate Granular Data on Assets and 
Liabilities on an Immediate 
Counterparty Basis. 

Agency form number: FR 2510. 
OMB control number: 7100–0376. 
Frequency: Quarterly. 
Respondents: Any bank holding 

company (BHC) that is organized under 
the laws of the United States or any U.S. 
state and that is identified as a global 
systemically important bank (G–SIB) 
holding company under the Board’s 
Regulation Q. 

Estimated number of respondents: 8. 
Estimated average hours per response: 

568. 
Estimated annual burden hours: 

18,176. 
General description of report: The FR 

2510 collects granular exposure data on 
the assets, liabilities, and off-balance 
sheet holdings of G–SIBs, providing 
breakdowns by country, instrument, 
currency, maturity, sector, and other 
factors, and also collects country 
exposure data on an immediate 
counterparty basis and detailed 
information on firms’ derivatives 
exposures. The information collected by 
the FR 2510 supports the Board’s 
supervision of U.S. G–SIBs by allowing 
for a more complete balance sheet 
analysis of these firms and allows the 
Board to more closely monitor the 
systemic impacts of such firms’ 
activities and investments. 

Legal authorization and 
confidentiality: The FR 2510 is 
authorized by section 5 of the Bank 
Holding Company Act (BHC Act). 
Section 5 of the BHC Act authorizes the 
Board to require a bank holding 
company and any subsidiary of such 
company to submit reports under oath 
to keep the Board informed as to its 
financial condition, systems for 
monitoring and controlling financial 
and operating risks, and transactions 
with depository institution subsidiaries 
of the bank holding company.1 The FR 
2510 is mandatory for U.S. G–SIBs. 

The information collected in the FR 
2510 is collected as part of the Board’s 
supervisory process and is therefore 
considered confidential pursuant to 
exemption 8 of the Freedom of 
Information Act (FOIA), which protects 
information contained in ‘‘examination, 
operating, or condition reports’’ 

obtained in the bank supervisory 
process. In addition, individual 
respondents may request that 
information be kept confidential 
pursuant to exemption 4 of the FOIA, 
which protects nonpublic commercial 
or financial information, which is both 
customarily and actually treated as 
private by the respondent. 
Determinations of confidentiality based 
on exemption 4 of the FOIA would be 
made on a case-by-case basis. 

Current actions: On October 18, 2021, 
the Board published a notice in the 
Federal Register (86 FR 57672) 
requesting public comment for 60 days 
on the extension, without revision, of 
the Report of Institution-to-Aggregate 
Granular Data on Assets and Liabilities 
on an Immediate Counterparty Basis. 
The comment period for this notice 
expired on December 17, 2021. The 
Board received one comment. 

Detailed Discussion of Public 
Comments 

First, the commenter identified 
certain reporting differences between 
the Country Exposure Report (FFIEC 
009; OMB No. 7100–0035) and the FR 
2510 and argued that reporting of 
similar items between the two reports 
should be more aligned in order to 
minimize reporting burden. 
Specifically, the commenter highlighted 
the difference in remaining maturity on 
debt securities held for trading between 
the FFIEC 009 and the FR 2510. On the 
FFIEC 009, only a single bucket 
containing maturities of one year or less 
is required, whereas the FR 2510 
requires four maturity buckets across 
the entire term structure. While the 
Board acknowledges the additional 
burden in reporting all maturity buckets 
in the FR 2510, this was part of the 
original design of the report and was 
meant to ‘‘provide significantly more 
detail regarding the balance sheet and 
derivatives exposures of U.S. G–SIBs.’’ 2 
This original design was part of an 
internationally agreed upon process to 
facilitate the aggregation and analysis of 
consistent and comparable data from 
G–SIBs globally. In addition, the FR 
2510 collects a more fulsome set of 
remaining maturity information to better 
understand the credit market and 
liquidity profiles of U.S. G–SIBs, which 
may have systemic implications at the 
individual institution level or the 
aggregate level. The FFIEC 009, on the 
other hand, collects overall country risk 
exposures for banks of all sizes and such 
detail is not needed for smaller 
institutions. 
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