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1 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(1). 
2 17 CFR 240.19b–4. 

whose public shareholders purchase 
shares on the basis of a prospectus 
containing the disclosure contemplated 
by condition 4 below, by the initial 
shareholder(s) before offering shares of 
such Fund to the public. 

3. Within 90 days of the hiring of any 
new investment subadvisor, the Adviser 
will furnish shareholders of the affected 
Fund with all information about such 
investment subadvisor that would be 
included in a proxy statement, 
including any change in such disclosure 
caused by the addition of the new 
investment subadvisor. To meet this 
condition, the Funds will provide 
shareholders with an information 
statement meeting the requirements of 
Regulation 14C, Schedule 14C, and Item 
22 of Schedule 14A under the Securities 
Exchange Act of 1934. 

4. Each Fund will disclose in its 
prospectus the existence, substance, and 
effect of any order granted pursuant to 
the application. In addition, each Fund 
will hold itself out to the public as 
employing the Management Structure 
described in the application. The 
prospectus will prominently disclose 
that the Adviser has ultimate 
responsibility (subject to oversight by 
the Board) to oversee investment 
subadvisors and recommend their 
hiring, termination and replacement. 

5. No trustee or officer of any Fund, 
or director or officer of the Adviser will 
own directly or indirectly (other than 
through a pooled investment vehicle 
that is not controlled by any such 
director, trustee, or officer) any interest 
in an investment subadvisor except for: 
(i) Ownership of interests in the Adviser 
or any entity that controls, is controlled 
by, or under common control with the 
Adviser; or (ii) ownership of less than 
1% of the outstanding securities of any 
class of equity or debt securities of any 
publicly-traded company that is either 
an investment subadvisor or an entity 
that controls, is controlled by or is 
under common control with an 
investment subadvisor. 

6. The Adviser will not enter into 
investment subadvisory agreements on 
behalf of a Fund with any affiliated 
investment subadvisor without such 
agreement, including the compensation 
to be paid under the agreement, being 
approved by the shareholders of the 
applicable Fund. 

7. At all times, at least a majority of 
the Board will be Independent Trustees, 
and the nomination of new or additional 
Independent Trustees will be placed 
within the discretion of the then- 
existing Independent Trustees. 

8. When a change of investment 
subadvisor is proposed for a Fund with 
an affiliated investment subadvisor, the 

Board, including a majority of the 
Independent Trustees, will make a 
separate finding, reflected in the 
minutes of meetings of the Board, that 
any such change of investment 
subadvisors is in the best interest of the 
Fund and its shareholders and does not 
involve a conflict of interest from which 
the Adviser or the affiliated investment 
subadvisor derives an inappropriate 
advantage. 

9. In the event the Commission adopts 
a rule under the Act providing 
substantially similar relief to that in the 
requested order, the requested order 
will expire on the effective date of that 
rule. 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Investment Management, under delegated 
authority. 
Elizabeth M. Murphy, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E9–28560 Filed 11–27–09; 8:45 am] 
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November 25, 2009. 
It appears to the Securities and 

Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Customer 
Sports, Inc. because it has not filed any 
periodic reports since the period ended 
April 30, 2000. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Leonidas 
Films, Inc. (n/k/a Consolidated Pictures 
Group, Inc.) because it has not filed any 
periodic reports since the period ended 
March 31, 2001. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Sportsprize 
Entertainment, Inc. because it has not 
filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended August 31, 2000. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of U.S. 
Interactive, Inc. because it has not filed 
any periodic reports since the period 
ended September 30, 2000. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 

lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of USA 
Biomass Corp. because it has not filed 
any periodic reports since the period 
ended December 31, 2002. 

The Commission is of the opinion that 
the public interest and the protection of 
investors require a suspension of trading 
in the securities of the above-listed 
companies. Therefore, it is ordered, 
pursuant to Section 12(k) of the 
Securities Exchange Act of 1934, that 
trading in the securities of the above- 
listed companies is suspended for the 
period from 9:30 a.m. EST on November 
25, 2009, through 11:59 p.m. EST on 
December 9, 2009. 

By the Commission. 
Jill M. Peterson, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E9–28639 Filed 11–25–09; 11:15 
am] 
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Self-Regulatory Organizations; New 
York Stock Exchange LLC; Notice of 
Filing of Proposed Rule Change to 
Increase the Ceiling on Its Equity 
Ownership Interest in BIDS Holdings 
L.P. to Less Than 10% 

November 20, 2009. 
Pursuant to Section 19(b)(1) of the 

Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (the 
‘‘Act’’) 1 and Rule 19b–4 thereunder,2 
notice is hereby given that, on 
November 18, 2009, New York Stock 
Exchange LLC (‘‘NYSE’’ or the 
‘‘Exchange’’) filed with the Securities 
and Exchange Commission (the 
‘‘Commission’’) the proposed rule 
change as described in Items I, II, and 
III below, which Items have been 
prepared by the Exchange. The 
Commission is publishing this notice to 
solicit comments on the proposed rule 
change from interested persons. 

I. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Terms of Substance of 
the Proposed Rule Change 

The Exchange proposes to increase 
the ceiling on the Exchange’s equity 
ownership interest in BIDS Holdings 
L.P. (‘‘BIDS’’), a member of the 
Exchange, to less than 10% from the 
current level of less than 9%, pursuant 
to the pilot program that provides an 
exception to NYSE Rule 2B by 
permitting such equity ownership as 
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