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Office of Information and Regulatory 
Affairs, Office of Management and 
Budget, New Executive Office Building, 
Washington, DC 20503. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Leneta Gregorie, at the FDIC address 
above. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Proposal to renew the following 

currently approved collections of 
information: 

Title: Basel II: Disclosures and 
Recordkeeping. 

OMB Number: 3064–0153. 
Frequency of Response: On occasion. 
Affected Public: Insured state 

nonmember banks and state savings 
institutions. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 8. 
Estimated Average Time per 

Response: implementation—330 hours; 
systems maintenance—27.9 hours; 
disclosures—5.79 hours; control, 
oversight and verification—11.05 hours; 
documentation—19 hours; and 
supervisory approvals—16.82 hours. 

Total Annual Burden: 3,284 hours. 
General Description of Collection: On 

December 7, 2007, the FDIC, the Office 
of the Comptroller, and the Federal 
Reserve Board (collectively, the 
‘‘Agencies’’) issued the joint final rule 
titled Risk-Based Capital Standards: 
Advanced Capital Adequacy Framework 
(final rule) implementing a new risk- 
based regulatory capital framework for 
institutions in the United States. The 
final rule requires certain large or 
internationally active banks and bank 
holding companies (BHCs) to (1) adopt 
a written implementation plan, (2) 
update that plan for any mergers, (3) 
obtain prior written approvals for the 
use of certain approaches for 
determining risk-weighted assets, and 
(4) make certain public disclosures 
regarding their capital ratios, their 
components, and information on 
implicit support provided to a 
securitization. There are no required 
reporting forms associated with this 
information collection. 

The Agencies, on August 30, 2012, 
proposed three rules that would amend 
this collection: 

Regulatory Capital Rules: Regulatory 
Capital, Implementation of Basel III, 
Minimum Regulatory Capital Ratios, 
Capital Adequacy, Transition 
Provisions, and Prompt Corrective 
Action (77 FR 52792); Regulatory 
Capital Rules: Standardized Approach 
for Risk-Weighted Assets; Market 
Discipline and Disclosure Requirements 
(77 FR 52888); and Regulatory Capital 
Rules: Advanced Approaches Risk- 
based Capital Rules; Market Risk 
Capital Rule (77 FR 52978). An 

information collection request to revise 
and rename the collection on the basis 
of the three rules has been submitted to 
OMB for review. However, since the 
FDIC’s collection expires on January 31, 
2013, the FDIC is proceeding with the 
renewal process to ensure continuation 
of the collection in the event that OMB 
does not act on the FDIC’s request to 
revise the collection prior to its 
expiration date. 

Request for Comment 
Comments are invited on: (a) Whether 

the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the FDIC’s functions, including whether 
the information has practical utility; (b) 
the accuracy of the estimates of the 
burden of the information collection, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the information collection on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
All comments will become a matter of 
public record. 

Dated at Washington, DC, this 4th day of 
September, 2012. 

Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation. 
Valerie J. Best, 
Assistant Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2012–22191 Filed 9–7–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6714–01–P 

FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE 
CORPORATION 

Notice to All Interested Parties of the 
Termination of the Receivership of 
10233, Access Bank, Champlin, MN 

Notice is hereby given that the Federal 
Deposit Insurance Corporation (‘‘FDIC’’) 
as Receiver for Access Bank, (‘‘the 
Receiver’’) intends to terminate its 
receivership for said institution. The 
FDIC was appointed receiver of Access 
Bank on May 7, 2010. The liquidation 
of the receivership assets has been 
completed. To the extent permitted by 
available funds and in accordance with 
law, the Receiver will be making a final 
dividend payment to proven creditors. 

Based upon the foregoing, the 
Receiver has determined that the 
continued existence of the receivership 
will serve no useful purpose. 
Consequently, notice is given that the 
receivership shall be terminated, to be 
effective no sooner than thirty days after 
the date of this Notice. If any person 
wishes to comment concerning the 
termination of the receivership, such 

comment must be made in writing and 
sent within thirty days of the date of 
this Notice to: Federal Deposit 
Insurance Corporation, Division of 
Resolutions and Receiverships, 
Attention: Receivership Oversight 
Department 8.1, 1601 Bryan Street, 
Dallas, TX 75201. 

No comments concerning the 
termination of this receivership will be 
considered which are not sent within 
this time frame. 
Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation. 

Dated: August 29, 2012. 
Valerie J. Best, 
Assistant Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2012–22192 Filed 9–7–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6714–01–P 

FEDERAL MARITIME COMMISSION 

Sunshine Act Meetings 

AGENCY HOLDING THE MEETING: Federal 
Maritime Commission. 

TIME AND DATE: September 12, 2012— 
2:00 p.m. 

PLACE: 800 North Capitol Street NW., 
First Floor Hearing Room, Washington, 
DC. 

STATUS: The meeting will be held in 
Open and Closed Session. 

MATTERS TO BE CONSIDERED:  

Open Session 

1. Briefing on Logistica De Las 
Americas Conference. 

2. Docket No. 11–05: Amendments to 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure. 

3. Docket No. 11–16: Passenger Vessel 
Operator Financial Responsibility 
Requirements for Nonperformance of 
Transportation. 

4. Docket No. 12–07: Solicitation of 
Views on Requests to Develop and 
Release Container Freight Rate Indices 
for U.S. Agricultural Exports based on a 
Sampling of Service Contracts filed with 
the FMC. 

Closed Session 

1. Rate and Surcharge Trends in the 
Trans Pacific Trade. 

CONTACT PERSON FOR MORE INFORMATION: 
Karen V. Gregory, Secretary, (202) 523– 
5725. 

Rachel E. Dickon, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2012–22200 Filed 9–6–12; 11:15 am] 
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