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E. Notice of Decision 

EPA hereby provides public notice 
that the Agency has taken final action 
authorizing Maine to administer the 
MEPDES program in the territories of 
the Penobscot Nation and 
Passamaquoddy Tribe, with the 
exception of facilities with discharges 
that qualify as internal tribal matters, 
and review of the issues related to this 
action is available as provided in CWA 
section 509(b)(1)(D). EPA has not taken 
final action Maine’s application with 
respect to the issues related to the state’s 
jurisdiction and the applicability of 
state law in the lands of the Houlton 
Band of Maliseet Indians and the 
Aroostook Band of Micmacs, and review 
of those issues is not available until EPA 
takes final action on Maine’s program as 
it applies in those areas.

Authority: This action is taken under the 
authority of section 402 of the Clean Water 
Act as amended, 42 U.S.C. 1342.

Dated: October 31, 2003. 
Robert W. Varney, 
Regional Administrator, Region I.
[FR Doc. 03–28653 Filed 11–17–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6560–50–P

OFFICE OF SCIENCE AND 
TECHNOLOGY POLICY 

Meeting of the President’s Council of 
Advisors on Science and Technology

ACTION: Notice of meeting.

SUMMARY: This notice sets forth the 
schedule and summary agenda for a 
meeting of the President’s Council of 
Advisors on Science and Technology 
(PCAST), and describes the functions of 
the Council. Notice of this meeting is 
required under the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (FACA). 

Dates and Place: December 2, 2003, 
Washington, DC. The meeting will be 
held in the Monticello Ballroom (lower 
level) of the Wyndham Washington 
Hotel, 1400 M Street, NW, Washington, 
DC 20005. 

Type of Meeting: Open. Further 
details on the agenda will be posted on 
the PCAST Web site at: http://
www.ostp.gov/PCAST/pcast.html. 

Proposed Schedule and Agenda: The 
President’s Council of Advisors on 
Science and Technology is scheduled to 
meet in open session on Tuesday 
December 3, 2003, at approximately 9 
a.m. The PCAST is tentatively 
scheduled to: (1) Discuss and, pending 
the discussion, approve a draft report 
from its information technology 
manufacturing-competitiveness 
subcommittee; (2) discuss the 

preliminary observations and draft 
recommendations of its workforce-
education subcommittee; and (3) 
continue its discussion of 
nanotechnology and its review of the 
federal National Nanotechnology 
Initiative. This session will end at 
approximately 4 p.m. Additional 
information on the agenda will be 
posted at the PCAST Web site at: http:
//www.ostp.gov/PCAST/pcast.html. 

Public Comments: There will be time 
allocated for the public to speak on the 
above agenda items. This public 
comment time is designed for 
substantive commentary on PCAST’s 
work topics, not for business marketing 
purposes. Please submit a request for 
the opportunity to make a public 
comment five (5) days in advance of the 
meeting. The time for public comments 
will be limited to no more than 5 
minutes per person. Written comments 
are also welcome at any time following 
the meeting. Please notify Stan Sokul, 
PCAST Executive Director, at (202) 456–
6070, or fax your request/comments to 
(202) 456–6021.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
information regarding time, place and 
agenda, please call Cynthia Chase at 
(202) 456–6010, prior to 3 p.m. on 
Monday, December 1, 2003. Information 
will also be available at the PCAST Web 
site at: http://www.ostp.gov/PCAST/
pcast.html. Please note that public 
seating for this meeting is limited and 
is available on a first-come, first-served 
basis.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
President’s Council of Advisors on 
Science and Technology was 
established by Executive Order 13226, 
on September 30, 2001. The purpose of 
PCAST is to advise the President on 
matters of science and technology 
policy, and to assist the President’s 
National Science and Technology 
Council in securing private sector 
participation in its activities. The 
Council members are distinguished 
individuals appointed by the President 
from non-Federal sectors. The PCAST is 
co-chaired by Dr. John H. Marburger, III, 
the Director of the Office of Science and 
Technology Policy, and by E. Floyd 
Kvamme, a Partner at Kleiner Perkins 
Caufield & Byers.

Stanley S. Sokul, 
Executive Director, PCAST, and Counsel, 
Office of Science and Technology Policy.
[FR Doc. 03–28854 Filed 11–17–03; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3170–01–P

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR Part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below.

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The application also will be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 
Additional information on all bank 
holding companies may be obtained 
from the National Information Center 
website at www.ffiec.gov/nic/.

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than December 15, 
2003.

A. Federal Reserve Bank of 
Richmond (A. Linwood Gill, III, Vice 
President) 701 East Byrd Street, 
Richmond, Virginia 23261-4528:

1. Bank of America Corporation, 
Charlotte, North Carolina; to merge with 
FleetBoston Financial Corporation, 
Boston, Massachusetts, and thereby 
indirectly acquire Fleet National Bank, 
Providence, Rhode Island, and Fleet 
Maine, National Association, South 
Portland, Maine.

B. Federal Reserve Bank of Dallas 
(W. Arthur Tribble, Vice President) 2200 
North Pearl Street, Dallas, Texas 75201-
2272:

1. DCB Financial Corp., Dallas, Texas, 
and DCB Delaware Financial Corp., 
Wilmington, Delaware; to become bank 
holding companies by acquiring 100 
percent of the voting shares of Dallas 
City Bank, Dallas, Texas.
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