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accordance with paragraphs (a)(1) 
through (a)(4) of this section. A 
payphone service provider may not 
unreasonably withhold its consent to an 
alternative compensation arrangement.
* * * * *

(3) When payphone compensation is 
tendered for a quarter, the chief 
financial officer of the Completing 
Carrier shall submit to each payphone 
service provider to which compensation 
is tendered a sworn statement that the 
payment amount for that quarter is 
accurate and is based on 100% of all 
completed calls that originated from 
that payphone service provider’s 
payphones. Instead of transmitting 
individualized statements to each 
payphone service provider, a 
Completing Carrier may provide a 
single, blanket sworn statement 
addressed to all payphone service 
providers to which compensation is 
tendered for that quarter and may notify 
the payphone service providers of the 
sworn statement through any electronic 
method, including transmitting the 
sworn statement with the § 64.1310(a)(4) 
quarterly report, or posting the sworn 
statement on the Completing Carrier or 
clearinghouse website. If a Completing 
Carrier chooses to post the sworn 
statement on its website, the Completing 
Carrier shall state in its § 64.1310(a)(4) 
quarterly report the web address of the 
sworn statement. 

(4) * * *
(i) A list of the toll-free and access 

numbers dialed and completed by the 
Completing Carrier from each of that 
payphone service provider’s payphones 
and the ANI for each payphone;
* * * * *

(g) Each Completing Carrier and each 
Intermediate Carrier must maintain 
verification data to support the quarterly 
reports submitted pursuant to 
paragraphs (a)(4) and (c) of this section 
for 27 months after the close of that 
quarter. This data must include the time 
and date that each call identified in 
paragraphs (a)(4) and (c) of this section 
was made. This data must be provided 
to the payphone service provider upon 
request.
� 3. Section 64.1320 is amended by 
revising paragraphs (a), (b), and (e) to 
read as follows:

§ 64.1320 Payphone call tracking system 
audits. 

(a) Unless it has entered into an 
alternative compensation arrangement 
pursuant to § 64.1310(a) that relieves it 
of its § 64.1310(a)(1) tracking system 
obligation, each Completing Carrier 
must undergo an audit of its 
§ 64.1310(a)(1) tracking system by an 

independent third party auditor whose 
responsibility shall be, using audit 
methods approved by the American 
Institute for Certified Public 
Accountants, to determine whether the 
call tracking system accurately tracks 
payphone calls to completion. 

(b) By the effective date of these rules, 
each Completing Carrier in paragraph 
(a) of this section must file an audit 
report from the auditor (the ‘‘System 
Audit Report’’) regarding the 
Completing Carrier’s compliance with 
§ 64.1310(a)(1) as of the date of the 
audit: 

(1) With the Commission’s Secretary 
in CC Docket No. 96–128; 

(2) With each payphone service 
provider for which it completes calls 
and a Completing Carrier may comply 
with this paragraph’s requirement to file 
copies of the System Audit Report with 
each payphone service provider by 
posting the System Audit Report on its 
website or a clearinghouse website; and 

(3) With each facilities-based long 
distance carrier from which it receives 
payphone calls.
* * * * *

(e) At the time of filing of a System 
Audit Report with the Commission, the 
Completing Carrier shall file with the 
Commission’s Secretary, the payphone 
service providers and the facilities-
based long distance carriers identified 
in paragraph (b) of this section, a 
statement that includes the name of the 
Completing Carrier, and the name, 
address and phone number for the 
person or persons responsible for 
handling the Completing Carrier’s 
payphone compensation and for 
resolving disputes with payphone 
service providers over compensation, 
and this statement shall be updated 
within 60 days of any changes of such 
persons. If a Completing Carrier chooses 
to notify payphone service providers of 
this statement and its System Audit 
Report by posting these two documents 
on its website or a clearinghouse 
website, then this statement shall 
include the web address for these two 
documents.
* * * * *
[FR Doc. 05–173 Filed 1–4–05; 8:45 am] 
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SUMMARY: At the request of Joint 
Petitioner Waccamaw Neck 
Broadcasting Company, licensee of 
Station WPDT(FM), Channel 286A, 
Johnsonville, South Carolina this 
document dismisses the Joint Petition 
for Reconsideration of the Report and 
Order, 66 FR 18088 (October 24, 2001), 
in this proceeding, filed by Atlantic 
Broadcasting Co., Inc., permittee of 
Station WSIM(FM), Channel 287C3, Fair 
Bluff, North Carolina, and Waccamaw 
Neck Broadcasting Company.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Victoria M. McCauley, Media Bureau 
(202) 418–2180.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This is a 
synopsis of the Commission’s 
Memorandum Opinion and Order, MM 
Docket No. 00–226, adopted December 
15, 2004, and released December 17, 
2004. The full text of this Commission 
decision is available for inspection and 
copying during normal business hours 
in the FCC’s Reference Information 
Center at Portals II, 445 12th Street, 
SW., Room CY–A257, Washington, DC 
20554. The document may also be 
purchased from the Commission’s 
duplicating contractor, Best Copy and 
Printing, Inc., Portals II, 445 12th Street, 
SW., Room CY–B402, Washington, DC 
20554, telephone 1–800–378–3160 or 
http://www.BCPIWEB.com. Document is 
not subject to the Congressional Review 
Act. The Commission, is, therefore, not 
required to submit a copy of this Report 
and Order to GAO, pursuant to the 
Congressional Review Act, see 5 U.S.C. 
801(a)(1)(A) because the proposed rule 
was dismissed, herein.

Federal Communications Commission. 

John A. Karousos, 
Assistant Chief, Audio Division, Media 
Bureau.
[FR Doc. 05–116 Filed 1–4–05; 8:45 am] 
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