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hearing on objections and challenges 
shall continue from day to day until 
completed unless the Regional Director 
concludes that extraordinary 
circumstances warrant otherwise. Any 
hearing pursuant to this section shall be 
conducted in accordance with the 
provisions of §§ 102.64, 102.65, and 
102.66, insofar as applicable. Any party 
shall have the right to appear at the 
hearing in person, by counsel, or by 
other representative, to call, examine, 
and cross-examine witnesses, and to 
introduce into the record evidence of 
the significant facts that support the 
party’s contentions and are relevant to 
the objections and determinative 
challenges that are the subject of the 
hearing. The Hearing Officer may rule 
on offers of proof. Post-hearing briefs 
shall be filed only upon special 
permission of the Hearing Officer and 
within the time and addressing the 
subjects permitted by the Hearing 
Officer. Upon the close of such hearing, 
the Hearing Officer shall prepare and 
cause to be served on the parties a 
report resolving questions of credibility 
and containing findings of fact and 
recommendations as to the disposition 
of the issues. Any party may, within 10 
business days from the date of issuance 
of such report, file with the Regional 
Director an original and one copy of 
exceptions to such report, with 
supporting brief if desired. A copy of 
such exceptions, together with a copy of 
any brief filed, shall immediately be 
served on the other parties and a 
statement of service filed with the 
Regional Director. Within 5 business 
days from the last date on which 
exceptions and any supporting brief 
may be filed, or such further time as the 
Regional Director may allow, a party 
opposing the exceptions may file an 
answering brief with the Regional 
Director. An original and one copy shall 
be submitted. A copy of such answering 
brief shall immediately be served on the 
other parties and a statement of service 
filed with the Regional Director. Extra 
copies of electronically-filed papers 
need not be filed. The Regional Director 
shall thereupon decide the matter upon 
the record or make other disposition of 
the case. If no exceptions are filed to 
such report, the Regional Director, upon 
the expiration of the period for filing 
such exceptions, may decide the matter 
forthwith upon the record or may make 
other disposition of the case. 
* * * * * 

Dated: August 18, 2023. 
Roxanne L. Rothschild, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–18129 Filed 8–24–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7545–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE TREASURY 

31 CFR Part 515 

Cuban Assets Control Regulations 

CFR Correction 

This rule is being published by the 
Office of the Federal Register to correct 
an editorial or technical error that 
appeared in the most recent annual 
revision of the Code of Federal 
Regulations. 
■ In Title 31 of the Code of Federal 
Regulations, Part 500 to End, revised as 
of July 1, 2022, in section 515.570, in 
paragraph (d), remove ‘‘§ 515.565(d)’’ in 
both places where it appears and add in 
its place ‘‘§ 515.565(f)’’. 
[FR Doc. 2023–18455 Filed 8–24–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 0099–10–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Coast Guard 

33 CFR Part 100 

[Docket No. USCG–2023–0682] 

Special Local Regulation; Olympia 
Harbor Days Tug Boat Races, Budd 
Inlet, WA 

AGENCY: Coast Guard, Department of 
Homeland Security (DHS). 
ACTION: Notification of enforcement of 
regulation. 

SUMMARY: The Coast Guard will enforce 
special local regulations for the Olympia 
Harbor Days Tug Boat Races, Budd Inlet, 
WA, from 11 a.m. until 4 p.m. on 
September 2, 2023. This action is 
necessary to prevent injury and to 
protect life and property of the maritime 
public from the hazards associated with 
the tug boat races. During the 
enforcement periods, the operator of any 
vessel in the regulated area must 
comply with directions from the Patrol 
Commander or any Official Patrol 
displaying a Coast Guard ensign. 
DATES: The regulations in 33 CFR 
100.1309 will be enforced from 11 a.m. 
until 4 p.m. on September 2, 2023. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have questions about this 
notification of enforcement, call or 
email Lieutenant Peter McAndrew, 
Sector Puget Sound Waterways 
Management Division, U.S. Coast 
Guard; telephone 206–217–6045, email 
SectorPugetSoundWWM@uscg.mil. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The Coast 
Guard will enforce special local 
regulations in 33 CFR 100.1309 for the 

Olympia Harbor Days Tug Boat Races, 
Budd Inlet, WA, regulated area from 11 
a.m. until 4 p.m. on September 2, 2023. 
This action is being taken to provide for 
the safety of life on navigable waterways 
during this event. District Thirteen 
regulation 33 CFR 100.1309(a) specifies 
the location of the regulated area which 
encompasses approximately 2 nautical 
miles of the navigable waters in Budd 
Inlet. During the enforcement periods, if 
you are the operator of a vessel in the 
regulated area you must comply with 
directions from the Patrol Commander 
or any Official Patrol displaying a Coast 
Guard ensign. All persons or vessels 
who desire to enter the race area while 
it is enforced must obtain permission 
from the on-scene patrol craft on VHF– 
FM channel 16. 

In addition to this notification of 
enforcement in the Federal Register, the 
Coast Guard will provide notification of 
this enforcement period via the Local 
Notice to Mariners. If the Captain of the 
Port determines that the regulated area 
need not be enforced for the full 
duration stated in this notification, he 
may use a Broadcast Notice to Mariners 
to grant general permission to enter the 
regulated area. 

Dated: August 21, 2023. 
Y Moon, 
Captain, U.S. Coast Guard, Acting Captain 
of the Port, Sector Puget Sound. 
[FR Doc. 2023–18327 Filed 8–24–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9110–04–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Coast Guard 

33 CFR Part 117 

[Docket No. USCG–2022–0891] 

RIN 1625–AA09 

Drawbridge Operation Regulation; Mill 
Neck Creek, Bayville, NY 

AGENCY: Coast Guard, Department of 
Homeland Security (DHS). 
ACTION: Temporary interim rule and 
request for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Coast Guard is 
temporarily modifying the operating 
schedule that governs the Bayville 
Highway Bridge across the Mill Neck 
Creek, mile 0.1, at Bayville, NY. This 
action is necessary to allow the bridge 
owner to complete the remaining 
replacements and repairs. 
DATES: This temporary interim rule is 
effective from August 25, 2023, through 
January 31, 2024. 
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