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1. LG&E Energy LLC, Louisville Gas 
and Electric Company, et al. 

[Docket Nos. EC06–4–001 and ER06–20–001] 

Take notice that on January 10, 2006, 
LG&E Energy LLC, together with and on 
behalf of its public utility operating 
company subsidiaries Louisville Gas 
and Electric Company (collectively, 
Applicants), filed amendments to its 
application with the Commission 
seeking acceptance of certain rates, 
terms, and conditions necessary for 
them to: (1) Withdraw from the Midwest 
Independent Transmission System 
Operator, Inc., and regain operational 
control of their respective transmission 
system, (2) install a third party to act as 
reliability coordinator for their 
transmission facilities; and (3) install an 
independent third party to act as tariff 
administrator for their transmission 
system. Applicants state the 
amendments include finalized versions 
of their Independent Transmission 
System Organization and Reliability 
Coordinator Agreements, as well as a 
final version of Applicants’ Withdrawal 
Agreement with the Midwest ISO. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on January 25, 2006. 

2. Duke Energy Marketing America, 
LLC, DTE Energy Trading, Inc. 

[Docket No. EC06–62–000] 

Take notice that on January 11, 2006, 
Duke Energy Marketing America, LLC 
(DEMA) and DTE Energy Trading, Inc. 
(DTE Energy) (collectively, Applicants) 
submitted an application pursuant to 
section 203 of the Federal Power Act for 
authorization of a disposition of 
jurisdictional facilities in which DEMA 
proposes to transfer to DTE Energy three 
wholesale electric power sales contracts. 
Applicants have requested privileged 
treatment for commercially-sensitive 
information contained in the 
Application. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on February 2, 2006. 

3. Duke Energy Trading and Marketing, 
L.L.C. 

[Docket No. EC06–63–000] 

Take notice that on January 12, 2006, 
Duke Energy Trading and Marketing, 
L.L.C. (DETM) submitted an application 
pursuant to section 203 of the Federal 
Power Act for authorization of a 
disposition of jurisdictional facilities in 
which DETM proposes to transfer to 
Morgan Stanley Capital Group Inc. two 
wholesale electric power sales contracts. 
DETM has requested privileged 
treatment for commercially-sensitive 
information contained in the 
Application. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on February 3, 2006. 

4. City of Azusa, California 

[Docket No. EL06–23–000] 

Take notice that on January 3, 2006, 
the City of Azusa, California submitted 
correction to its December 2, 2005 filing 
of third annual revision to its 
Transmission Revenue Balancing 
Account Adjustment. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on January 27, 2006. 

Standard Paragraph 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. On or before the 
comment date, it is not necessary to 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E6–692 Filed 1–20–06; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–ORD–2006–0031; FRL–8023–6] 

Board of Scientific Counselors, 
Executive Committee Meeting— 
February 2006 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Pursuant to the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act, Public Law 
92–463, the Environmental Protection 
Agency, Office of Research and 
Development (ORD), gives notice of one 
meeting of the Board of Scientific 
Counselors (BOSC) Executive 
Committee. 

DATES: The meeting will be held on 
Monday, February 13, 2006 from 8:30 
a.m. to 5:30 p.m. The meeting will 
continue on Tuesday, February 14, 2006 
from 8:30 a.m. to 1 p.m. All times noted 
are eastern time. The meeting may 
adjourn early if all business is finished. 
Requests for the draft agenda or for 
making oral presentations at the meeting 
will be accepted up to 1 business day 
before the meeting. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held at 
the Grand Hyatt Washington hotel, 1000 
H Street, NW., Washington, DC 20001. 
Submit your comments, identified by 
Docket ID No. EPA–HQ–ORD–2006– 
0031, by one of the following methods: 

• http://www.regulations.gov: Follow 
the on-line instructions for submitting 
comments. 

• E-mail: Send comments by 
electronic mail (e-mail) to: 
ORD.Docket@epa.gov, Attention Docket 
ID No. EPA–HQ–ORD–2006–0031. 

• Fax: Fax comments to: (202) 566– 
0224, Attention Docket ID No. EPA– 
HQ–ORD–2006–0031. 

• Mail: Send comments by mail to: 
Board of Scientific Counselors, 
Executive Committee Meeting— 
February 2006 Docket, Mailcode: 
28221T, 1200 Pennsylvania Ave., NW., 
Washington, DC, 20460, Attention 
Docket ID No. EPA–HQ–ORD–2006– 
0031. 

• Hand Delivery or Courier. Deliver 
comments to: EPA Docket Center (EPA/ 
DC), Room B102, EPA West Building, 
1301 Constitution Avenue, NW., 
Washington, DC, Attention Docket ID 
No. EPA–HQ–ORD–2006–0031. 

Note: This is not a mailing address. Such 
deliveries are only accepted during the 
docket’s normal hours of operation, and 
special arrangements should be made for 
deliveries of boxed information. 

Instructions: Direct your comments to 
Docket ID No. EPA–HQ–ORD–2006– 
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0031. EPA’s policy is that all comments 
received will be included in the public 
docket without change and may be 
made available online at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, including any 
personal information provided, unless 
the comment includes information 
claimed to be Confidential Business 
Information (CBI) or other information 
whose disclosure is restricted by statute. 
Do not submit information that you 
consider to be CBI or otherwise 
protected through www.regulations.gov 
or e-mail. The http:// 
www.regulations.gov Web site is an 
‘‘anonymous access’’ system, which 
means EPA will not know your identity 
or contact information unless you 
provide it in the body of your comment. 
If you send an e-mail comment directly 
to EPA without going through http:// 
www.regulations.gov, your e-mail 
address will be automatically captured 
and included as part of the comment 
that is placed in the public docket and 
made available on the Internet. If you 
submit an electronic comment, EPA 
recommends that you include your 
name and other contact information in 
the body of your comment and with any 
disk or CD–ROM you submit. If EPA 
cannot read your comment due to 
technical difficulties and cannot contact 
you for clarification, EPA may not be 
able to consider your comment. 
Electronic files should avoid the use of 
special characters, any form of 
encryption, and be free of any defects or 
viruses. For additional information 
about EPA’s public docket visit the EPA 
Docket Center homepage at http:// 
www.epa.gov/epahome/dockets.htm. 

Docket: All documents in the docket 
are listed in the http:// 
www.regulations.gov index. Although 
listed in the index, some information is 
not publicly available, e.g., CBI or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Certain other 
material, such as copyrighted material, 
will be publicly available only in hard 
copy. Publicly available docket 
materials are available either 
electronically in http:// 
www.regulations.gov or in hard copy at 
the Board of Scientific Counselors, 
Executive Committee—February 2006 
Docket, EPA/DC, EPA West, Room 
B102, 1301 Constitution Ave., NW., 
Washington, DC. The Public Reading 
Room is open from 8:30 a.m. to 4:30 
p.m., Monday through Friday, excluding 
legal holidays. The telephone number 
for the Public Reading Room is (202) 
566–1744, and the telephone number for 
the ORD Docket is (202) 566–1752. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: The 
Designated Federal Officer via mail at: 

Lorelei Kowalski, Mail Code 8104–R, 
Office of Science Policy, Office of 
Research and Development, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Avenue, NW., 
Washington, DC 20460; via phone/voice 
mail at: (202) 564–3408; via fax at: (202) 
565–2911; or via e-mail at: 
kowalski.lorelei@epa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

General Information 

Any member of the public interested 
in receiving a draft BOSC agenda or 
making a presentation at the meeting 
may contact Lorelei Kowalski, the 
Designated Federal Officer, via any of 
the contact methods listed in the FOR 
FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT section 
above. In general, each individual 
making an oral presentation will be 
limited to a total of three minutes. 

Proposed agenda items for the 
meeting include, but are not limited to: 
discussion of draft reports from the 
Global Change and Land 
Subcommittees, and draft letter report 
from the Management Multi-Year Plan 
Workgroup; update on subcommittees 
for the Water Quality, Science to 
Achieve Results (STAR)/Greater 
Research Opportunities (GRO) 
Fellowship, and Technology for 
Sustainability program reviews; update 
on the Computational Toxicology 
Subcommittee; update on the BOSC risk 
assessment workshop held in February 
2005; briefing on ORD’s technology for 
sustainability research program; 
presentation of ORD responses to four 
recent BOSC reports; update on EPA’s 
Science Advisory Board activities; 
discussion of emerging science issues; 
and future issues and plans. The 
meeting is open to the public. 

Information on Services for 
Individuals with Disabilities: For 
information on access or services for 
individuals with disabilities, please 
contact Lorelei Kowalski at (202) 564– 
3408 or kowalski.lorelei@epa.gov. To 
request accommodation of a disability, 
please contact Lorelei Kowalski, 
preferably at least 10 days prior to the 
meeting, to give EPA as much time as 
possible to process your request. 

Dated: January 13, 2006. 

Mary Ellen Radzikowski, 
Acting Director, Office of Science Policy. 
[FR Doc. E6–726 Filed 1–20–06; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPP–2005–0302; FRL–7751–9] 

Notice of Filing of a Pesticide Petition 
for the Establishment of Regulations 
for the Residues of the Insecticide 
Metaflumizone in or on Food and Feed 
Commodities 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces the 
initial filing of a pesticide petition 
proposing the establishment of 
regulations for residues of the 
insecticide metaflumizone (mixture 
comprising 4-(2E)-2-([4- 
(trifluoromethoxy)anilino] 
carbonylhydrazono)-2-[3- 
(trifluoromethyl)phenyl] 
ethylbenzonitrile and 4-(2Z)-2-([4- 
(trifluoromethoxy)anilino] carbonyl 
hydrazono)-2-[3-(trifluoromethyl) 
phenyl] ethylbenzonitrile) in or on 
cotton (seed and gin trash), cattle and 
hen (fat and meat), liver and kidney 
(meat byproducts), milk and egg. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or beforeFebruary 22, 2006. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPP–2005–0302 and 
pesticide petition (PP) number PP 
5F6944, by one of the following 
methods: 

• http://www.regulations.gov/. Follow 
the on-line instructions for submitting 
comments. 

• E-mail: opp.docket@epa.gov. 
• Mail: Public Information and 

Records Integrity Branch (PIRIB) 
(7502C), Office of Pesticide Programs 
(OPP), Environmental Protection 
Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania Ave., NW., 
Washington, DC 20460–0001. 

• Hand Delivery: Public Information 
and Records Integrity Branch (PIRIB) 
(7502C), Office of Pesticide Programs 
(OPP), Environmental Protection 
Agency, Rm. 119, Crystal Mall #2, 1801 
S. Bell St., Arlington, VA, Attention: 
Docket ID number EPA–HQ–OPP–2005– 
0302. The docket facility is open from 
8:30 a.m. to 4 p.m., Monday through 
Friday, excluding legal holidays. The 
telephone number for the docket facility 
is (703) 305–5805. Such deliveries are 
only accepted during the Docket’s 
normal hours of operation, and special 
arrangements should be made for 
deliveries of boxed information. 

Instructions: Direct your comments to 
docket ID number EPA–HQ–OPP–2005– 
0302. EPA’s policy is that all comments 
received will be included in the public 
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