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1 See Docket No. RM2018–3, Order Adopting 
Final Rules Relating to Non-Public Information, 
June 27, 2018, Attachment A at 19–22 (Order No. 
4679). 

products, and for which financial 
models, minimum rates, and 
classification criteria have undergone 
advance Commission review. See 39 
CFR 3041.110(n); 39 CFR 3041.205(a). 
Such requests are reviewed in summary 
proceedings pursuant to 39 CFR 
3041.325(c)(2) and 39 CFR 
3041.505(f)(1). Pursuant to 39 CFR 
3041.405(c)–(d), the Commission does 
not appoint a Public Representative or 
request public comment in proceedings 
to review such requests. 

II. Public Proceeding(s) 
1. Docket No(s).: CP2024–680; Filing 

Title: USPS Request Concerning 
Amendment One to Priority Mail 
Express, Priority Mail & USPS Ground 
Advantage Contract 332, with Materials 
Filed Under Seal; Filing Acceptance 
Date: July 7 2025; Filing Authority: 39 
CFR 3035.105 and 39 CFR 3041.505; 
Public Representative: Cherry Yao; 
Comments Due: July 15, 2025. 

2. Docket No(s).: K2025–442; Filing 
Title: USPS Request Concerning 
Amendment One to Priority Mail 
Express, Priority Mail & USPS Ground 
Advantage Contract 755, with Materials 
Filed Under Seal; Filing Acceptance 
Date: July 7, 2025; Filing Authority: 39 
CFR 3035.105 and 39 CFR 3041.505; 
Public Representative: Elsie Lee- 
Robbins; Comments Due: July 15, 2025. 

3. Docket No(s).: MC2025–1560 and 
K2025–1554; Filing Title: USPS Request 
to Add Priority Mail & USPS Ground 
Advantage Contract 799 to the 
Competitive Product List and Notice of 
Filing Materials Under Seal; Filing 
Acceptance Date: July 7, 2025; Filing 
Authority: 39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR 
3035.105, and 39 CFR 3041.310; Public 
Representative: Evan Wise; Comments 
Due: July 15, 2025. 

III. Summary Proceeding(s) 
None. See Section II for public 

proceedings. 
This Notice will be published in the 

Federal Register. 

Erica A. Barker, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–12914 Filed 7–10–25; 8:45 am] 
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New Postal Products 

AGENCY: Postal Regulatory Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Commission is noticing a 
recent Postal Service filing for the 
Commission’s consideration concerning 
a negotiated service agreement. This 
notice informs the public of the filing, 
invites public comment, and takes other 
administrative steps. 
DATES: Comments are due: July 16, 
2025. 
ADDRESSES: Submit comments 
electronically via the Commission’s 
Filing Online system at https://
www.prc.gov. Those who cannot submit 
comments electronically should contact 
the person identified in the FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT section by 
telephone for advice on filing 
alternatives. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
David A. Trissell, General Counsel, at 
202–789–6820. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
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I. Introduction 
Pursuant to 39 CFR 3041.405, the 

Commission gives notice that the Postal 
Service filed request(s) for the 
Commission to consider matters related 
to Competitive negotiated service 
agreement(s). The request(s) may 
propose the addition of a negotiated 
service agreement from the Competitive 
product list or the modification of an 
existing product currently appearing on 
the Competitive product list. 

The public portions of the Postal 
Service’s request(s) can be accessed via 
the Commission’s website (http://
www.prc.gov). Non-public portions of 
the Postal Service’s request(s), if any, 
can be accessed through compliance 
with the requirements of 39 CFR 
3011.301.1 

Section II identifies the docket 
number(s) associated with each Postal 
Service request, if any, that will be 
reviewed in a public proceeding as 
defined by 39 CFR 3010.101(p), the title 
of each such request, the request’s 
acceptance date, and the authority cited 
by the Postal Service for each request. 
For each such request, the Commission 
appoints an officer of the Commission to 
represent the interests of the general 
public in the proceeding, pursuant to 39 
U.S.C. 505 and 39 CFR 3000.114 (Public 
Representative). The Public 
Representative does not represent any 
individual person, entity or particular 

point of view, and, when Commission 
attorneys are appointed, no attorney- 
client relationship is established. 
Section II also establishes comment 
deadline(s) pertaining to each such 
request. 

The Commission invites comments on 
whether the Postal Service’s request(s) 
identified in Section II, if any, are 
consistent with the policies of title 39. 
Applicable statutory and regulatory 
requirements include 39 U.S.C. 3632, 39 
U.S.C. 3633, 39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR 
part 3035, and 39 CFR part 3041. 
Comment deadline(s) for each such 
request, if any, appear in Section II. 

Section III identifies the docket 
number(s) associated with each Postal 
Service request, if any, to add a 
standardized distinct product to the 
Competitive product list or to amend a 
standardized distinct product, the title 
of each such request, the request’s 
acceptance date, and the authority cited 
by the Postal Service for each request. 
Standardized distinct products are 
negotiated service agreements that are 
variations of one or more Competitive 
products, and for which financial 
models, minimum rates, and 
classification criteria have undergone 
advance Commission review. See 39 
CFR 3041.110(n); 39 CFR 3041.205(a). 
Such requests are reviewed in summary 
proceedings pursuant to 39 CFR 
3041.325(c)(2) and 39 CFR 
3041.505(f)(1). Pursuant to 39 CFR 
3041.405(c)–(d), the Commission does 
not appoint a Public Representative or 
request public comment in proceedings 
to review such requests. 

II. Public Proceeding(s) 
1. Docket No(s).: CP2024–702; Filing 

Title: USPS Request Concerning 
Amendment One to Priority Mail 
Express, Priority Mail & USPS Ground 
Advantage Contract 347, with Materials 
Filed Under Seal; Filing Acceptance 
Date: July 8, 2025; Filing Authority: 39 
CFR 3035.105 and 39 CFR 3041.505; 
Public Representative: Maxine Bradley; 
Comments Due: July 16, 2025. 

2. Docket No(s).: K2025–14; Filing 
Title: USPS Request Concerning 
Amendment One to Priority Mail 
Express, Priority Mail & USPS Ground 
Advantage Contract 429, with Materials 
Filed Under Seal; Filing Acceptance 
Date: July 8, 2025; Filing Authority: 39 
CFR 3035.105 and 39 CFR 3041.505; 
Public Representative: Gregory Stanton; 
Comments Due: July 16, 2025. 

3. Docket No(s).: K2025–49; Filing 
Title: USPS Request Concerning 
Amendment One to Priority Mail 
Express, Priority Mail & USPS Ground 
Advantage Contract 452, with Materials 
Filed Under Seal; Filing Acceptance 
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Date: July 8, 2025; Filing Authority: 39 
CFR 3035.105 and 39 CFR 3041.505; 
Public Representative: Christopher 
Mohr; Comments Due: July 16, 2025. 

4. Docket No(s).: MC2025–1561 and 
K2025–1555; Filing Title: USPS Request 
to Add Priority Mail & USPS Ground 
Advantage Contract 1386 to the 
Competitive Product List and Notice of 
Filing Materials Under Seal; Filing 
Acceptance Date: July 8, 2025; Filing 
Authority: 39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR 
3035.105, and 39 CFR 3041.310; Public 
Representative: Maxine Bradley; 
Comments Due: July 16, 2025. 

5. Docket No(s).: MC2025–1562 and 
K2025–1556; Filing Title: USPS Request 
to Add Priority Mail & USPS Ground 
Advantage Contract 1387 to the 
Competitive Product List and Notice of 
Filing Materials Under Seal; Filing 
Acceptance Date: July 8, 2025; Filing 
Authority: 39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR 
3035.105, and 39 CFR 3041.310; Public 
Representative: Kenneth Moeller; 
Comments Due: July 16, 2025. 

6. Docket No(s).: MC2025–1563 and 
K2025–1557; Filing Title: USPS Request 
to Add Priority Mail Contract 903 to the 
Competitive Product List and Notice of 
Filing Materials Under Seal; Filing 
Acceptance Date: July 8, 2025; Filing 
Authority: 39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR 
3035.105, and 39 CFR 3041.310; Public 
Representative: Kenneth Moeller; 
Comments Due: July 16, 2025. 

III. Summary Proceeding(s) 
None. See Section II for public 

proceedings. 
This Notice will be published in the 

Federal Register. 

Erica A. Barker, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–13035 Filed 7–10–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7710–FW–P 

POSTAL SERVICE 

Sunshine Act Meetings 

TIME AND DATE: Tuesday July 8, 2025, at 
11:30 a.m. EST. 

PLACE: Washington, DC, at U.S. Postal 
Service Headquarters, 475 L’Enfant 
Plaza SW. 
STATUS: Closed. 
MATTERS TO BE CONSIDERED: On July 8, 
2025, the members of the Board of 
Governors of the United States Postal 
Service voted unanimously to hold and 
to close to public observation a special 
meeting in Washington, DC. The Board 
determined that no earlier public notice 
was practicable. The Board considered 
the below matters. 

1. Administrative Matters. 
2. Executive Session. 
General Counsel Certification: The 

General Counsel of the United States 
Postal Service has certified that the 
meeting may be closed under the 
Government in the Sunshine Act, 5 
U.S.C. 552b. 
CONTACT PERSON FOR MORE INFORMATION: 
Lucy C. Trout, Acting Secretary of the 
Board of Governors, U.S. Postal Service, 
475 L’Enfant Plaza SW, Washington, DC 
20260–1000. Telephone: (202) 268– 
4800. 

Lucy C. Trout, 
Acting Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–12980 Filed 7–9–25; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 7710–12–P 

RAILROAD RETIREMENT BOARD 

Proposed Collection; Comment 
Request 

Summary: In accordance with the 
requirement of Section 3506 (c)(2)(A) of 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
which provides opportunity for public 
comment on new or revised data 
collections, the Railroad Retirement 
Board (RRB) will publish periodic 
summaries of proposed data collections. 

Comments are invited on: (a) Whether 
the proposed information collection is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the agency, including 
whether the information has practical 
utility; (b) the accuracy of the RRB’s 
estimate of the burden of the collection 

of the information; (c) ways to enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (d) 
ways to minimize the burden related to 
the collection of information on 
respondents, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

1. Title and purpose of information 
collection: Employee Representative’s 
Status and Compensation Reports; OMB 
3220–0014. 

Under Section 1(b)(1) of the Railroad 
Retirement Act (RRA) (45 U.S.C. 231b), 
the term ‘‘employee’’ includes an 
individual who is an employee 
representative. As defined in Section 
1(c) of the RRA, an employee 
representative is an officer or official 
representative of a railway labor 
organization other than a labor 
organization included in the term 
‘‘employer,’’ as defined in the RRA, who 
before or after August 29, 1935, was in 
the service of an employer under the 
RRA and who is duly authorized and 
designated to represent employees in 
accordance with the Railway Labor Act, 
or, any individual who is regularly 
assigned to or regularly employed by 
such officer or official representative in 
connection with the duties of his or her 
office. The requirements relating to the 
application for employee representative 
status and the periodic reporting of the 
compensation resulting from such status 
is contained in 20 CFR 209.10. 

The RRB utilizes Form DC–2, 
Employee Representative’s Report of 
Compensation, to obtain the 
information needed to determine 
employee representative status and to 
maintain a record of creditable service 
and compensation resulting from such 
status. Completion is required to obtain 
or retain a benefit. One response is 
requested of each respondent. The RRB 
proposes a minor change to address in 
Paperwork Reduction Act Notice section 
to Form DC–2. 

ESTIMATE OF ANNUAL RESPONDENT BURDEN 

Form No. Annual responses Time 
(minutes) 

Burden 
(hours) 

DC–2 .......................................................................................................................... 82 30 41 

Total .................................................................................................................... 82 .............................. 41 

2. Title and purpose of information 
collection: Nonresident Questionnaire; 
OMB 3220–0145. 

Under Public Laws 98–21 (42 U.S.C. 
410) and 98–76 (45 U.S.C. 231t), 
benefits under the Railroad Retirement 
Act payable to annuitants living outside 

the United States may be subject to 
taxation under United States income tax 
laws. Whether the social security 
equivalent and non-social security 
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