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boundary changes and CDP updates on 
a transaction basis as they occur over 
the years. 

For the Census Bureau to complete 
this project, we would collect spatial 
data from tribal, state, and general- 
purpose local governments to improve 
the quality of the MAF/TIGER System 
outside the realm of BAS. The only 
burden on governments for the 
boundary quality project is in providing 
their spatial data. 

Feedback 

The Census Bureau is adding a 
feedback component to its geographic 
partnership programs to allow for the 
solicitation of feedback to improve the 
administration of the respective 
program and potentially reduce the 
future burden. Eligible governments 
may be asked to provide their feedback 
on materials, method(s) of data 
collection, manner of communications, 
and the usability of the program 
applications and tools. 

Affected Public: Tribal, state, and 
general-purpose local governments in 
all fifty states, the District of Columbia, 
the Commonwealth of Puerto Rico, 
American Samoa, Guam, the 
Commonwealth of the Northern Mariana 
Islands, and the U.S. Virgin Islands. 

Frequency: Annual. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Voluntary. 
Legal Authority: Title 13, U.S.C., 

Section 6. 
This information collection request 

may be viewed at www.reginfo.gov. 
Follow the instructions to view the 
Department of Commerce collections 
currently under review by OMB. 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be 
submitted within 30 days of the 
publication of this notice on the 
following website www.reginfo.gov/ 
public/do/PRAMain. Find this 
particular information collection by 
selecting ‘‘Currently under 30-day 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function and 
entering either the title of the collection 
or the OMB Control Number 0607–0151. 

Sheleen Dumas, 
Departmental PRA Clearance Officer, Office 
of the Under Secretary for Economic Affairs, 
Commerce Department. 
[FR Doc. 2024–22527 Filed 9–30–24; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Bureau of Industry and Security 

Regulations and Procedures Technical 
Advisory Committee; Notice of 
Partially Closed Meeting 

The Regulations and Procedures 
Technical Advisory Committee (RPTAC) 
will meet on October 15, 2024, 9 a.m.– 
4 p.m., Eastern Daylight Time, in the 
Herbert C. Hoover Building, Room 3884, 
1401 Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC (enter through Main 
Entrance on 14th Street between 
Constitution and Pennsylvania 
Avenues). The Committee advises and 
assists the Secretary of Commerce 
(Secretary) and other Federal officials 
and agencies with respect to actions 
designed to carry out the policy set forth 
in section 1752(1)(A) of the Export 
Control Reform Act. The purpose of the 
meeting is to have Committee members 
and U.S. Government representatives 
mutually review updated technical data 
and policy-driving information that has 
been gathered. 

Agenda 

Public Session 

1. Opening remarks by the Chairman 
2. Opening remarks by the Bureau of 

Industry and Security 
3. Presentations of Papers by the Public 
4. Regulations Update 
5. Automated Export System Update 
6. Working Group Reports 

Closed Session 

7. Discussion of matters determined to 
be exempt from the open meeting and 
public participation requirements found 
in sections 1009(a)(1) and 1009(a)(3) of 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA) (5 U.S.C. 1001–1014). The 
exemption is authorized by section 
1009(d) of the FACA, which permits the 
closure of advisory committee meetings, 
or portions thereof, if the head of the 
agency to which the advisory committee 
reports determines such meetings may 
be closed to the public in accordance 
with subsection (c) of the Government 
in the Sunshine Act (5 U.S.C. 552b(c)). 
In this case, the applicable provisions of 
5 U.S.C. 552b(c) are subsection 
552b(c)(4), which permits closure to 
protect trade secrets and commercial or 
financial information that is privileged 
or confidential, and subsection 
552b(c)(9)(B), which permits closure to 
protect information that would be likely 
to significantly frustrate implementation 
of a proposed agency action were it to 
be disclosed prematurely. The closed 
session of the meeting will involve 
committee discussions and guidance 

regarding U.S. Government strategies 
and policies. 

The open session will be accessible 
via teleconference. To join the 
conference, submit inquiries to Ms. 
Yvette Springer at Yvette.Springer@
bis.doc.gov (email) or (202) 482–2813 
(voice). 

A limited number of seats will be 
available for members of the public to 
attend the open session in person. 
Reservations are not accepted. 

Special Accommodations: Individuals 
requiring special accommodations to 
access the public meeting should 
contact Ms. Yvette Springer no later 
than Tuesday, October 8, 2024, so that 
appropriate arrangements can be made. 

To the extent that time permits, 
members of the public may present oral 
statements to the Committee. The public 
may submit written statements at any 
time before or after the meeting. 
However, to facilitate distribution of 
materials to the Committee members, 
the Committee suggests that members of 
the public forward their materials prior 
to the meeting to Ms. Springer via email. 
Material submitted by the public will be 
made public and therefore should not 
contain confidential information. 
Meeting materials from the public 
session will be accessible via the 
Technical Advisory Committee (TAC) 
site at https://tac.bis.gov, within 30-days 
after the meeting. 

The Deputy Assistant Secretary for 
Administration, performing the non- 
exclusive functions and duties of the 
Chief Financial Officer and Assistant 
Secretary for Administration, with the 
concurrence of the delegate of the 
General Counsel, formally determined 
on September 23, 2024, pursuant to 5 
U.S.C. 1009(d)), that the portion of the 
meeting dealing with pre-decisional 
changes to the Commerce Control List 
and the U.S. export control policies 
shall be exempt from the provisions 
relating to public meetings found in 5 
U.S.C. 1009(a)(1) and 1009(a)(3). The 
remaining portions of the meeting will 
be open to the public. 

Meeting cancellation: If the meeting is 
cancelled, a cancellation notice will be 
posted on the TAC website at https://
tac.bis.doc.gov. 

For more information, contact Ms. 
Springer. 

Yvette Springer, 
Committee Liaison Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2024–22465 Filed 9–30–24; 8:45 am] 
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