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DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request; Blasting 
Operations and the Use of Explosives 

ACTION: Notice of availability; request 
for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor 
(DOL) is submitting this Occupational 
Safety & Health Administration (OSHA)- 
sponsored information collection 
request (ICR) to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA). Public comments on the ICR are 
invited. 
DATES: The OMB will consider all 
written comments that the agency 
receives on or before February 24, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Nicole Bouchet by telephone at 202– 
693–0213, or by email at DOL_PRA_
PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section 29 
CFR part 1926, subpart U and its 
collections of information provide 
protection to employees who work with 
and around blasting operations. In 
addition, inventories of explosives must 
be maintained to assure employer and 
blaster accountability for explosives. For 
additional substantive information 
about this ICR, see the related notice 
published in the Federal Register on 
October 25, 2024 (89 FR 85242). 

Comments are invited on: (1) whether 
the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the Department, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; (2) the accuracy of 
the agency’s estimates of the burden and 
cost of the collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (3) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information collection; and 
(4) ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

This information collection is subject 
to the PRA. A Federal agency generally 

cannot conduct or sponsor a collection 
of information, and the public is 
generally not required to respond to an 
information collection, unless the OMB 
approves it and displays a currently 
valid OMB Control Number. In addition, 
notwithstanding any other provisions of 
law, no person shall generally be subject 
to penalty for failing to comply with a 
collection of information that does not 
display a valid OMB Control Number. 
See 5 CFR 1320.5(a) and 1320.6. 

DOL seeks PRA authorization for this 
information collection for three (3) 
years. OMB authorization for an ICR 
cannot be for more than three (3) years 
without renewal. The DOL notes that 
information collection requirements 
submitted to the OMB for existing ICRs 
receive a month-to-month extension 
while they undergo review. 

Agency: DOL–OSHA. 
Title of Collection: Blasting 

Operations and the Use of Explosives. 
OMB Control Number: 1218–0217. 
Affected Public: Private Sector— 

Businesses or other for-profits. 
Total Estimated Number of 

Respondents: 171. 
Total Estimated Number of 

Responses: 758. 
Total Estimated Annual Time Burden: 

1,426 hours. 
Total Estimated Annual Other Costs 

Burden: $0. 
(Authority: 44 U.S.C. 3507(a)(1)(D)) 

Nicole Bouchet, 
Senior Paperwork Reduction Act Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2025–01576 Filed 1–22–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–26–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request; Refuge 
Alternatives for Underground Coal 
Mines 

ACTION: Notice of availability; request 
for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor 
(DOL) is submitting this Mine Safety 
and Health Administration (MSHA)- 
sponsored information collection 
request (ICR) to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA). Public comments on the ICR are 
invited. 
DATES: The OMB will consider all 
written comments that the agency 
receives on or before February 24, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 

information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Michael Howell by telephone at 202– 
693–6782, or by email at DOL_PRA_
PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Each 
underground coal mine has an 
emergency response plan and refuge 
alternative(s) that protect miners when 
escape from a mine during a mine 
emergency is not possible by providing 
secure spaces with isolated atmospheres 
that create life-sustaining environments. 
This ICR covers the refuge alternatives 
portion of emergency response plans 
and records for examination, 
maintenance and repair of refuge 
alternatives and components. For 
additional substantive information 
about this ICR, see the related notice 
published in the Federal Register on 
October 4, 2024 (89 FR 80938). 

Comments are invited on: (1) whether 
the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the Department, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; (2) the accuracy of 
the agency’s estimates of the burden and 
cost of the collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (3) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information collection; and 
(4) ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

This information collection is subject 
to the PRA. A Federal agency generally 
cannot conduct or sponsor a collection 
of information, and the public is 
generally not required to respond to an 
information collection, unless the OMB 
approves it and displays a currently 
valid OMB Control Number. In addition, 
notwithstanding any other provisions of 
law, no person shall generally be subject 
to penalty for failing to comply with a 
collection of information that does not 
display a valid OMB Control Number. 
See 5 CFR 1320.5(a) and 1320.6. 

Agency: DOL–MSHA. 
Title of Collection: Refuge 

Alternatives for Underground Coal 
Mines. 

OMB Control Number: 1219–0146. 
Affected Public: Businesses or other 

for-profits. 
Number of Respondents: 21. 
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Frequency: On occasion. 
Number of Responses: 27. 
Annual Burden Hours: 73 hours. 
Total Estimated Annual Other Costs 

Burden: $17. 
(Authority: 44 U.S.C. 3507(a)(1)(D)) 

Michael Howell, 
Senior Paperwork Reduction Act Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2025–01524 Filed 1–22–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–43–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request; 
Independent Contractor Registration 
and Identification 

ACTION: Notice of availability; request 
for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor 
(DOL) is submitting this Mine Safety 
and Health Administration (MSHA)- 
sponsored information collection 
request (ICR) to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA). Public comments on the ICR are 
invited. 
DATES: The OMB will consider all 
written comments that the agency 
receives on or before February 24, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Michael Howell by telephone at 202– 
693–6782, or by email at DOL_PRA_
PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Title 30 
CFR part 45, Independent Contractors, 
sets forth information requirements and 
procedures for independent contractors 
to obtain a Mine Safety and Health 
Administration (MSHA) identification 
number and procedures for service of 
documents upon independent 
contractors. The information collections 
associated with this information 
collection support the appropriate 
assessment of fines for violations by 
independent contractors and the 
deterrent effect of MSHA enforcement 
actions on independent contractors. For 
additional substantive information 
about this ICR, see the related notice 

published in the Federal Register on 
October 4, 2024 (89 FR 80949). 

Comments are invited on: (1) whether 
the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the Department, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; (2) the accuracy of 
the agency’s estimates of the burden and 
cost of the collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (3) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information collection; and 
(4) ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

This information collection is subject 
to the PRA. A Federal agency generally 
cannot conduct or sponsor a collection 
of information, and the public is 
generally not required to respond to an 
information collection, unless the OMB 
approves it and displays a currently 
valid OMB Control Number. In addition, 
notwithstanding any other provisions of 
law, no person shall generally be subject 
to penalty for failing to comply with a 
collection of information that does not 
display a valid OMB Control Number. 
See 5 CFR 1320.5(a) and 1320.6. 

Agency: DOL–MSHA. 
Title of Collection: Independent 

Contractor Registration and 
Identification. 

OMB Control Number: 1219–0040. 
Affected Public: Businesses or other 

for-profits. 
Number of Respondents: 22,792. 
Frequency: On occasion. 
Number of Responses: 167,801. 
Annual Burden Hours: 18,220 hours. 
Total Estimated Annual Other Costs 

Burden: $989. 
(Authority: 44 U.S.C. 3507(a)(1)(D)) 

Michael Howell, 
Senior Paperwork Reduction Act Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2025–01522 Filed 1–22–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–43–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration 

[Docket No. OSHA–2006–0042] 

CSA Group Testing & Certification Inc.: 
Grant of Expansion of Recognition 

AGENCY: Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration (OSHA), Labor. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In this notice, OSHA 
announces the final decision to expand 

the scope of recognition for CSA Group 
& Testing Certification Inc., as a 
Nationally Recognized Testing 
Laboratory (NRTL). 
DATES: The expansion of the scope of 
recognition becomes effective on 
January 23, 2025. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Information regarding this notice is 
available from the following sources: 

Press inquiries: Contact Mr. Frank 
Meilinger, Director, OSHA Office of 
Communications, U.S. Department of 
Labor, telephone: (202) 693–1999; 
email: meilinger.francis2@dol.gov. 

General and technical information: 
Contact Mr. Kevin Robinson, Director, 
Office of Technical Programs and 
Coordination Activities, Directorate of 
Technical Support and Emergency 
Management, Occupational Safety and 
Health Administration, U.S. Department 
of Labor, phone: (202) 693–2300 or 
email: robinson.kevin@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Notice of Final Decision 

OSHA hereby gives notice of the 
expansion of the scope of recognition 
for CSA Group Testing & Certification 
Inc. (CSA), as a NRTL. CSA’s expansion 
covers the addition of one test standard 
to the NRTL scope of recognition. 

OSHA’s recognition of a NRTL 
signifies that the organization meets the 
requirements specified in 29 CFR 
1910.7. Recognition is an 
acknowledgment that the organization 
can perform independent safety testing 
and certification of the specific products 
covered within the scope of recognition. 
Each NRTL’s scope of recognition 
includes: (1) the type of products the 
NRTL may test, with each type specified 
by the applicable test standard; and (2) 
the recognized site(s) that has/have the 
technical capability to perform the 
product-testing and product- 
certification activities for test standards 
within the NRTL’s scope. Recognition is 
not a delegation or grant of government 
authority; however, recognition enables 
employers to use products approved by 
the NRTL to meet OSHA standards that 
require product testing and certification. 

The agency processes applications by 
a NRTL for initial recognition and for an 
expansion or renewal of this 
recognition, following requirements in 
Appendix A to 29 CFR 1910.7. This 
appendix requires that the agency 
publish two notices in the Federal 
Register in processing an application. In 
the first notice, OSHA announces the 
application and provides a preliminary 
finding. In the second notice, the agency 
provides a final decision on the 
application. These notices set forth the 
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