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*Commissioner John A. Moran is not
participating.

requirements and procedure for
obtaining a license, whether there are
any limitations on the type of license
your company may obtain, and the
Chinese government authority(ies) to
whom applications must be submitted
or from which approvals must be
sought.

Now Therefore, It is ordered, that this
Notice of Inquiry be published in the
Federal Register.

By the Commission.*
Bryant L. VanBrakle,
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 02–6305 Filed 3–14–02; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6730–01–P

FEDERAL MARITIME COMMISSION

[Docket No. 02–04]

Anchor Shipping Co. v. Alianca
Navegacao e Logistica LTDA.; Notice
of Filing of Complaint and Assignment

Notice is given that a complaint has
been filed with the Federal Maritime
Commission (‘‘Commission’’) by Anchor
Shipping Co. (‘‘Complainant’’) against
Alianca Navegacao E Logistica Ltda.
(‘‘Alianca’’).

Complainant contends that Alianca
engaged in a number of activities in
connection with a service contract
which violated sections 10(a)(2),
10(a)(3), 10(b)(3) and 10(c)(1) of the
Shipping Act of 1984 (‘‘Shipping Act’’)
and injured the Complainant.

Complainant asks that Alianca be
compelled to answer its charges and
that the Commission issue an order
commanding Alianca to cease and desist
from these violations; to establish and
put in force such practices the
Commission determines to be lawful
and reasonable; to pay Complainant
$1,000,000 in reparations, with interest
and attorney’s fees, or such other sum
as the Commission may determine to be
proper as an award of reparation; and
such other further order as the
Commission determines proper.
Complainant requests that hearing be
held in Miami, FL.

This proceeding has been assigned to
the office of Administrative Law Judges.
Hearing in this matter, if any is held,
shall commence within the time
limitations prescribed in 46 CFR 502.61,
and only after consideration has been
given by the parties and the presiding
officer to the use of alternative forms of
dispute resolution. The hearing shall
include oral testimony and cross-
examination in the discretion of the

presiding officer only upon proper
showing that there are genuine issues of
material fact that cannot be resolved on
the basis of sworn statements, affidavits,
depositions, or other documents or that
the nature of the matter in issue is such
that an oral hearing and cross-
examination are necessary for the
development of an adequate record.
Pursuant to the further terms of 46 CFR
502.61, the initial decision of the
presiding officer in this proceeding shall
be issued by March 13, 2003, and the
final decision of the Commission shall
be issued by July 11, 2003.

Bryant L. VanBrakle,
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 02–6218 Filed 3–14–02; 8:45 am]

BILLING CODE 6730–01–P

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM

Agency Information Collection
Activities: Announcement of Board
Approval under Delegated Authority
and Submission to OMB

AGENCY: Board of Governors of the
Federal Reserve System.
SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given of the
final approval of proposed information
collection(s) by the Board of Governors
of the Federal Reserve System (Board)
under OMB delegated authority, as per
5 CFR 1320.16 (OMB Regulations on
Controlling Paperwork Burdens on the
Public). Board –approved collections of
information are incorporated into the
official OMB inventory of currently
approved collections of information.
Copies of the OMB83–Is and supporting
statements and approved collection of
information instrument(s) are placed
into OMB’s public docket files. The
Federal Reserve may not conduct or
sponsor, and the respondent is not
required to respond to, an information
collection that has been extended,
revised, or implemented on or after
October 1, 1995, unless it displays a
currently valid OMB control number.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Federal Reserve Board Clearance
Officer–Mary M. West–Division of
Research and Statistics, Board of
Governors of the Federal Reserve
System, Washington, DC 20551 (202–
452–3829). OMB Desk Officer–
Alexander T. Hunt–Office of
Information and Regulatory Affairs,
Office of Management and Budget, New
Executive Office Building, Room 3208,
Washington, DC 20503 (202–395–7860)

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION:

Final approval under OMB delegated
authority of the implementation of the
following report:

1. Report title: Intermittent Survey of
Businesses
Agency form number: FR 1374
OMB control number: 7100–0302
Frequency: Biweekly and semiannually
Reporters: Purchasing managers,
economists, or other knowledgeable
individuals at business firms
Annual reporting hours: 125 hours
Estimated average hours per response:
15 minutes
Number of respondents: biweekly, 10;
semiannually, 120
Small businesses are affected.
General description of report: This
information collection is voluntary (12
U.S.C. §§ 225a, 263, and 15 U.S.C.
§1691b) and is given confidential
treatment (5 U.S.C. 552(b)(6)).
Abstract: The proposed survey would be
used by the Federal Reserve to gather
information that would be specifically
tailored to the Federal Reserve’s policy
and operational responsibilities. It is
necessary to conduct the survey
biweekly to keep up with the rapidly
changing developments in the economy
and to provide timely information to
staff and Board members. Usually, the
surveys would be conducted by staff
economists telephoning purchasing
managers, economists, or other
knowledgeable individuals at selected,
relevant businesses. The content of the
questions and the businesses contacted
would vary depending on changing
developments in the economy.

Final approval under OMB delegated
authority of the extension for three
years, with revision, of the following
reports:

1. Report title: Notification of Foreign
Branch Status
Agency form number: FR 2058
OMB control number: 7100–0069
Frequency: on occasion
Reporters: member banks, bank holding
companies, Edge and agreement
corporations
Annual reporting hours: 38 hours
Estimated average hours per response:
15 minutes
Number of respondents: 150
Small businesses are not affected.
General description of report: This
information collection is mandatory (12
U.S.C. 321, 601, 602, 615, and 1844(c))
and is not given confidential treatment.
Abstract: Member banks, bank holding
companies, and Edge and agreement
corporations are required to notify the
Federal Reserve System of the opening,
closing, or relocation of an foreign
branch. The notice requires information
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