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We will provide a paper copy of the 
consent decrees upon written request 
and payment of reproduction costs. 
Please mail your request and payment 
to: Consent Decree Library, U.S. DOJ— 
ENRD, P.O. Box 7611, Washington, DC 
20044–7611. 

Please enclose a check or money order 
for $16.50 for the Consent Decree (25 
cents per page reproduction cost) 
payable to the United States Treasury. 

Henry Friedman, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division. 
[FR Doc. 2017–19300 Filed 9–11–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Proposed Second 
Modification to Consent Decree Under 
The Clean Air Act 

On August 31, 2017, the Department 
of Justice lodged a proposed second 
modification to consent decree with the 
United States District Court for the 
Southern District of West Virginia in the 
lawsuit entitled United States v. Bayer 
CropScience LP, Civil Action No. 2:15– 
cv–13331. 

The United States filed this lawsuit 
under the Clean Air Act. The United 
States’ complaint alleges that Bayer 
CropScience violated section 112(r) of 
the Clean Air Act, 42 U.S.C. 7412(r), 
which addresses the prevention of 
accidental releases. The claims arise out 
of a 2008 explosion at the Methomyl 
production unit at Bayer CropScience’s 
plant in Institute, West Virginia. The 
original consent decree, which was 
entered by the court on August 9, 2016, 
required the defendant, Bayer 
CropScience LP, to pay a civil penalty 
of $975,000, to perform injunctive relief 
to reduce the likelihood of future 
accidents at the Institute Plant and 
several other chemical processing 
plants, and to perform supplemental 
environmental projects valued 
collectively at $4.23 million. The 
proposed modification replaces one of 
the supplemental environmental 
projects, which entailed expanding a 
wastewater sump, with another project 
that entails purchasing emergency 
response equipment. As a result, the 
total cost of the supplemental 
environmental projects will decrease to 
$3.05 million. 

The publication of this notice opens 
a period for public comment on the 
proposed second modification to 
consent decree. Comments should be 
addressed to the Assistant Attorney 
General, Environment and Natural 

Resources Division, and should refer to 
United States v. Bayer CropScience LP, 
D.J. Ref. No. 90–5–2–1–10802. All 
comments must be submitted no later 
than thirty (30) days after the 
publication date of this notice. 
Comments may be submitted either by 
email or by mail: 

To submit 
comments: Send them to: 

By email ....... pubcomment-ees.enrd@
usdoj.gov. 

By mail ......... Assistant Attorney General, 
U.S. DOJ—ENRD, P.O. 
Box 7611, Washington, DC 
20044–7611. 

During the public comment period, 
the consent decree may be examined 
and downloaded at this Justice 
Department Web site: https://
www.justice.gov/enrd/consent-decrees/. 
We will provide a paper copy of the 
consent decree upon written request 
and payment of reproduction costs. 
Please mail your request and payment 
to: Consent Decree Library, U.S. DOJ— 
ENRD, P.O. Box 7611, Washington, DC 
20044–7611. 

Please enclose a check or money order 
for $6.75 (25 cents per page 
reproduction cost) payable to the United 
States Treasury. 

Robert D. Brook, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division. 
[FR Doc. 2017–19332 Filed 9–11–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Office of the Secretary 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request; Hoist 
Operators’ Physical Fitness 

ACTION: Notice of availability; request 
for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor 
(DOL) is submitting the Mine Safety and 
Health Administration (MSHA) 
sponsored information collection 
request (ICR) titled, ‘‘Hoist Operators’ 
Physical Fitness’’ to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval for continued use, 
without change, in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA). Public comments on the ICR are 
invited. 
DATES: The OMB will consider all 
written comments that agency receives 
on or before October 12, 2017. 

ADDRESSES: A copy of this ICR with 
applicable supporting documentation; 
including a description of the likely 
respondents, proposed frequency of 
response, and estimated total burden 
may be obtained free of charge from the 
RegInfo.gov Web site at http://
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAViewICR?ref_nbr=201706-1219-004 
(this link will only become active on the 
day following publication of this notice) 
or by contacting Michel Smyth by 
telephone at 202–693–4129, TTY 202– 
693–8064, (these are not toll-free 
numbers) or by email at DOL_PRA_
PUBLIC@dol.gov. 

Submit comments about this request 
by mail or courier to the Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Attn: OMB Desk Officer for DOL– 
MSHA, Office of Management and 
Budget, Room 10235, 725 17th Street 
NW., Washington, DC 20503; by Fax: 
202–395–5806 (this is not a toll-free 
number); or by email: OIRA_
submission@omb.eop.gov. Commenters 
are encouraged, but not required, to 
send a courtesy copy of any comments 
by mail or courier to the U.S. 
Department of Labor–OASAM, Office of 
the Chief Information Officer, Attn: 
Departmental Information Compliance 
Management Program, Room N1301, 
200 Constitution Avenue NW., 
Washington, DC 20210; or by email: 
DOL_PRA_PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Michel Smyth by telephone at 202–693– 
4129, TTY 202–693–8064, (these are not 
toll-free numbers) or by email at DOL_
PRA_PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This ICR 
seeks to extend PRA authority for the 
Hoist Operators’ Physical Fitness 
information collection requirements 
codified in regulations 30 CFR 56.19057 
and 57.19057 that require the annual 
examination and certification of a hoist 
operator’s fitness by a qualified, 
licensed physician that includes 
documentation and recordkeeping 
requirements. The safety of all metal 
and nonmetal miners riding hoist 
conveyances is largely dependent upon 
the attentiveness and physical 
capabilities of the hoist operator. 
Improper movements, over-speed, and 
over-travel of a hoisting conveyance can 
result in serious physical harm or death 
to all passengers. Federal Mine Safety 
and Health Act of 1977 sections 101(a) 
and 103(h) authorize this information 
collection. See 30 U.S.C. 811(a) and 
813(h). 

This information collection is subject 
to the PRA. A Federal agency generally 
cannot conduct or sponsor a collection 
of information, and the public is 
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generally not required to respond to an 
information collection, unless it is 
approved by the OMB under the PRA 
and displays a currently valid OMB 
Control Number. In addition, 
notwithstanding any other provisions of 
law, no person shall generally be subject 
to penalty for failing to comply with a 
collection of information that does not 
display a valid Control Number. See 5 
CFR 1320.5(a) and 1320.6. The DOL 
obtains OMB approval for this 
information collection under Control 
Number 1219–0049. 

OMB authorization for an ICR cannot 
be for more than three (3) years without 
renewal, and the current approval for 
this collection is scheduled to expire on 
September 30, 2017. The DOL seeks to 
extend PRA authorization for this 
information collection for three (3) more 
years, without any change to existing 
requirements. The DOL notes that 
existing information collection 
requirements submitted to the OMB 
receive a month-to-month extension 
while they undergo review. For 
additional substantive information 
about this ICR, see the related notice 
published in the Federal Register on 
April 12, 2017 (82 FR 17695). 

Interested parties are encouraged to 
send comments to the OMB, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs at 
the address shown in the ADDRESSES 
section within thirty (30) days of 
publication of this notice in the Federal 
Register. In order to help ensure 
appropriate consideration, comments 
should mention OMB Control Number 
1219–0049. The OMB is particularly 
interested in comments that: 

• Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

• Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

• Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

• Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Agency: DOL–MSHA. 
Title of Collection: Hoist Operators’ 

Physical Fitness. 
OMB Control Number: 1219–0049. 

Affected Public: Private Sector— 
businesses or other for-profits. 

Total Estimated Number of 
Respondents: 115. 

Total Estimated Number of 
Responses: 575. 

Total Estimated Annual Time Burden: 
19 hours. 

Total Estimated Annual Other Costs 
Burden: $182,275. 

Authority: 44 U.S.C. 3507(a)(1)(D). 

Dated: September 6, 2017. 
Michel Smyth, 
Departmental Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2017–19238 Filed 9–11–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–43–P 

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND 
SPACE ADMINISTRATION 

[Notice: (17–061)] 

Earth Science Advisory Committee; 
Meeting 

AGENCY: National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration. 

ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, as 
amended, the National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration (NASA) 
announces a meeting of the Earth 
Science Advisory Committee (ESAC). 
The meeting will be held for the 
purpose of soliciting, from the scientific 
community and other persons, scientific 
and technical information relevant to 
program planning. 

DATES: Monday, October 2, 2017, 1:30 
p.m.–3:30 p.m., Eastern Daylight Time. 

ADDRESSES: This meeting will be open 
to the public telephonically. You must 
use a touch-tone phone to participate in 
this meeting. Any interested person may 
dial the USA toll free number 1–800– 
369–3189, passcode 9725782, followed 
by the # sign, to participate in this 
meeting by telephone. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
KarShelia Henderson, Science Mission 
Directorate, NASA Headquarters, 
Washington, DC 20546, (202) 358–2355, 
fax (202) 358–2779, or khenderson@
nasa.gov. 

The agenda for the meeting includes 
the following topic: 

—Earth Science Division Senior 
Review—Report by the ESAC Senior 
Review Subcommittee 

It is imperative that the meeting be 
held on this date to accommodate the 

scheduling priorities of the key 
participants. 

Patricia D. Rausch, 
Advisory Committee Management Officer, 
National Aeronautics and Space 
Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2017–19307 Filed 9–11–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7510–13–P 

NATIONAL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS 
ADMINISTRATION 

[NARA–2017–062] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request; Generic Clearance 
for the Collection of Qualitative 
Feedback on Agency Service Delivery 

AGENCY: National Archives and Records 
Administration (NARA). 
ACTION: Notice of a request for 
comments regarding a new information 
collection. 

SUMMARY: As part of the Federal 
Government-wide ongoing effort to 
streamline how agencies request 
feedback from the public on services 
(also called ‘‘service delivery’’), we are 
proposing to renew a generic 
information collection request (generic 
ICR) entitled Generic Clearance for 
Collecting Qualitative Feedback on 
Agency Services (previously entitled 
Generic Clearance for the Collection of 
Qualitative Feedback on Agency Service 
Delivery). This notice announces that 
we have submitted this generic ICR plan 
to OMB for renewed approval under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act and solicits 
comments on specific aspects of the 
collection plan. 
DATES: OMB must receive written 
comments at the address below on or 
before October 12, 2017. 
ADDRESSES: Send comments to Mr. 
Nicholas A. Fraser, desk officer for 
NARA, by mail to Office of Management 
and Budget; New Executive Office 
Building; Washington, DC 20503; by fax 
to 202–395–5167; or by email to 
Nicholas_A._Fraser@omb.eop.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: To 
request additional information, please 
contact Tamee Fechhelm by telephone 
at 301–837–1694 or by fax at 301–837– 
0319. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Pursuant 
to the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(Public Law 104–13), we invite 
comments on: (a) Whether collecting 
this information is necessary for proper 
performance of the agency’s functions, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; (b) the accuracy of 
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