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membrane treatment systems are only 
manufactured outside of the U.S. 
Therefore, based on the information 
provided to EPA and to the best of our 
knowledge at this time, Zenon ZeeWeed 
1000 submerged membranes are not 
manufactured in the United States, and 
no other U.S. manufactured product can 
meet Valley City’s performance 
specifications and requirements. 

The purpose of the ARRA is to 
stimulate economic recovery in part by 
funding current infrastructure 
construction, not to delay projects that 
are ‘‘shovel ready’’ by requiring cities 
such as Valley City to revise their 
standards and specifications and to start 
the bidding process again. The 
imposition of ARRA Buy American 
requirements on such projects otherwise 
eligible for ARRA State Revolving Fund 
assistance would result in unreasonable 
delay and thus displace the ‘‘shovel 
ready’’ status for this project. To further 
delay project implementation is in 
direct conflict with a fundamental 
economic purpose of the ARRA, which 
is to create or retain jobs. 

EPA’s national contractor prepared a 
technical assessment report dated 
December 2, 2009 based on the 
submitted waiver request. The report 
determined that the waiver request 
submittal was complete, that adequate 
technical information was provided, 
and that there were no significant 
weaknesses in the justification 
provided. The report confirmed the 
waiver applicant’s claim that there are 
no comparable domestic products that 
can meet the project specifications. 

The Technical & Financial Services 
Unit has reviewed this waiver request 
and has determined that the supporting 
documentation provided by Valley City 
is sufficient to meet the criteria listed 
under Section 1605(b) of the ARRA and 
in the April 28, 2009, ‘‘Implementation 
of Buy American provisions of Public 
Law 111–5, the ‘American Recovery and 
Reinvestment Act of 2009’ 
Memorandum’’: Iron, steel, and the 
manufactured goods are not produced in 
the United States in sufficient and 
reasonably available quantities and of a 
satisfactory quality. The basis for this 
project waiver is the authorization 
provided in Section 1605(b)(2) of the 
ARRA. Due to the lack of production of 
this product in the United States in 
sufficient and reasonably available 
quantities and of a satisfactory quality 
in order to meet Valley City’s 
performance specifications and 
requirements, a waiver from the Buy 
American requirement is justified. 

The March 31, 2009 Delegation of 
Authority Memorandum provided 
Regional Administrators with the 

authority to issue exceptions to Section 
1605 of the ARRA within the geographic 
boundaries of their respective regions 
and with respect to requests by 
individual grant recipients. Having 
established both a proper basis to 
specify the particular good required for 
this project, and that this manufactured 
good was not available from a producer 
in the United States, Valley City is 
hereby granted a waiver from the Buy 
American requirements of Section 
1605(a) of Public Law 111–5 for the 
purchase of Zenon ZeeWeed 1000 
submerged membranes using ARRA 
funds as specified in the City’s request 
of September 16, 2009. This 
supplementary information constitutes 
the detailed written justification 
required by Section 1605(c) for waivers 
‘‘based on a finding under subsection 
(b).’’ 

Authority: Public Law 111–5, section 
1605. 

Dated: December 28, 2009. 
Carol Rushin, 
Acting Regional Administrator, Region 8. 
[FR Doc. E9–31404 Filed 1–4–10; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Change in Bank Control Notices; 
Acquisition of Shares of Bank or Bank 
Holding Companies 

The notificants listed below have 
applied under the Change in Bank 
Control Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)) and 
§ 225.41 of the Board’s Regulation Y (12 
CFR 225.41) to acquire a bank or bank 
holding company. The factors that are 
considered in acting on the notices are 
set forth in paragraph 7 of the Act (12 
U.S.C. 1817(j)(7)). 

The notices are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank indicated. The notices 
also will be available for inspection at 
the office of the Board of Governors. 
Interested persons may express their 
views in writing to the Reserve Bank 
indicated for that notice or to the offices 
of the Board of Governors. Comments 
must be received not later than January 
20, 2010. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Chicago 
(Colette A. Fried, Assistant Vice 
President) 230 South LaSalle Street, 
Chicago, Illinois 60690-1414: 

1. Notice by Hans J. Welker, White 
Lake, Michigan, to acquire more than 25 
percent of the voting shares of Clarkston 
Financial Corporation, Waterford, 
Michigan, and thereby indirectly 
acquire control of Clarkston State Bank, 
Clarkston, Michigan. 

2. Notice by Mark A. Murvay, Lake 
Angelus, Michigan, to acquire more than 
25 percent of the voting shares of 
Clarkston Financial Corporation, 
Waterford, Michigan, and thereby 
indirectly acquire control of Clarkston 
State Bank, Clarkston, Michigan. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, December 30, 2009. 
Jennifer J. Johnson, 
Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. E9–31255 Filed 1–4–10; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6210–01–S 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR Part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The application also will be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 
Additional information on all bank 
holding companies may be obtained 
from the National Information Center 
website at www.ffiec.gov/nic/. 

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than January 29, 
2010. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Atlanta 
(Steve Foley, Vice President) 1000 
Peachtree Street, N.E., Atlanta, Georgia 
30309: 

1. Florida Shores Shamrock, Inc., 
Naples Florida, to become a bank 
holding company by acquiring at least 
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