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Part D appeals can be found at 42 CFR 
423, subparts M and U. More 
specifically, § 423.2006 of the Part D 
appeals rules discusses the AIC 
threshold amounts for ALJ hearings and 
judicial review. Sections 423.2002 and 
423.2006 grant a Part D enrollee, who is 
dissatisfied with the independent 
review entity (IRE) reconsideration 
determination, a right to an ALJ hearing 
if, in part, the amount remaining in 
controversy after the IRE 
reconsideration meets the threshold 
amount established annually by the 
Secretary. Sections 423.2006 and 
423.2136 allow a Part D enrollee to 
request judicial review of an ALJ or 
Medicare Appeals Council decision if, 
in part, the AIC meets the threshold 
amount established annually by the 
Secretary. 

II. Provisions of the Notice—Annual 
AIC Adjustments 

A. AIC Adjustment Formula and AIC 
Adjustments 

As previously noted, section 940 of 
the MMA requires that the AIC 
threshold amounts be adjusted 
annually, beginning in January 2005, by 
the percentage increase in the medical 
care component of the CPI for all urban 
consumers (U.S. city average) for July 
2003 to July of the year preceding the 
year involved and rounded to the 
nearest multiple of $10. 

B. Calendar Year 2021 

The AIC threshold amount for ALJ 
hearings will rise to $180 and the AIC 
threshold amount for judicial review 
will rise to $1,760 for CY 2021. These 
amounts are based on the 75.634 
percent increase in the medical care 
component of the CPI, which was at 

297.600 in July 2003 and rose to 522.686 
in July 2020. The AIC threshold amount 
for ALJ hearings changes to $175.63 
based on the 75.634 percent increase 
over the initial threshold amount of 
$100 established in 2003. In accordance 
with section 1869(b)(1)(E)(iii) of the Act, 
the adjusted threshold amounts are 
rounded to the nearest multiple of $10. 
Therefore, the CY 2021 AIC threshold 
amount for ALJ hearings is $180.00. The 
AIC threshold amount for judicial 
review changes to $1,756.34 based on 
the 75.634 percent increase over the 
initial threshold amount of $1,000. This 
amount was rounded to the nearest 
multiple of $10, resulting in the CY 
2021 AIC threshold amount of $1,760.00 
for judicial review. 

C. Summary Table of Adjustments in 
the AIC Threshold Amounts 

In the following table we list the CYs 
2017 through 2021 threshold amounts. 

CY 2017 CY 2018 CY 2019 CY 2020 CY 2021 

ALJ Hearing ............................................................................................. $160 $160 $160 $170 $180 
Judicial Review ........................................................................................ 1,560 1,600 1,630 1,670 1,760 

III. Collection of Information 
Requirements 

This document does not impose any 
new or revised ‘‘collection of 
information’’ requirements or burden. 
Consequently, there is no need for 
review by the Office of Management and 
Budget under the authority of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA) 
(44 U.S.C. 3501 et seq.). With respect to 
the PRA and this section of the 
preamble, collection of information is 
defined under 5 CFR 1320.3(c) of the 
PRA’s implementing regulations. 

The Administrator of the Centers for 
Medicare & Medicaid Services (CMS), 
Seema Verma, having reviewed and 
approved this document, authorizes 
Vanessa Garcia, who is the Federal 
Register Liaison, to electronically sign 
this document for purposes of 
publication in the Federal Register. 

Dated: September 21, 2020. 

Vanessa Garcia, 
Federal Register Liaison, Centers for Medicare 
& Medicaid Services. 
[FR Doc. 2020–21254 Filed 9–25–20; 8:45 am] 
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SUMMARY: This proposed notice 
acknowledges the receipt of an 
application from the Accreditation 
Commission for Healthcare (ACHC) for 
continued recognition as a national 
accrediting organization for home health 
agencies (HHAs) that wish to participate 
in the Medicare or Medicaid programs. 
The statute requires that within 60 days 
of receipt of an organization’s complete 
application, the Centers for Medicare & 
Medicaid Services (CMS) publish a 
notice that identifies the national 
accrediting body making the request, 
describes the nature of the request, and 
provides at least a 30-day public 
comment period. 
DATES: To be assured consideration, 
comments must be received at one of 
the addresses provided below, no later 
than 5 p.m. on October 28, 2020. 

ADDRESSES: In commenting, please refer 
to file code CMS–3400–PN. 

Comments, including mass comment 
submissions, must be submitted in one 
of the following three ways (please 
choose only one of the ways listed): 

1. Electronically. You may submit 
electronic comments on this regulation 
to http://www.regulations.gov. 

Follow the ‘‘Submit a comment’’ 
instructions. 

2. By regular mail. You may mail 
written comments to the following 
address ONLY: Centers for Medicare & 
Medicaid Services, Department of 
Health and Human Services, Attention: 
CMS–3400–PN, P.O. Box 8013, 
Baltimore, MD 21244–8013. 

Please allow sufficient time for mailed 
comments to be received before the 
close of the comment period. 

3. By express or overnight mail. You 
may send written comments to the 
following address ONLY: Centers for 
Medicare & Medicaid Services, 
Department of Health and Human 
Services, Attention: CMS–3400–PN, 
Mail Stop C4–26–05, 7500 Security 
Boulevard, Baltimore, MD 21244–1850. 

For information on viewing public 
comments, see the beginning of the 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION section. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:

Tara Lemons (410) 786–3030. 
Lillian Williams (410) 786–8636. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Inspection of Public Comments: All 

comments received before the close of 
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the comment period are available for 
viewing by the public, including any 
personally identifiable or confidential 
business information that is included in 
a comment. We post all comments 
received before the close of the 
comment period on the following 
website as soon as possible after they 
have been received: http://
www.regulations.gov. Follow the search 
instructions on that website to view 
public comments. 

I. Background 
Under the Medicare program, eligible 

beneficiaries may receive covered 
services from a home health agency 
(HHA), provided certain requirements 
are met. Sections 1861(m) and (o), 1891 
and 1895 of the Social Security Act (the 
Act) establish distinct criteria for an 
entity seeking designation as an HHA. 
Regulations concerning provider 
agreements are at 42 CFR part 489 and 
those pertaining to activities relating to 
the survey and certification of facilities 
and other entities are at 42 CFR part 
488. The regulations at 42 CFR parts 409 
and 484 specify the conditions that an 
HHA must meet to participate in the 
Medicare program, the scope of covered 
services and the conditions for Medicare 
payment for home health care. 

Generally, to enter into a provider 
agreement with the Medicare program, 
an HHA must first be certified by a state 
survey agency as complying with the 
conditions or requirements set forth in 
42 CFR part 484 of our regulations. 
Thereafter, the HHA is subject to regular 
surveys by a state survey agency to 
determine whether it continues to meet 
these requirements. 

However, there is an alternative to 
surveys by state agencies. Section 
1865(a)(1) of the Act provides that, if a 
provider entity demonstrates through 
accreditation by an approved national 
accrediting organization that all 
applicable Medicare conditions are met 
or exceeded, we will deem those 
provider entities as having met the 
requirements. Accreditation by an 
accrediting organization is voluntary 
and is not required for Medicare 
participation. 

If an accrediting organization is 
recognized by the Secretary of Health 
and Human Services (the Secretary) as 
having standards for accreditation that 
meet or exceed Medicare requirements, 
any provider entity accredited by the 
national accrediting body’s approved 
program would be deemed to meet the 
Medicare conditions. A national 
accrediting organization applying for 
CMS approval of their accreditation 
program under 42 CFR part 488, subpart 
A must provide CMS with reasonable 

assurance that the accrediting 
organization requires the accredited 
provider entities to meet requirements 
that are at least as stringent as the 
Medicare conditions. Our regulations 
concerning the approval of accrediting 
organizations are set forth at § 488.5. 
The regulations at § 488.5(e)(2)(i) 
require accrediting organizations to 
reapply for continued approval of their 
accreditation program every 6 years or 
sooner as determined by CMS. 

The Accreditation Commission for 
Healthcare’s (ACHC’s) term of approval 
for their HHA accreditation program 
expires February 24, 2021. 

II. Approval of Deeming Organizations 

Section 1865(a)(2) of the Act and our 
regulations at § 488.5 require that our 
findings concerning review and 
approval of a national accrediting 
organization’s requirements consider, 
among other factors, the applying 
accrediting organization’s requirements 
for accreditation; survey procedures; 
resources for conducting required 
surveys; capacity to furnish information 
for use in enforcement activities; 
monitoring procedures for provider 
entities found not in compliance with 
the conditions or requirements; and 
ability to provide us with the necessary 
data for validation. 

Section 1865(a)(3)(A) of the Act 
further requires that we publish, within 
60 days of receipt of an organization’s 
complete application, a notice 
identifying the national accrediting 
body making the request, describing the 
nature of the request, and providing at 
least a 30-day public comment period. 
We have 210 days from the receipt of a 
complete application to publish notice 
of approval or denial of the application. 

The purpose of this proposed notice 
is to inform the public of ACHC’s 
request for continued approval for its 
HHA accreditation program. This notice 
also solicits public comment on whether 
ACHC’s requirements meet or exceed 
the Medicare conditions of participation 
(CoPs) for HHAs. 

III. Evaluation of Deeming Authority 
Request 

ACHC submitted all the necessary 
materials to enable us to make a 
determination concerning its request for 
continued approval of its HHA 
accreditation program. This application 
was determined to be complete on July 
29, 2020. Under section 1865(a)(2) of the 
Act and our regulations at § 488.5 
(Application and re-application 
procedures for national accrediting 
organizations), our review and 
evaluation of ACHC will be conducted 

in accordance with, but not necessarily 
limited to, the following factors: 

• The equivalency of ACHC’s 
standards for HHAs as compared with 
CMS’ HHA CoPs. 

• ACHC’s survey process to 
determine the following: 

++ The composition of the survey 
team, surveyor qualifications, and the 
ability of the organization to provide 
continuing surveyor training. 

++ The comparability of ACHC’s 
processes to those of state agencies, 
including survey frequency, and the 
ability to investigate and respond 
appropriately to complaints against 
accredited HHAs. 

++ ACHC’s processes and procedures 
for monitoring HHAs found out of 
compliance with ACHC’s program 
requirements. These monitoring 
procedures are used only when ACHC 
identifies noncompliance. If 
noncompliance is identified through 
validation reviews or complaint 
surveys, the state survey agency 
monitors corrections as specified at 
§ 488.9(c). 

++ ACHC’s capacity to report 
deficiencies to the surveyed HHAs and 
respond to the HHA’s plan of correction 
in a timely manner. 

++ ACHC’s capacity to provide us 
with electronic data and reports 
necessary for effective validation and 
assessment of the organization’s survey 
process. 

++ The adequacy of ACHC’s staff and 
other resources, and its financial 
viability. 

++ ACHC’s capacity to adequately 
fund required surveys. 

++ ACHC’s policies with respect to 
whether surveys are announced or 
unannounced, to assure that surveys are 
unannounced. 

++ ACHC’s policies and procedures to 
avoid conflicts of interest, including the 
appearance of conflicts of interest, 
involving individuals who conduct 
surveys or participate in accreditation 
decisions. 

++ ACHC’s agreement to provide us 
with a copy of the most current 
accreditation survey together with any 
other information related to the survey 
as we may require (including corrective 
action plans). 

IV. Collection of Information 
Requirements 

This document does not impose 
information collection requirements, 
that is reporting, recordkeeping or third- 
party disclosure requirements. 
Consequently, there is no need for 
review by the Office Management and 
Budget under the authority of the 
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Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. Chapter 35). 

V. Response to Comments 
Because of the large number of public 

comments, we normally receive on 
Federal Register documents, we are not 
able to acknowledge or respond to them 
individually. We will consider all 
comments we receive by the date and 
time specified in the DATES section of 
this notice. 

Upon completion of our evaluation, 
including evaluation of comments 
received as a result of this notice, we 
will publish a final notice in the Federal 
Register summarizing our response to 
comments and announcing the result of 
our evaluation. 

The Administrator of the Centers for 
Medicare & Medicaid Services (CMS), 
Seema Verma, having reviewed and 
approved this document, authorizes 
Lynette Wilson, who is the Federal 
Register Liaison, to electronically sign 
this document for purposes of 
publication in the Federal Register. 

Dated: September 22, 2020. 
Lynette Wilson, 
Federal Register Liaison, Centers for Medicare 
& Medicaid Services. 
[FR Doc. 2020–21262 Filed 9–25–20; 8:45 am] 
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SUMMARY: The Centers for Medicare & 
Medicaid Services (CMS) is announcing 
an opportunity for the public to 
comment on CMS’ intention to collect 
information from the public. Under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA), federal agencies are required to 
publish notice in the Federal Register 
concerning each proposed collection of 
information, including each proposed 
extension or reinstatement of an existing 
collection of information, and to allow 
a second opportunity for public 
comment on the notice. Interested 
persons are invited to send comments 
regarding the burden estimate or any 
other aspect of this collection of 

information, including the necessity and 
utility of the proposed information 
collection for the proper performance of 
the agency’s functions, the accuracy of 
the estimated burden, ways to enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected, and the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology to 
minimize the information collection 
burden. 
DATES: Comments on the collection(s) of 
information must be received by the 
OMB desk officer by October 28, 2020. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 

To obtain copies of a supporting 
statement and any related forms for the 
proposed collection(s) summarized in 
this notice, you may make your request 
using one of following: 

1. Access CMS’ website address at 
website address at https://www.cms.gov/ 
Regulations-and-Guidance/Legislation/ 
PaperworkReductionActof1995/PRA- 
Listing.html. 

2. Call the Reports Clearance Office at 
(410) 786–1326. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
William Parham at (410) 786–4669. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA) 
(44 U.S.C. 3501–3520), federal agencies 
must obtain approval from the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for each 
collection of information they conduct 
or sponsor. The term ‘‘collection of 
information’’ is defined in 44 U.S.C. 
3502(3) and 5 CFR 1320.3(c) and 
includes agency requests or 
requirements that members of the public 
submit reports, keep records, or provide 
information to a third party. Section 
3506(c)(2)(A) of the PRA (44 U.S.C. 
3506(c)(2)(A)) requires federal agencies 
to publish a 30-day notice in the 
Federal Register concerning each 
proposed collection of information, 
including each proposed extension or 
reinstatement of an existing collection 
of information, before submitting the 
collection to OMB for approval. To 
comply with this requirement, CMS is 
publishing this notice that summarizes 
the following proposed collection(s) of 
information for public comment: 

1. Type of Information Collection 
Request: Extension of a previously 
approved collection; Title of 
Information Collection: Beneficiary and 

Family Centered Data Collection; Use: 
To ensure the QIOs are effectively 
meeting their goals, CMS collects 
information about beneficiary 
experience receiving support from the 
QIOs. The information collection uses 
both qualitative and quantitative 
strategies to ensure CMS and the QIOs 
understand beneficiary experiences 
through all interactions with the QIO 
including initial contact, interim 
interactions, and case closure. 
Information collection instruments are 
tailored to reflect the steps in each type 
of process, as well as the average time 
it takes to complete each process. The 
information collection will: 

• Allow beneficiaries to directly 
provide feedback about the services they 
receive under the QIO program; 

• Provide quality improvement data 
for QIOs to improve the quality of 
service delivered to Medicare 
beneficiaries; and 

• Provide evaluation metrics for CMS 
to use in assessing performance of QIO 
contractors. 

To achieve the above goals, 
information collection will include: 
Experience survey, direct follow-up and 
general feedback web survey. Form 
Number: CMS–10393 (OMB control 
number: 0938–1177); Frequency: Once; 
Affected Public: Individuals or 
households; Number of Respondents: 
9,100; Number of Responses: 9,100; 
Total Annual Hours: 2,191. (For policy 
questions regarding this collection, 
contact David Russo at 617–565–1310.) 

2. Type of Information Collection 
Request: Re-instatement with change of 
a previously approved collection; Title: 
PACE Quality Data Monitoring and 
Reporting; Use: The Programs of All- 
Inclusive Care for the Elderly (PACE) 
program is a unique model of managed 
care service delivery for the frail elderly, 
most of whom are dually-eligible for 
Medicare and Medicaid benefits. To be 
eligible to enroll in PACE, an individual 
must: Be 55 or older, live in the service 
area of a PACE organization (PO), need 
a nursing home-level of care (as certified 
by the state in which he or she lives), 
and be able to live safely in the 
community with assistance from PACE. 

PACE organizations are responsible 
for providing all required Medicare and 
Medicaid covered services, and any 
other service that the interdisciplinary 
team (IDT) determines necessary to 
improve and maintain a participant’s 
overall health condition (42 CFR 
460.92). POs must also comply with the 
quality monitoring and reporting 
requirements outlined in §§ 460.140, 
460.200(b)(1), 460.200(c) and 460.202. 
POs are also required to report certain 
unusual incidents to other Federal and 
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