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and that these WAPA modifications 
satisfy the requirements for reciprocity 
status. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. On or before the 
comment date, it is not necessary to 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Applicant. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings of comments, protests 
and interventions in lieu of paper using 
the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://
www.ferc.gov. Persons unable to file 
electronically may mail similar 
pleadings to the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First Street 
NE, Washington, DC 20426. Hand 
delivered submissions in docketed 
proceedings should be delivered to 
Health and Human Services, 12225 
Wilkins Avenue, Rockville, Maryland 
20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on January 4, 2021. 

Dated: December 9, 2020. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–27535 Filed 12–14–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
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Combined Notice of Filings #2 

Take notice that the Commission 
received the following electric corporate 
filings: 

Docket Numbers: EC21–33–000. 
Applicants: Altavista Solar, LLC. 
Description: Application for 

Authorization Under Section 203 of the 
Federal Power Act of Altavista Solar, 
LLC under EC21–33. 

Filed Date: 12/8/20. 
Accession Number: 20201208–5199. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/29/20. 
Take notice that the Commission 

received the following electric rate 
filings: 

Docket Numbers: ER15–632–010; 
ER15–634–010; ER14–2465–011; ER14– 
2466–011; ER15–1952–008; ER14–2939– 
008; ER15–2728–010; ER14–2140–010; 
ER14–2141–010. 

Applicants: CID Solar, LLC, 
Cottonwood Solar, LLC, RE Columbia 
Two, LLC, RE Camelot, LLC, Pavant 
Solar, LLC, Imperial Valley Solar 
Company (IVSC) 2, LLC, Maricopa West 
Solar PV, LLC, Mulberry Farm, LLC, 
Selmer Farm, LLC. 

Description: Response to November 6, 
2020 Deficiency Letter of Dominion 
Energy Companies, et al. 

Filed Date: 12/7/20. 
Accession Number: 20201207–5236. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/28/20. 
Docket Numbers: ER19–1474–002; 

ER19–1473–002; ER20–1629–001; 
ER19–1179–002. 

Applicants: AES Huntington Beach 
Energy, LLC, AES Alamitos Energy, 
LLC, AES ES Alamitos, LLC, AES ES 
Gilbert, LLC. 

Description: Notice of Non-Material 
Change in Status of AES Huntington 
Beach Energy, LLC et al. 

Filed Date: 12/9/20. 
Accession Number: 20201209–5103. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/30/20. 
Docket Numbers: ER21–614–000. 
Applicants: PJM Interconnection, 

L.L.C. 
Description: § 205(d) Rate Filing: 

Original WMPA, Service Agreement No. 
5855; Queue No. AF2–100 to be 
effective 11/10/2020. 

Filed Date: 12/9/20. 
Accession Number: 20201209–5133. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/30/20. 
Take notice that the Commission 

received the following PURPA 
210(m)(3) filings: 

Docket Numbers: QM21–1–000. 
Applicants: East Texas Electric 

Cooperative, Inc., Northeast Texas 
Electric Cooperative Inc. 

Description: Application of East Texas 
Electric Cooperative, Inc. and Northeast 
Texas Electric Cooperative, Inc. to 
Terminate Their Mandatory Purchase 
Obligation under the Public Utility 
Regulatory Policies Act of 1978. 

Filed Date: 12/9/20. 
Accession Number: 20201209–5144. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 1/6/21. 
The filings are accessible in the 

Commission’s eLibrary system by 
clicking on the links or querying the 
docket number. 

Any person desiring to intervene or 
protest in any of the above proceedings 
must file in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s 
Regulations (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 
Protests may be considered, but 
intervention is necessary to become a 
party to the proceeding. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

Dated: December 9, 2020. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–27529 Filed 12–14–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPP–2020–0570; FRL–10016–95] 

Broflanilide; Receipt of Application for 
Emergency Exemption, Solicitation of 
Public Comment 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: EPA has received a specific 
exemption request from the Washington 
State Department of Agriculture to use 
the pesticide broflanilide (CAS No. 
1207727–04–5) to treat an amount of 
spring wheat seed sufficient to plant up 
to 206,000 acres to control wireworms. 
The applicant proposes the use of a new 
chemical which has not been registered 
by EPA. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before December 30, 2020. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPP–2020–0570, by 
one of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the online 
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instructions for submitting comments. 
Do not submit electronically any 
information you consider to be 
Confidential Business Information (CBI) 
or other information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. 

• Mail: OPP Docket, Environmental 
Protection Agency Docket Center (EPA/ 
DC), (28221T), 1200 Pennsylvania Ave. 
NW, Washington, DC 20460–0001. 

• Hand Delivery: To make special 
arrangements for hand delivery or 
delivery of boxed information, please 
follow the instructions at http://
www.epa.gov/dockets/contacts.html. 

Due to the public health concerns 
related to COVID–19, the EPA Docket 
Center (EPA/DC) and Reading Room is 
closed to visitors with limited 
exceptions. The staff continues to 
provide remote customer service via 
email, phone, and webform. For the 
latest status information on EPA/DC 
services and docket access, visit https:// 
www.epa.gov/dockets. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Marietta Echeverria, Registration 
Division (7505P), Office of Pesticide 
Programs, Environmental Protection 
Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC 20460–0001; main 
telephone number: (703) 305–7090; 
email address: RDFRNotices@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with the regulations at 40 
CFR 166.24(a)(1), EPA is soliciting 
public comment before making the 
decision whether or not to grant the 
exemption. 

I. General Information 

A. Does this action apply to me? 

You may be potentially affected by 
this action if you are an agricultural 
producer, food manufacturer, or 
pesticide manufacturer. The following 
list of North American Industrial 
Classification System (NAICS) codes is 
not intended to be exhaustive, but rather 
provides a guide to help readers 
determine whether this document 
applies to them. Potentially affected 
entities may include: 

• Crop production (NAICS code 111). 
• Animal production (NAICS code 

112). 
• Food manufacturing (NAICS code 

311). 
• Pesticide manufacturing (NAICS 

code 32532). 

B. What should I consider as I prepare 
my comments for EPA? 

1. Submitting CBI. Do not submit this 
information to EPA through 
www.regulations.gov or email. Clearly 
mark the part or all of the information 
that you claim to be CBI. For CBI 

information in a disk or CD–ROM that 
you mail to EPA, mark the outside of the 
disk or CD–ROM as CBI and then 
identify electronically within the disk or 
CD–ROM the specific information that 
is claimed as CBI. In addition to one 
complete version of the comment that 
includes information claimed as CBI, a 
copy of the comment that does not 
contain the information claimed as CBI 
must be submitted for inclusion in the 
public docket. Information so marked 
will not be disclosed except in 
accordance with procedures set forth in 
40 CFR part 2. 

2. Tips for preparing your comments. 
When preparing and submitting your 
comments, see the commenting tips at 
http://www.epa.gov/dockets/ 
comments.html. 

3. Environmental justice. EPA seeks to 
achieve environmental justice, the fair 
treatment and meaningful involvement 
of any group, including minority and/or 
low-income populations, in the 
development, implementation, and 
enforcement of environmental laws, 
regulations, and policies. To help 
address potential environmental justice 
issues, the Agency seeks information on 
any groups or segments of the 
population who, as a result of their 
location, cultural practices, or other 
factors, may have atypical or 
disproportionately high and adverse 
human health impacts or environmental 
effects from exposure to the pesticide(s) 
discussed in this document, compared 
to the general population. 

II. What Action is the Agency Taking? 
Under section 18 of the Federal 

Insecticide, Fungicide, and Rodenticide 
Act (FIFRA) (7 U.S.C. 136p), at the 
discretion of the EPA Administrator, a 
Federal or State agency may be 
exempted from any provision of FIFRA 
if the EPA Administrator determines 
that emergency conditions exist which 
require the exemption. The Washington 
State Department of Agriculture 
(WSDA) has requested the EPA 
Administrator to issue a specific 
exemption for the use of broflanilide 
(CAS No. 1207727–04–5) as a seed 
treatment on spring wheat to control 
wireworms. Information in accordance 
with 40 CFR part 166 was submitted as 
part of this request. 

As part of this request, the applicant 
stated that the currently registered 
products do not provide adequate 
control of wireworms, which are having 
a devastating and severe impact upon 
wheat fields and growers, especially in 
the dryland wheat growing counties of 
eastern Washington. Approximately 
1,029 lbs. of the active ingredient 
broflanilide would be needed for this 

emergency exemption program. 
Additional information regarding the 
critical need for the emergency and the 
proposed use pattern can be found in 
the section 18 emergency exemption 
application request at http://
www.regulations.gov, under the docket 
number EPA–HQ–OPP–2020–0570. 

This notice does not constitute a 
decision by EPA on the application 
itself. The regulations governing FIFRA 
section 18 emergency exemptions 
require publication of a notice of receipt 
of an application for an emergency 
exemption if it proposes the use of a 
new chemical which has not been 
registered by EPA. Broflanilide is not 
currently registered. 

This notice provides an opportunity 
for public comment on this application. 
The Agency will review and consider all 
comments received during the comment 
period in determining whether to issue 
the specific exemption requested by 
WSDA. 

Authority: 7 U.S.C. 136 et seq. 

Dated: November 23, 2020. 
Marietta Echeverria, 
Acting Director, Registration Division, Office 
of Pesticide Programs. 
[FR Doc. 2020–27539 Filed 12–14–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPPT–2020–0077; FRL–10016– 
83] 

Certain New Chemicals; Receipt and 
Status Information for October 2020 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: EPA is required under the 
Toxic Substances Control Act (TSCA), 
as amended by the Frank R. Lautenberg 
Chemical Safety for the 21st Century 
Act, to make information publicly 
available and to publish information in 
the Federal Register pertaining to 
submissions under TSCA Section 5, 
including notice of receipt of a 
Premanufacture notice (PMN), 
Significant New Use Notice (SNUN) or 
Microbial Commercial Activity Notice 
(MCAN), including an amended notice 
or test information; an exemption 
application (Biotech exemption); an 
application for a test marketing 
exemption (TME), both pending and/or 
concluded; a notice of commencement 
(NOC) of manufacture (including 
import) for new chemical substances; 
and a periodic status report on new 
chemical substances that are currently 
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