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warehousing/distribution activities for a 
variety of products. Specific 
manufacturing approvals are not being 
sought at this time. Such requests would 
be made to the Board on a case-by-case 
basis. 

In accordance with the Board’s 
regulations, Camille Evans of the FTZ 
Staff is designated examiner to evaluate 
and analyze the facts and information 
presented in the application and case 
record and to report findings and 
recommendations to the Board. 

Public comment is invited from 
interested parties. Submissions (original 
and 3 copies) shall be addressed to the 
Board’s Executive Secretary at the 
address below. The closing period for 
their receipt is December 5, 2011. 
Rebuttal comments in response to 
material submitted during the foregoing 
period may be submitted during the 
subsequent 15-day period to December 
19, 2011. 

A copy of the application will be 
available for public inspection at the 
Office of the Executive Secretary, 
Foreign-Trade Zones Board, Room 2111, 
U.S. Department of Commerce, 1401 
Constitution Avenue, NW., Washington, 
DC 20230–0002, and in the ‘‘Reading 
Room’’ section of the Board’s Web site, 
which is accessible via http:// 
www.trade.gov/ftz. For further 
information, contact Camille Evans at 
Camille.Evans@trade.gov or (202) 482– 
2350. 

Dated: September 29, 2011. 
Andrew McGilvray, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2011–25738 Filed 10–4–11; 8:45 am] 
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FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Elizabeth Eastwood, AD/CVD 
Operations, Office 2, Import 
Administration, International Trade 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Commerce, 14th Street and Constitution 
Avenue, NW., Washington, DC 20230; 
telephone (202) 482–3874. 

Background 

On April 1, 2011, the Department of 
Commerce (the Department) published a 
notice of initiation of the administrative 
reviews of the antidumping duty orders 
on certain frozen warmwater shrimp 
From India and Thailand covering the 
period February 1, 2010, through 
January 31, 2011. See Certain Frozen 
Warmwater Shrimp From Brazil, India, 
and Thailand: Notice of Initiation of 
Administrative Reviews, 76 FR 18157 
(Apr. 1, 2011). 

Extension of Time Limit of Preliminary 
Results 

Section 751(a)(3)(A) of the Tariff Act 
of 1930, as amended (the Act), requires 
the Department to make a preliminary 
determination in an administrative 
review within 245 days after the last day 
of the anniversary month of an order or 
finding for which a review is requested. 
Consistent with section 751(a)(3)(A) of 
the Act, the Department may extend the 
245-day period to 365 days if it is not 
practicable to complete the review 
within a 245-day period. The deadline 
for the preliminary results of these 
administrative reviews is currently 
October 31, 2011. The Department 
determines that completion of the 
preliminary results of these reviews 
within the statutory time period is not 
practicable because it recently initiated 
a cost investigation for one respondent 
in each review and the data necessary 
to conduct these investigations will not 
be received until late September (for 
Thailand) and early October 2011 (for 
India). The Department thus requires 
additional time to conduct its cost 
analysis in each of these reviews. 
Therefore, in accordance with section 
751(a)(3)(A) of the Act, we are extending 
the time period for issuing the 
preliminary results of these reviews 
until February 28, 2012. The final 
results continue to be due 120 days after 
the publication of the preliminary 
results. 

This notice is published pursuant to 
section 751(a)(3)(A) of the Act and 19 
CFR 351.213(h)(2). 

Dated: September 30, 2011. 

Gary Taverman, 
Acting Deputy Assistant Secretary for 
Antidumping and Countervailing Duty 
Operations. 
[FR Doc. 2011–25741 Filed 10–4–11; 8:45 am] 
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International Trade Administration 

Application(s) for Duty-Free Entry of 
Scientific Instruments 

Pursuant to Section 6(c) of the 
Educational, Scientific and Cultural 
Materials Importation Act of 1966 (Pub. 
L. 89–651, as amended by Pub. L. 106– 
36; 80 Stat. 897; 15 CFR part 301), we 
invite comments on the question of 
whether instruments of equivalent 
scientific value, for the purposes for 
which the instruments shown below are 
intended to be used, are being 
manufactured in the United States. 

Comments must comply with 15 CFR 
301.5(a)(3) and (4) of the regulations and 
be postmarked on or before October 25, 
2011. Address written comments to 
Statutory Import Programs Staff, Room 
3720, U.S. Department of Commerce, 
Washington, DC 20230. Applications 
may be examined between 8:30 a.m. and 
5 p.m. at the U.S. Department of 
Commerce in Room 3720. 

Docket Number: 11–059. Applicant: 
University of Arkansas Office of 
Business Affairs, ADMN 321, 1 
University of Arkansas, Favetteville, AR 
72701–1201. Instrument: Electron 
Microscope. Manufacturer: JEOL, Ltd., 
Japan. Intended Use: The instrument 
will be used to study semiconductor 
materials, metals, ceramics, and 
biological tissues, to determine the 
influence of impurities on medicine 
efficiency, the kinetics of the growth of 
particles in a specific environment, the 
phase transformation of metals, and the 
study of other phenomena. Justification 
for Duty-Free Entry: There are no 
instruments of the same general 
category manufactured in the United 
States. Application accepted by 
Commissioner of Customs: September 
15, 2011. 

Docket Number: 11–062. Applicant: 
University of Buffalo, NYS Center for 
Excellence, 701 Ellicott St., HJKRI B4– 
321, Buffalo, NY 14203. Instrument: 
Electron Microscope. Manufacturer: FEI, 
Czech Republic. Intended Use: The 
instrument will be used to study the 
normal and pathological brains and 
peripheral nerves from animal models, 
assessing the degree and quality of 
myelination and neuronal 
differentiation under different 
experimental conditions. The objective 
of the experiments is to discover 
treatments and cures for Krabbe and 
other demyelinating disease. The 
experiments require 2-angstrom 
resolution in order to examine the 
specimens. Justification for Duty-Free 
Entry: There are no instruments of the 
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