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18 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(12). 

Internet Web site (http://www.sec.gov/
rules/sro.shtml). Copies of the 
submission, all subsequent 
amendments, all written statements 
with respect to the proposed rule 
change that are filed with the 
Commission, and all written 
communications relating to the 
proposed rule change between the 
Commission and any person, other than 
those that may be withheld from the 
public in accordance with the 
provisions of 5 U.S.C. 552, will be 
available for Web site viewing and 
printing in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, 100 F Street NE., 
Washington, DC 20549, on official 
business days between the hours of 
10:00 a.m. and 3:00 p.m. Copies of the 
filing also will be available for 
inspection and copying at the principal 
office of the Exchange. All comments 
received will be posted without change; 
the Commission does not edit personal 
identifying information from 
submissions. You should submit only 
information that you wish to make 
available publicly. All submissions 
should refer to File Number SR–Phlx– 
2013–82 and should be submitted on or 
before September 9, 2013. 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Trading and Markets, pursuant to delegated 
authority.18 
Kevin M. O’Neill, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2013–20069 Filed 8–16–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[File No. 500–1] 

In the Matter of Redfin Network, Inc.; 
Order of Suspension of Trading 

August 15, 2013. 
It appears to the Securities and 

Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Redfin 
Network, Inc. (‘‘Redfin’’) because it has 
not filed a periodic report since it filed 
its Form 10–Q for the period ending 
September 30, 2012, filed on November 
9, 2012. 

The Commission is of the opinion that 
the public interest and the protection of 
investors require a suspension of trading 
in the securities of Redfin. Therefore, it 
is ordered, pursuant to Section 12(k) of 
the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, 
that trading in the securities of Redfin 
is suspended for the period from 9:30 

a.m. EDT on August 15, 2013, through 
11:59 p.m. EDT on August 28, 2013. 

By the Commission. 
Jill M. Peterson, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2013–20228 Filed 8–15–13; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Public Notice 8418] 

U.S. Department of State Advisory 
Committee on Private International 
Law (ACPIL): Public Meeting on 
Arbitration 

The Office of the Assistant Legal 
Adviser for Private International Law, 
Department of State, gives notice of a 
public meeting to discuss a draft 
convention on transparency in treaty- 
based investor-state arbitration that will 
be considered by the Secretariat of the 
United Nations Commission on 
International Trade Law (UNCITRAL). 
The public meeting will take place on 
Wednesday, September 4, 2013 from 
9:30 a.m. until 12 p.m. EDT. This is not 
a meeting of the full Advisory 
Committee. 

After several years of work, 
UNCITRAL adopted a set of Rules on 
Transparency in Treaty-based Investor- 
State Arbitration at its 46th Session in 
July 2013. UNCITRAL has decided to 
develop a convention that would 
provide an efficient mechanism for 
states to apply these Rules to existing 
investment treaties. A draft convention 
prepared by the UNCITRAL Secretariat 
is available in paper A/CN.9/784 on the 
UNCITRAL Web site (http://
www.uncitral.orgiuncitralien/
commission/workinggrous/
2Arbitration.html). The draft convention 
will be discussed September 16–20, 
2013, at the 59th session of UNCITRAL 
Working Group II. 

The purpose of the public meeting is 
to obtain the views of concerned 
stakeholders on the draft convention in 
advance of the meeting of Working 
Group II. Those who cannot attend but 
wish to comment are welcome to do so 
by email to Tim Schnabel at 
SchnabelTR@state.gov. 

Time and Place: The meeting will 
take place from 9:30 a.m. until 12 p.m. 
at 2430 E Street NW., South Building 
(SA–4), Room 240. Participants should 
arrive at the gate at 23rd and D Streets, 
NW before 9:10 a.m. for visitor 
screening, and will be escorted to the 
South Building. If you are unable to 
attend the public meeting and would 
like to participate from a remote 

location, teleconferencing will be 
available. 

Public Participation: This meeting is 
open to the public, subject to the 
capacity of the meeting room. Please 
provide your full name and contact 
information if you are planning on 
attending in person. Access to the 
building is strictly controlled. For pre- 
clearance purposes, those planning to 
attend should emailpiRstate.gov 
providing full name, address, date of 
birth, citizenship, driver’s license or 
passport number, and email address. 
This information will greatly facilitate 
entry into the building. A member of the 
public needing reasonable 
accommodation should email pil@
state.gov not later than August 29, 2013. 
Requests made after that date will be 
considered, but might not be able to be 
fulfilled. If you would like to participate 
by telephone, please email pil@state.gov 
to obtain the call-in number and other 
information. 

Data from the public is requested 
pursuant to Public Law 99–399 
(Omnibus Diplomatic Security and 
Antiterrorism Act of 1986), as amended; 
Public Law 107–56 (USA PATRIOT 
Act); and Executive Order 13356. The 
purpose of the collection is to validate 
the identity of individuals who enter 
Department facilities. The data will be 
entered into the Visitor Access Control 
System (VACS–D) database. Please see 
the Security Records System of Records 
Notice (State-36) at http://
www.state.govidocuments/organization/
103419.pdf for additional information. 

Dated: August 5, 2013. 
Timothy R. Schnabel, 
Attorney-Adviser, Office of Private 
International Law Office of Legal Adviser, 
Department of State. 
[FR Doc. 2013–20128 Filed 8–16–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–08–P 

STATE JUSTICE INSTITUTE 

SJI Board of Directors Meeting, Notice 

AGENCY: State Justice Institute. 
ACTION: Notice of Meeting. 

SUMMARY: The SJI Board of Directors 
will be meeting on Monday, September 
9, 2013 at 1:00 p.m. The meeting will be 
held at the Supreme Court of Ohio in 
Columbus, Ohio. The purpose of this 
meeting is to consider grant applications 
for the 4th quarter of FY 2013, and other 
business. All portions of this meeting 
are open to the public. 
ADDRESSES: Supreme Court of Ohio, 66 
South Front St. Taft Map Room #108, 
Grand Concourse Level 
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FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Jonathan Mattiello, Executive Director, 
State Justice Institute, 11951 Freedom 
Drive, Suite 1020, Reston, VA 20190, 
571–313–8843, contact@sji.gov. 

Jonathan D. Mattiello, 
Executive Director. 
[FR Doc. 2013–20084 Filed 8–16–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES 
TRADE REPRESENTATIVE 

Request for Public Comments 
Regarding the National Trade Estimate 
Report on Foreign Trade Barriers 

AGENCY: Office of the United States 
Trade Representative. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Pursuant to section 181 of the 
Trade Act of 1974, as amended (19 
U.S.C. 2241), the Office of the United 
States Trade Representative (USTR) is 
required to publish annually the 
National Trade Estimate Report on 
Foreign Trade Barriers (NTE). With this 
notice, the Trade Policy Staff Committee 
(TPSC) is requesting interested persons 
to submit comments to assist it in 
identifying significant barriers to U.S. 
exports of goods, services, and U.S. 
foreign direct investment for inclusion 
in the NTE. The TPSC invites written 
comments from the public on issues that 
USTR should examine in preparing the 
NTE. 

In 2014, USTR expects to once again 
release in conjunction with the NTE 
report two reports dealing with 
additional trade barriers—one on SPS 
measures and one on standards-related 
measures. USTR will invite written 
comments from the public on issues that 
should be examined in preparing those 
two reports through publication of a 
separate Notice in the Federal Register 
that will be forthcoming. Information 
regarding such measures should NOT be 
submitted in response to this Notice. 
DATES: Public comments are due not 
later than 11:59 p.m., October 22, 2013. 
ADDRESSES: Submissions should be 
made via the Internet at 
www.regulations.gov docket number 
USTR–2013–0027. For alternatives to 
on-line submissions please contact 
Yvonne Jamison (202–395–3475). The 
public is strongly encouraged to file 
submissions electronically rather than 
by facsimile or mail. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Questions regarding the NTE or on 
submitting comments in response to this 
notice should be directed to Yvonne 
Jamison at (202–395–3475). 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The NTE 
sets out an inventory of the most 
important foreign barriers affecting U.S. 
exports of goods and services, U.S. 
foreign direct investment, and 
protection of intellectual property 
rights. The inventory facilitates U.S. 
negotiations aimed at reducing or 
eliminating these barriers. The report 
also provides a valuable tool in 
enforcing U.S. trade laws and 
strengthening the rules-based trading 
system. The 2013 NTE Report may be 
found on USTR’s Internet Home Page 
(http://www.ustr.gov) under the tab 
‘‘Reports’’. To ensure compliance with 
the NTE’s statutory mandate and the 
Obama Administration’s commitment to 
focus on the most significant foreign 
trade barriers, USTR will be guided by 
the existence of active private sector 
interest in deciding which restrictions 
to include in the NTE. 

Topics on which the TPSC Seeks 
Information: To assist USTR in 
preparing the NTE, commenters should 
submit information related to one or 
more of the following categories of 
foreign trade barriers: 

(1) Import policies (e.g., tariffs and 
other import charges, quantitative 
restrictions, import licensing, and 
customs barriers); 

(2) Government procurement 
restrictions (e.g.,‘‘buy national policies’’ 
and closed bidding); 

(3) Export subsidies (e.g., export 
financing on preferential terms and 
agricultural export subsidies that 
displace U.S. exports in third country 
markets); 

(4) Lack of intellectual property 
protection (e.g., inadequate patent, 
copyright, and trademark regimes or 
enforcement issues); 

(5) Services barriers (e.g., limits on the 
range of financial services offered by 
foreign financial institutions, regulation 
of international data flows, restrictions 
on the use of data processing, quotas on 
imports of foreign films, and barriers to 
the provision of services by 
professionals); 

(6) Investment barriers (e.g., 
limitations on foreign equity 
participation and on access to foreign 
government-funded R&D consortia, local 
content, technology transfer and export 
performance requirements, and 
restrictions on repatriation of earnings, 
capital, fees, and royalties); 

(7) Government-tolerated 
anticompetitive conduct of state-owned 
or private firms that restrict the sale or 
purchase of U.S. goods or services in the 
foreign country’s markets; 

(8) Trade restrictions affecting 
electronic commerce (e.g., tariff and 
non-tariff measures, burdensome and 

discriminatory regulations and 
standards, and discriminatory taxation); 
and 

(9) Other barriers (e.g., barriers that 
encompass more than one category, 
such as bribery and corruption, or that 
affect a single sector). 

In addition, commenters are invited to 
identify those barriers covered in their 
submissions that may operate as 
‘‘localization barriers to trade’’. 
Localization barriers are measures 
designed to protect, favor, or stimulate 
domestic industries, services providers, 
and or intellectual property at the 
expense of goods services or intellectual 
property from other countries. For more 
information on localization barriers, 
please go to http://www.ustr.gov/trade- 
topics/localization-barriers. 

In responding to this notice, 
commenters should place particular 
emphasis on any practices that they 
believe may violate U.S. trade 
agreements. The TPSC is also interested 
in receiving new or updated information 
pertinent to the barriers covered in the 
2013 NTE as well as information on new 
barriers. Even if USTR does not include 
in the NTE information that it receives 
pursuant to this notice, it will maintain 
the information for potential use in 
future discussions or negotiations with 
trading partners. 

Estimate of Increase in Exports: Each 
comment should include an estimate of 
the potential increase in U.S. exports 
that would result from removing any 
foreign trade barrier the comment 
identifies, as well as a description of the 
methodology the commenter used to 
derive the estimate. Estimates should be 
expressed within the following value 
ranges: Less than $5 million; $5 to $25 
million; $25 million to $50 million; $50 
million to $100 million; $100 million to 
$500 million; or over $500 million. 
These estimates will help USTR 
conduct comparative analyses of a 
barrier’s effect over a range of 
industries. 

Requirements for Submissions: 
Commenters providing information on 
foreign trade barriers in more than one 
country should, whenever possible, 
provide a separate submission for each 
country. Comments addressing SPS or 
standards-related measures should not 
be submitted in response to this request 
but should be submitted in response to 
the separate request for comments 
which will be forthcoming. 

In order to ensure the timely receipt 
and consideration of comments, USTR 
strongly encourages commenters to 
make on-line submissions, using the 
http://www.regulations.gov Web site. 
Comments should be submitted under 
docket number USTR–2013–0027. 
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