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Funds Accounts. Other Federal agencies 
that make use of the data include the 
Council of Economic Advisers, the 
Agency for Healthcare Research and 
Quality, the Government Accountability 
Office, and the Department of Justice. 
State and local governments and related 
organizations, public policy groups, 
public interest groups, private research 
organizations, and private sector 
businesses also use these data. 

Statistics are produced as data files in 
electronic formats published to the 
Census website. 

II. Method of Collection 
These surveys use multiple modes for 

data collection with the main collection 
method being internet data collection 
with a mailed invitation, followed by 
email, mail, and telephone follow-ups. 
Other methods used to collect data and 
maximize response include collecting 
state and local government data through 
administrative records such as 
submitted financial audits, state 
financial reports, and annual 
comprehensive financial reports via 
electronic or mailed files and/or 
records. 

The Census Bureau developed central 
collection agreements with state and 
large local government officials to 
collect the data from their dependent 
agencies and report to the Census 
Bureau as a central respondent. These 
arrangements eliminate the need for a 
mail invitation for approximately 5,900 
governmental units in a sample year and 
32,000 during the year of the Census of 
Governments. The arrangements reduce 
burden by greatly decreasing the 
number of respondents who must 
complete an on-line response as the data 
are acquired from a centralized source 
instead of multiple sources. 

III. Data 
OMB Control Number: 0607–0585. 
Form Number(s): F–5, F–11, F–12, F– 

13, F–28, F–29, F–32, E–1, E–2, E–3, E– 
4, E–5, E–6, E–7, E–8, E–9, E–10. 

Type of Review: Regular submission, 
Request for an Extension, without 
Change, of a Currently Approved 
Collection. 

Affected Public: State and Local 
governments. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
For F-forms: 13,683, For E-forms: 
15,926/sample year. 

Estimated Time per Response: For F- 
forms: 2.97, For E-forms: .86 hours/ 
sample year. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: For F-forms: 40,613, For E-forms: 
13,693 hours/sample year. 

Estimated Total Annual Cost to 
Public: 0. (This is not the cost of 

respondents’ time, but the indirect costs 
respondents may incur for such things 
as purchases of specialized software or 
hardware needed to report, or 
expenditures for accounting or records 
maintenance services required 
specifically by the collection.) 

Respondent’s Obligation: Voluntary. 
Legal Authority: Title 13 U.S.C. 161 

and 182. 

IV. Request for Comments 
We are soliciting public comments to 

permit the Department/Bureau to: (a) 
Evaluate whether the proposed 
information collection is necessary for 
the proper functions of the Department, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; (b) Evaluate the 
accuracy of our estimate of the time and 
cost burden for this proposed collection, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
Evaluate ways to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information to 
be collected; and (d) Minimize the 
reporting burden on those who are to 
respond, including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

Comments that you submit in 
response to this notice are a matter of 
public record. We will include, or 
summarize, each comment in our 
request to OMB to approve this ICR. 
Before including your address, phone 
number, email address, or other 
personal identifying information in your 
comment, you should be aware that 
your entire comment—including your 
personal identifying information—may 
be made publicly available at any time. 
While you may ask us in your comment 
to withhold your personal identifying 
information from public review, we 
cannot guarantee that we will be able to 
do so. 

Sheleen Dumas, 
Department PRA Clearance Officer, Office of 
the Under Secretary for Economic Affairs, 
Commerce Department. 
[FR Doc. 2023–25733 Filed 11–20–23; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[B–58–2023] 

Foreign-Trade Zone (FTZ) 57, 
Notification of Proposed Production 
Activity; M&M Labs LLC; (Packaging of 
Nutritional Supplements and Skin Care 
Products); Mill Spring, North Carolina 

M&M Labs LLC submitted a 
notification of proposed production 
activity to the FTZ Board (the Board) for 

its facility in Mill Spring, North 
Carolina within FTZ 57. The 
notification conforming to the 
requirements of the Board’s regulations 
(15 CFR 400.22) was received on 
November 15, 2023. 

Pursuant to 15 CFR 400.14(b), FTZ 
production activity would be limited to 
the specific foreign-status material(s)/ 
component(s) and specific finished 
product(s) described in the submitted 
notification (summarized below) and 
subsequently authorized by the Board. 
The benefits that may stem from 
conducting production activity under 
FTZ procedures are explained in the 
background section of the Board’s 
website—accessible via www.trade.gov/ 
ftz. 

The proposed finished products 
include packaged nutritional 
supplements and packaged skin care 
products (duty rate ranges from duty- 
free to 6.4%). 

The proposed foreign-status materials 
and components include folding 
cardboard boxes; plastic components 
(bottles, lids, labels); silica gel desiccant 
packs; paper labels; glass components 
(bottles, spray bottles); metal lids; skin 
moisturizers; eye serums; night creams; 
scent sprayers; and, spraying 
apparatuses (duty rate ranges from duty- 
free to 6.5%). The request indicates that 
certain materials/components are 
subject to duties under section 301 of 
the Trade Act of 1974 (section 301), 
depending on the country of origin. The 
applicable section 301 decisions require 
subject merchandise to be admitted to 
FTZs in privileged foreign status (19 
CFR 146.41). 

Public comment is invited from 
interested parties. Submissions shall be 
addressed to the Board’s Executive 
Secretary and sent to: ftz@trade.gov. The 
closing period for their receipt is 
January 2, 2024. 

A copy of the notification will be 
available for public inspection in the 
‘‘Online FTZ Information System’’ 
section of the Board’s website. 

For further information, contact 
Juanita Chen at juanita.chen@trade.gov. 

Dated: November 16, 2023. 

Elizabeth Whiteman, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–25729 Filed 11–20–23; 8:45 am] 
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