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the Commission’s eFiling system at 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
efiling.asp. Commenters can submit 
brief comments up to 6,000 characters, 
without prior registration, using the 
eComment system at http://
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
ecomment.asp. You must include your 
name and contact information at the end 
of your comments. For assistance, 
please contact FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, (866) 
208–3676 (toll free), or (202) 502–8659 
(TTY). In lieu of electronic filing, please 
send a paper copy to: Secretary, Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426. 
The first page of any filing should 
include docket number P–2114–301. 
Comments emailed to Commission staff 
are not considered part of the 
Commission record. 

The Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure require all intervenors 
filing documents with the Commission 
to serve a copy of that document on 
each person whose name appears on the 
official service list for the project. 
Further, if an intervenor files comments 
or documents with the Commission 
relating to the merits of an issue that 
may affect the responsibilities of a 
particular resource agency, they must 
also serve a copy of the document on 
that resource agency. 

k. Description of Request: Grant PUD 
filed a six-year update to its Shoreline 
Management Plan (SMP) for the project, 
as required in the SMP approved by the 
Commission in 2013 under Article 419. 
Grant PUD proposes to refine allowable 
uses within each land-use classification, 
reclassify nine acres of shoreline land 
from Resource Management to Public 
Recreation Development, include a 
monitoring and compliance plan, and 
revise the schedule for updating the 
SMP to coordinate with the Recreation 
Resources Management Plan. 

l. Locations of the Application: A 
copy of the application is available for 
inspection and reproduction at the 
Commission’s Public Reference Room, 
located at 888 First Street NE, Room 2A, 
Washington, DC 20426, or by calling 
(202) 502–8371. This filing may also be 
viewed on the Commission’s website at 
http://www.ferc.gov using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link. Enter the docket 
number excluding the last three digits in 
the docket number field to access the 
document. You may also register online 
at http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
esubscription.asp to be notified via 
email of new filings and issuances 
related to this or other pending projects. 
For assistance, call 1–866–208–3676 or 
email FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, for 
TTY, call (202) 502–8659. A copy is also 

available for inspection and 
reproduction at the address in item (h) 
above. Agencies may obtain copies of 
the application directly from the 
applicant. 

m. Individuals desiring to be included 
on the Commission’s mailing list should 
so indicate by writing to the Secretary 
of the Commission. 

n. Comments, Protests, or Motions to 
Intervene: Anyone may submit 
comments, a protest, or a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214, 
respectively. In determining the 
appropriate action to take, the 
Commission will consider all protests or 
other comments filed, but only those 
who file a motion to intervene in 
accordance with the Commission’s 
Rules may become a party to the 
proceeding. Any comments, protests, or 
motions to intervene must be received 
on or before the specified comment date 
for the particular application. 

o. Filing and Service of Documents: 
Any filing must (1) bear in all capital 
letters the title ‘‘COMMENTS’’, 
‘‘PROTEST’’, or ‘‘MOTION TO 
INTERVENE’’ as applicable; (2) set forth 
in the heading the name of the applicant 
and the project number of the 
application to which the filing 
responds; (3) furnish the name, address, 
and telephone number of the person 
commenting, protesting or intervening; 
and (4) otherwise comply with the 
requirements of 18 CFR 385.2001 
through 385.2005. All comments, 
motions to intervene, or protests must 
set forth their evidentiary basis. Any 
filing made by an intervenor must be 
accompanied by proof of service on all 
persons listed in the service list 
prepared by the Commission in this 
proceeding, in accordance with 18 CFR 
385.2010. 

Dated: May 16, 2019. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2019–10741 Filed 5–22–19; 8:45 am] 
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and Asphalt Roofing Manufacturing 
(Renewal) 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA) has submitted an 
information collection request (ICR), 
NESHAP for Area Sources: Asphalt 
Processing and Asphalt Roofing 
Manufacturing (EPA ICR Number 
2352.05, OMB Control Number 2060– 
0634), to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) for review and approval 
in accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act. This is a proposed 
extension of the ICR, which is currently 
approved through May 31, 2019. Public 
comments were previously requested, 
via the Federal Register, on May 30, 
2018 during a 60-day comment period. 
This notice allows for an additional 30 
days for public comments. A fuller 
description of the ICR is given below, 
including its estimated burden and cost 
to the public. An agency may neither 
conduct nor sponsor, and a person is 
not required to respond to, a collection 
of information unless it displays a 
currently valid OMB control number. 
DATES: Additional comments may be 
submitted on or before June 24, 2019. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
referencing Docket ID Number EPA– 
HQ–OECA–2012–0496, to: (1) EPA 
online using www.regulations.gov (our 
preferred method), or by email to 
docket.oeca@epa.gov, or by mail to: EPA 
Docket Center, Environmental 
Protection Agency, Mail Code 28221T, 
1200 Pennsylvania Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC 20460; and (2) OMB via 
email to oira_submission@omb.eop.gov. 
Address comments to OMB Desk Officer 
for EPA. 

EPA’s policy is that all comments 
received will be included in the public 
docket without change, including any 
personal information provided, unless 
the comment includes profanity, threats, 
information claimed to be Confidential 
Business Information (CBI), or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Patrick Yellin, Monitoring, Assistance, 
and Media Programs Division, Office of 
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Compliance, Mail Code 2227A, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave. NW, Washington, DC 
20460; telephone number: (202) 564– 
2970; fax number: (202) 564–0050; 
email address: yellin.patrick@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Supporting documents, which explain 
in detail the information that the EPA 
will be collecting, are available in the 
public docket for this ICR. The docket 
can be viewed online at 
www.regulations.gov, or in person at the 
EPA Docket Center, WJC West, Room 
3334, 1301 Constitution Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC. The telephone number 
for the Docket Center is 202–566–1744. 
For additional information about EPA’s 
public docket, visit: http://
www.epa.gov/dockets. 

Abstract: The National Emission 
Standards for Hazardous Air Pollutants 
(NESHAP) for Area Sources: Asphalt 
Processing and Asphalt Roofing 
Manufacturing (40 CFR part 63, subpart 
AAAAAAA) were proposed on July 9, 
2009, promulgated on December 2, 
2009, and amended on March 18, 2010. 
These regulations apply to existing 
facilities and new facilities that are Area 
Sources and that either process asphalt 
or manufacture asphalt roofing 
products. New facilities include those 
that commenced construction, 
modification or reconstruction after the 
date of proposal. This information is 
being collected to assure compliance 
with 40 CFR part 63, subpart 
AAAAAAA. 

In general, all NESHAP standards 
require initial notifications, 
performance tests, and periodic reports 
by the owners/operators of the affected 
facilities. They are also required to 
maintain records of the occurrence and 
duration of any startup, shutdown, or 
malfunction in the operation of an 
affected facility, or any period during 
which the monitoring system is 
inoperative. These notifications, reports, 
and records are essential in determining 
compliance, and are required of all 
affected facilities subject to NESHAP. 

Form Numbers: None. 
Respondents/affected entities: 

Existing and new facilities that are area 
sources and that process asphalt or 
manufacture asphalt roofing products. 
New facilities include those that 
commenced construction, modification 
or reconstruction after the date of 
proposal. 

Respondent’s obligation to respond: 
Mandatory (40 CFR part 63, subpart 
AAAAAAA). 

Estimated number of respondents: 35 
(total). 

Frequency of response: Semiannually. 

Total estimated burden: 1,410 hours 
(per year). Burden is defined at 5 CFR 
1320.3(b). 

Total estimated cost: $161,000 (per 
year), which includes $525 in 
annualized capital/startup and/or 
operation & maintenance costs. 

Changes in the estimates: There is a 
decrease in hours in the total estimated 
respondent burden compared with the 
ICR currently-approved by OMB. This is 
due to a decrease in EPA’s estimate of 
the number of industry sources subject 
to this regulation, which is based on 
information collected during a recent 
analysis of asphalt processing and 
asphalt roofing major sources for a risk 
and technology review. The growth rate 
for the industry continues to be very 
low, negative or non-existent. 

Courtney Kerwin, 
Director, Regulatory Support Division. 
[FR Doc. 2019–10786 Filed 5–22–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 
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Request for Nominations of 
Candidates to the EPA’s Science 
Advisory Board (SAB) and SAB 
Standing Committees 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency (EPA) invites 
nominations of scientific experts from a 
diverse range of disciplines to be 
considered for appointment to the EPA 
Science Advisory Board (SAB) and four 
SAB committees described in this 
notice. Appointments will be 
announced by the Administrator and are 
anticipated to be filled by the start of 
Fiscal Year 2020 (October 2019). 
DATES: Nominations should be 
submitted in time to arrive no later than 
June 24, 2019. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background: The SAB is a chartered 
Federal Advisory Committee, 
established in 1978 under the authority 
of the Environmental Research, 
Development and Demonstration 
Authorization Act (ERDDAA), codified 
at 42 U.S.C. 4365, to provide 
independent scientific and technical 
peer review, consultation, advice and 
recommendations to the EPA 
Administrator on the scientific bases for 
EPA’s actions and programs. Members 
of the SAB constitute distinguished 
bodies of non-EPA scientists, engineers, 

economists, and behavioral scientists 
who are nationally and internationally 
recognized experts in their respective 
fields. Members are appointed by the 
EPA Administrator for a three-year term 
and serve as Special Government 
Employees who provide independent 
expert advice to the agency. Additional 
information about the SAB is available 
at http://www.epa.gov/sab. 

Expertise Sought for the SAB: The 
chartered SAB provides strategic advice 
to the EPA Administrator on a variety of 
EPA science and research programs. All 
the work of SAB committees and panels 
is conducted under the auspices of the 
chartered SAB. The chartered SAB 
reviews all SAB committee and panel 
draft reports and determines whether 
they are appropriate to send to the EPA 
Administrator. The SAB Staff Office 
invites the nomination of experts to 
serve on the chartered SAB in the 
following scientific disciplines as they 
relate to human health and the 
environment: Analytical chemistry; 
benefit-cost analysis; causal inference; 
complex systems; ecological sciences 
and ecological assessment; economics; 
engineering; forestry geochemistry; 
health sciences; hydrology; 
hydrogeology; medicine; microbiology; 
modeling; pediatrics; public health; risk 
assessment; social, behavioral and 
decision sciences; statistics; toxicology; 
epidemiology; and uncertainty analysis. 

The SAB Staff Office is especially 
interested in scientists in the disciplines 
described above who have knowledge 
and experience in air quality; 
agricultural sciences; atmospheric 
sciences; benefit-cost analysis; complex 
systems; drinking water; energy and the 
environment; epidemiological risk 
analyses; dose-response, exposure, and 
physiologically based pharmacokinetic 
(PBPK) modeling; water quality; water 
quantity and reuse; ecosystem services; 
community environmental health; 
sustainability; chemical safety; green 
chemistry; and waste management. For 
further information about the chartered 
SAB membership appointment process 
and schedule, please contact Dr. 
Thomas Armitage, DFO, by telephone at 
(202) 564–2155 or by email at 
armitage.thomas@epa.gov. 

The SAB Staff Office is also seeking 
nominations of experts for possible 
vacancies on four SAB standing 
committees: The Agricultural Science 
Committee, the Chemical Assessment 
Advisory Committee; the Drinking 
Water Committee; and the Radiation 
Advisory Committee. 

(1) The SAB Agricultural Science 
Committee (ASC) provides advice to the 
chartered SAB on matters that have 
been determined to have a significant 
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