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DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory
Commission

[Docket No. RP00–468–001]

Texas Eastern Transmission, LP;
Notice of Compliance Filing

August 7, 2001.

Take notice that on July 31, 2001,
Texas Eastern Transmission, LP (Texas
Eastern) tendered for filing pro forma
tariff sheets in compliance with Order
No. 637 and in conformance with order
of the Commission issued in the
captioned docket on June 12, 2001.

Texas Eastern states that the purpose
of this filing is to comply with the
requirement of Order No. 637 et seq. to
file pro forma tariff sheets for the
purpose of implementing certain tariff
changes relating to scheduling
procedures, capacity segmentation,
imbalance management, and penalties,
or to explain why the Order No. 637
requirements do not apply to the
pipeline’s tariff and operating practices
and with the Commission’s June 12,
2001 order to refile, as appropriate,
Order No. 637 pro forma tariff sheets.

Texas Eastern states that copies of its
filing have been mailed to all affected
customers and interested state
commissions.

Any person desiring to protest said
filing should file a protest with the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission,
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC
20426, in accordance with Section
385.211 of the Commission’s Rules and
Regulations. All such protests must be
filed in accordance with Section
154.210 of the Commission’s
Regulations. Protests will be considered
by the Commission in determining the
appropriate action to be taken, but will
not serve to make protestants parties to
the proceedings. Copies of this filing are
on file with the Commission and are
available for public inspection. This
filing may also be viewed on the web at
http://www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘RIMS’’
link, select ‘‘Docket #’’ and follow the
instructions (call 202–208–2222 for
assistance). Comments, protests and
interventions may be filed electronically
via the Internet in lieu of paper. See, 18
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the
instructions on the Commission’s web
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link.

David P. Boergers,
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 01–20243 Filed 8–10–01; 8:45 am]

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory
Commission

[Docket No. EG99–69–000, et al.]

Elwood Energy LLC, et al.; Electric
Rate and Corporate Regulation Filings

August 6, 2001.
Take notice that the following filings

have been made with the Commission:

1. Elwood Energy LLC

[Docket No. EG99–69–000]
Take notice that on August 1, 2001,

Elwood Energy LLC (Elwood) filed with
the Federal Energy Regulatory
Commission an application for
redetermination of exempt wholesale
generator status pursuant to Part 365 of
the Commission’s regulations.

Elwood, Elwood Energy II, LLC
(Elwood II) and Elwood Energy III, LLC
(Elwood III) are all exempt wholesale
generators owned 50%, directly or
indirectly, by subsidiaries (Dominion
Entities) of Dominion Resources, Inc.
(Dominion), a public utility holding
company registered under the 1935 Act,
and 50% by subsidiaries (PEC Entities)
of Peoples Energy Corporation (PEC), an
exempt public utility holding company
under the 1935 Act. The mergers of
Elwood II, LLC and Elwood III, LLC,
with and into Elwood as the surviving
entity, and certain related mergers
among the Dominion Entities and
among the PEC Entities (collectively, the
Mergers) were authorized by the
Commission in its July 20, 2001 Order
Authorizing Disposition of
Jurisdictional Facilities and Corporate
Reorganization in Docket No. ER01–
121–000. Upon completion of the
Mergers, Elwood will be owned 50% by
Dominion Elwood, Inc., a Delaware
corporation, a wholly-owned subsidiary
of Dominion Energy, Inc. which, in turn,
is a wholly-owned subsidiary of
Dominion, and 50% by Peoples Elwood,
LLC, a wholly-owned subsidiary of
PERC Power, Inc., which, in turn, is a
wholly-owned subsidiary of Peoples
Energy Resources Corp., which, in turn,
is a wholly-owned subsidiary of PEC.

Upon completion of the Mergers,
Elwood will own, in addition to the
generation facilities it owned before the
Mergers, those generation facilities
formerly owned by Elwood II and
Elwood III, all of which previously have
been determined by the Commission to
eligible facilities in connection with its
orders determining Elwood, Elwood II
and Elwood III to be exempt wholesale
generators. Elwood also will own
interconnection facilities, including
generator leads, step up transformers

and associated circuit breakers, used
solely for interconnection with the
transmission system of Commonwealth
Edison Company.

Comment date: August 27, 2001, in
accordance with Standard Paragraph E
at the end of this notice. The
Commission will limit its consideration
of comments to those that concern the
adequacy or accuracy of the application.

2. Dominion North Star Generation,
Inc.

[Docket No. EG01–272–000]

Take notice that on August 1, 2001,
Dominion North Star Generation, Inc.
(Dominion North Star) filed with the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission
an application for determination of
exempt wholesale generator status
pursuant to Part 365 of the
Commission’s regulations.

Dominion North Star, a Delaware
corporation, is a wholly owned
subsidiary of Dominion Energy, Inc.,
which in turn is a wholly owned
subsidiary of Dominion Resources, Inc.

Dominion North Star will, through its
affiliate North Star Generation, LLC, be
exclusively engaged in the business of
owning, operating and selling electricity
exclusively at wholesale from an
electric generating facility located in
North Star Township, Gratiot County,
Michigan. The Facility will consist of
three gas-fired GE 7FA turbine generator
sets and related ancillary equipment
and structures and will have a
combined nominal rating of
approximately 510 MW. The Facility
will also include as yet undetermined
transmission interconnection facilities.
The facility will be interconnected with
the transmission system of the Michigan
Electric Transmission Company.

Comment date: August 27, 2001, in
accordance with Standard Paragraph E
at the end of this notice. The
Commission will limit its consideration
of comments to those that concern the
adequacy or accuracy of the application.

3. Dominion North Star Generation,
Inc.

[Docket No. EG01–273–000]

Take notice that on August 1, 2001,
Dominion North Star Generation, Inc.
(Dominion North Star) filed with the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission
an application for determination of
exempt wholesale generator status
pursuant to Part 365 of the
Commission’s regulations.

Dominion North Star, a Delaware
corporation, is a wholly owned
subsidiary of Dominion Energy, Inc.,
which in turn is a wholly owned
subsidiary of Dominion Resources, Inc.
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