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DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND 
URBAN DEVELOPMENT 

24 CFR Part 232 

[Docket No. FR 6022–C–02] 

RIN 2502–AJ46 

Federal Housing Administration (FHA): 
Section 232 Healthcare Facility 
Insurance Program—Memory Care 
Residents; Correction 

AGENCY: Office of the Assistant 
Secretary for Housing, HUD. 
ACTION: Proposed rule; correction. 

SUMMARY: On September 13, 2019, HUD 
published a proposed rule regarding its 
Section 232 Healthcare Facility 
Insurance Program. This document 
corrects the preamble to the proposed 
rule by revising an incorrect footnote 
and providing citations for three other 
footnotes. 

DATES: This correction is effective 
September 26, 2019. The public 
comment due date remains November 
12, 2019. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
With respect to this supplementary 
document, contact Aaron Santa Anna, 
Acting Associate General Counsel for 
Legislation and Regulations, Department 
of Housing and Urban Development, 
451 7th Street SW, Room 10238, 
Washington, DC 20410; telephone 
number 202–708–1793 (this is not a toll- 
free number). Persons with hearing or 
speech impairments may access this 
number through TTY by calling the toll- 
free Federal Relay at 800–877–8339 (this 
is a toll-free number). 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Correction 

In proposed rule FR Doc. 2019–19778, 
beginning on page 48321 in the issue of 
September 13, 2019, make the following 
corrections, in the Supplementary 
Information section. 

1. On page 48322 in the 1st column, 
revise footnote 3 to read as follows: 

‘‘3 Overview of Assisted Living, 
published by the American Association 
of Homes and Services for the Aging, 
American Seniors Housing Association, 
Assisted Living Federation of American, 
National Center for Assisted Living, and 
National Investment Center for the 
Seniors Housing & Care Industry (2009). 
https://www.ahcancal.org/ncal/facts/ 
Documents/09%202009%20Overview%
20of%20Assisted%20
Living%20FINAL.pdf.’’ 

2. On page 48322 in the 1st column, 
add footnote 4 to read as follows: 

‘‘4 Long-Term Care Services in the 
United States: 2013 Overview Vital and 

Heath Statistics, Series 2, no 37 Center 
for Disease Control and Prevention, 
National Center for Health Statistics, U. 
S. Department of Health and Human 
Services p. 39 https://www.cdc.gov/ 
nchs/data/nsltcp/long_term_care_
services_2013.pdf.’’ 

3. On page 48322 in the 2nd column, 
add footnote 5 to read as follows: 

‘‘5 42 CFR 483.90(e). https://
www.govinfo.gov/content/pkg/CFR- 
2017-title42-vol5/pdf/CFR-2017-title42- 
vol5-sec483-90.pdf.’’ 

4. On page 48322 in the 2nd column, 
add footnote 6 to read as follows: 

‘‘6 Compendium of Residential Care 
and Assisted Living Regulations and 
Policy: 2015 Edition06/15/2015, Office 
of The Assistant Secretary for Planning 
and Evaluation, U.S. Department of 
Health & Human Services, https://
aspe.hhs.gov/basic-report/compendium- 
residential-care-and-assisted-living- 
regulations-and-policy-2015-edition.’’ 

Dated: September 20, 2019. 
Aaron Santa Anna, 
Acting Associate General Counsel for 
Legislation and Regulations. 
[FR Doc. 2019–20834 Filed 9–25–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4210–67–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Office of the Secretary 

32 CFR Part 199 

[Docket ID: DOD–2019–HA–0090] 

RIN 0720–AB76 

TRICARE; Reserve and Guard Family 
Member Benefits; Early Eligibility 
TRICARE and Transitional Assistance 
Management Program for Certain 
Reserve Component Members; 
Extended TRICARE Program Coverage 
for Certain National Guard Members 

ACTION: Proposed rule. 

SUMMARY: This rulemaking proposes 
changes to implement provisions of the 
National Defense Authorization Act for 
Fiscal Year 2017 (NDAA–17) to 
continue TRICARE program coverage for 
certain members of the National Guard 
and their dependents during certain 
disaster response duty. This applies 
discretionary authority broadened by 
NDAA–17 to propose expansion of the 
TRICARE Reserve and Guard Family 
Benefits program to all families of 
Reserve Component (RC) members on 
active duty for more than 30 days, 
except for the families of RC members 
performing active Guard and Reserve 
(AGR) duty for a period of 180 
consecutive days or more. This 

rulemaking also proposes to expand 
both early eligibility TRICARE coverage 
and Transitional Assistance 
Management Program (TAMP) coverage 
to RC members on active duty for some 
pre-planned missions. 
DATES: Written comments received at 
the address indicated in the ADDRESSES 
section by November 25, 2019 will be 
accepted. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by docket number and/or 
Regulation Identifier Number (RIN) 
number and title, by any of the 
following methods: 

Federal eRulemaking Portal: http://
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

Mail: Department of Defense, Office of 
the Chief Management Officer, 
Directorate for Oversight and 
Compliance, 4800 Mark Center Drive, 
Mailbox #24, Suite 08D09, Alexandria, 
VA 22350–1700. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name and 
docket number or RIN for this Federal 
Register document. The general policy 
for comments and other submissions 
from members of the public is to make 
these submissions available for public 
viewing at http://www.regulations.gov 
as they are received without change, 
including any personal identifiers or 
contact information. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Brian Smith, Defense Health Agency, 
TRICARE Health Plan, telephone (303) 
676–3729. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Introduction and Background 
Guardsmen on full-time National 

Guard duty under § 502(f) of 32 U.S.C. 
502(f) who were called to state active 
duty (SAD) for disaster response duty, 
lost their premium-free TRICARE 
coverage. This rule implements 
authority under 10 U.S.C. 1076f (added 
by § 711 of NDAA–17 (Pub. L. 114–328)) 
and proposes to continue TRICARE 
coverage to these members of the 
National Guard (NG) and their eligible 
family members, upon request of the 
state/territory on a fully reimbursable 
basis. The TRICARE Guard and Reserve 
Family Benefits (TRGFB) program has 
successfully eased the transition for RC 
families to and from TRICARE since its 
inception under demonstration 
authority in September 2001. Section 
748(b) of NDAA–17 extends TRGFB to 
eligible family members of any RC 
member who is on active duty for more 
than 30 days, amending prior legislation 
that required the active duty be in 
support of a contingency operation. 
Transition has also been eased by early 
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