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DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Farm Service Agency 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

January 15, 2016. 
The Department of Agriculture has 

submitted the following information 
collection requirement(s) to OMB for 
review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. Comments are 
required regarding (1) Whether the 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; (2) the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of burden including 
the validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; (3) ways to enhance 
the quality, utility and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (4) 
ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

Comments regarding this information 
collection received by February 22, 2016 
will be considered. Written comments 
should be addressed to: Desk Officer for 
Agriculture, Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB), New 
Executive Office Building, 725–17th 
Street NW., Washington, DC 20502. 
Commenters are encouraged to submit 
their comments to OMB via email to: 
OIRA_Submission@OMB.EOP.GOV or 
fax (202) 395–5806 and to Departmental 
Clearance Office, USDA, OCIO, Mail 
Stop 7602, Washington, DC 20250– 
7602. Copies of the submission(s) may 
be obtained by calling (202) 720–8958. 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 

displays a currently valid OMB control 
number and the agency informs 
potential persons who are to respond to 
the collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 
the collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Farm Service Agency 
Title: 7 CFR 764, Direct Loan Making. 
OMB Control Number: 0560–0237. 
Summary of Collection: The Farm 

Loan Program (FLP) provides loans to 
family farmers to purchase real estate 
and equipment and finance agricultural 
production. The regulation covered by 
this collection describes the policies 
and procedures the agency uses to 
provide supervised credit to FLP 
applicants requesting direct loan 
assistance in accordance with the 
provisions of the Consolidated Farm 
and Rural Development Act (7 U.S.C. 
1921) (Pub. L. 87–128), as amended. 
Authority to establish the regulatory 
requirements contained in 7 CFR 764, is 
provided under 5 U.S.C. 301, which 
provides that ‘‘The Head of an Executive 
department or military department may 
prescribe regulations for the government 
of his department, the distribution and 
performance of its business . . .’’ The 
Secretary delegated authority to 
administer the provisions of the Act 
applicable to the Farm Loan Program 
(FLP) to the Under Secretary for Farm 
and Foreign Agricultural Service in 
section 2.16 of 7 CFR part 2. FLP 
provides loans to family farmers to 
purchase real estate equipment and 
finance agricultural production. 

Need and Use of the Information: 
Information is submitted by the 
applicants to the local agency office 
serving the county in which their 
business is headquartered. The 
information is necessary to thoroughly 
evaluate the applicant’s request for a 
direct loan and is used by agency 
officials to: (1) Ensure that cash flow 
projections used in determining loan 
repayment are based on the actual 
production history of the operation, (2) 
Ensure that a loan is adequately 
secured. (3) Ensure the applicant meets 
the statutorily established program 
eligibility requirements, and (4) Obtain 
assignment on income or sales proceeds, 
when appropriate, to ensure timely 
repayment of the loans. Since the 
agency is mandated to provide 
supervised credit, failure to collect the 

information, or collecting it less 
frequently, could result in the failure of 
the farm operation or loss of agency 
security property. 

Description of Respondents: Business 
or other for-profit; Farms. 

Number of Respondents: 183,433. 
Frequency of Responses: Reporting: 

On occasion; Annually. 
Total Burden Hours: 345,484. 

Ruth Brown, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2016–01254 Filed 1–21–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–05–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Food and Nutrition Service 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

January 15, 2016. 
The Department of Agriculture has 

submitted the following information 
collection requirement(s) to OMB for 
review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. Comments are 
requested regarding (1) Whether the 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; (2) the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of burden including 
the validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; (3) ways to enhance 
the quality, utility and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (4) 
ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

Comments regarding this information 
collection received by February 22, 2016 
will be considered. Written comments 
should be addressed to: Desk Officer for 
Agriculture, Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB), OIRA_
Submission@omb.eop.gov or fax (202) 
395–5806 and to Departmental 
Clearance Office, USDA, OCIO, Mail 
Stop 7602, Washington, DC 20250– 
7602. Copies of the submission(s) may 
be obtained by calling (202) 720–8958. 
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An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number and the agency informs 
potential persons who are to respond to 
the collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 
the collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Food and Nutrition Service 

Title: Supplemental Nutrition 
Assistance Program Forms: 
Applications, Periodic Reporting, and 
Notices. 

OMB Control Number: 0584–0064. 
Summary of Collection: The Food and 

Nutrition Act of 2008 (the Act), as 
amended, specifies national eligibility 
standards and imposes certain 
administrative requirements on State 
agencies in administering the program. 
Information must be collected from 
households to assure that they are 
eligible for the program and that they 
receive the correct amount of 
Supplemental Nutrition Assistance 
Program (SNAP) benefits. Information 
collected is limited to that necessary for 
the administration and enforcement of 
the SNAP Program. The Federal 
procedures for implementing the 
application and certification procedures 
in the Act are in Parts 271, 272, and 273 
of the Title 7 of the Code of Federal 
Register. 

Need and Use of the Information: FNS 
will collect information to determine 
the eligibility of households for the 
SNAP program and to determine the 
correct benefit levels for eligible 
households. If information is not 
collected to certify households in 
accordance with the Act or changing the 
frequency of information or reporting 
requirements as they relate to the 
application, certification, and continue 
eligibility of households would result in 
a direct violation of the Act and its 
implementing regulations. Further, 
benefits could be overissued or 
underissued for a long period of time if 
necessary information is not collected or 
actions are not taken timely. 

Description of Respondents: State, 
Local, and Tribal Government; 
Individuals or household. 

Number of Respondents: 14,622,419. 
Frequency of Responses: 

Recordkeeping; Reporting: On occasion; 
Monthly; Quarterly. 

Total Burden Hours: 118,221,440. 

Ruth Brown, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2016–01256 Filed 1–21–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–30–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Forest Service 

Gallatin County Resource Advisory 
Committee 

AGENCY: Forest Service, USDA. 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Gallatin County Resource 
Advisory Committee (RAC) will meet in 
Bozeman, MT. The committee is 
authorized under the Secure Rural 
Schools and Community Self- 
Determination Act (the Act) and 
operates in compliance with the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act. The purpose 
of the committee is to improve 
collaborative relationships and to 
provide advice and recommendations to 
the Forest Service concerning projects 
and funding consistent with Title II of 
the Act. Additional RAC information, 
including the meeting agenda and the 
meeting summary/minutes can be found 
at the following Web site: http://www.fs.
usda.gov/detail/custergallatin/working
together/?cid=stelprdb5304491. 
DATES: The meeting will be held March 
10 from 12:30–5:30 p.m. 

All RAC meetings are subject to 
cancellation. For status of meeting prior 
to attendance, please contact the person 
listed under FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT. 

ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held at 
the Bozeman Public Library, Small 
Community Room, 626 E Main St. 
Bozeman, MT 59715. 

Written comments may be submitted 
as described under SUPPLEMENTARY 
INFORMATION. All comments, including 
names and addresses when provided, 
are placed in the record and are 
available for public inspection and 
copying. The public may inspect 
comments received at Custer Gallatin 
National Forest Supervisors Office, 10 E 
Babcock, Bozeman, MT 59105. Please 
call ahead to facilitate entry into the 
building. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Mariah Leuschen-Lonergan, Public 
Affairs Specialist and RAC Coordinator 
by phone at 406–587–6735 or via email 
at mdleuschen@fs.fed.us. 

Individuals who use 
telecommunication devices for the deaf 
(TDD) may call the Federal Information 

Relay Service (FIRS) at 1–800–877–8339 
between 8:00 a.m. and 8:00 p.m., 
Eastern Standard Time, Monday 
through Friday. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
purpose of the meeting is: 

1. Review and recommend 2016 
project proposals to Designated Federal 
Official. 

The meeting is open to the public. 
The agenda will include time for people 
to make oral statements of three minutes 
or less. Individuals wishing to make an 
oral statement should request in writing 
by February 19 to be scheduled on the 
agenda. Anyone who would like to 
bring related matters to the attention of 
the committee may file written 
statements with the committee staff 
before or after the meeting. Written 
comments and requests for time for oral 
comments must be sent to Attn: Mariah 
Leuschen, RAC Coordinator, 10 E 
Babcock, Bozeman, MT 59105 or by 
email to mdleuschen@fs.fed.us or via 
facsimile to 406–587–6758. 

Meeting Accommodations: If you are 
a person requiring reasonable 
accommodation, please make requests 
in advance for sign language 
interpreting, assistive listening devices 
or other reasonable accommodation for 
access to the facility or proceedings by 
contactingthe person listed in the 
section titled FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT. All reasonable 
accommodation requests are managed 
on a case by case basis. 

Dated: January 11, 2016. 
Mary C. Erickson, 
Custer Gallatin Forest Supervisor. 
[FR Doc. 2016–01241 Filed 1–21–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3411–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Forest Service 

El Dorado County Resource Advisory 
Committee 

AGENCY: Forest Service, USDA. 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: The El Dorado County 
Resource Advisory Committee (RAC) 
will meet in Placerville, California. The 
committee is authorized under the 
Secure Rural Schools and Community 
Self-Determination Act (Pub. L. 110– 
343) (the Act) and operates in 
compliance with the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act. The purpose of the 
committee is to improve collaborative 
relationships and to provide advice and 
recommendations to the Forest Service 
concerning projects and funding 
consistent with the title II of the Act. 
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