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point of view, and, when Commission 
attorneys are appointed, no attorney- 
client relationship is established. 
Section II also establishes comment 
deadline(s) pertaining to each such 
request. 

The Commission invites comments on 
whether the Postal Service’s request(s) 
identified in Section II, if any, are 
consistent with the policies of title 39. 
Applicable statutory and regulatory 
requirements include 39 U.S.C. 3632, 39 
U.S.C. 3633, 39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR 
part 3035, and 39 CFR part 3041. 
Comment deadline(s) for each such 
request, if any, appear in Section II. 

Section III identifies the docket 
number(s) associated with each Postal 
Service request, if any, to add a 
standardized distinct product to the 
Competitive product list or to amend a 
standardized distinct product, the title 
of each such request, the request’s 
acceptance date, and the authority cited 
by the Postal Service for each request. 
Standardized distinct products are 
negotiated service agreements that are 
variations of one or more Competitive 
products, and for which financial 
models, minimum rates, and 
classification criteria have undergone 
advance Commission review. See 39 
CFR 3041.110(n); 39 CFR 3041.205(a). 
Such requests are reviewed in summary 
proceedings pursuant to 39 CFR 
3041.325(c)(2) and 39 CFR 
3041.505(f)(1). Pursuant to 39 CFR 
3041.405(c)-(d), the Commission does 
not appoint a Public Representative or 
request public comment in proceedings 
to review such requests. 

II. Public Proceeding(s) 
1. Docket No(s).: CP2024–141; Filing 

Title: USPS Request Concerning 
Amendment One to Priority Mail 
Express, Priority Mail & USPS Ground 
Advantage Contract 39, with Materials 
Filed Under Seal; Filing Acceptance 
Date: June 6, 2025; Filing Authority: 39 
CFR 3035.105 and 39 CFR 3041.505; 
Public Representative: Philip Abraham; 
Comments Due: June 16, 2025. 

2. Docket No(s).: MC2025–1498 and 
K2025–1493; Filing Title: USPS Request 
to Add Priority Mail & USPS Ground 
Advantage Contract 777 to the 
Competitive Product List and Notice of 
Filing Materials Under Seal; Filing 
Acceptance Date: June 6, 2025; Filing 

Authority: 39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR 
3035.105, and 39 CFR 3041.310; Public 
Representative: Samuel Robinson; 
Comments Due: June 16, 2025. 

3. Docket No(s).: MC2025–1499 and 
K2025–1494; Filing Title: USPS Request 
to Add Priority Mail Contract 874 to the 
Competitive Product List and Notice of 
Filing Materials Under Seal; Filing 
Acceptance Date: June 6, 2025; Filing 
Authority: 39 U.S.C. 3642, 39 CFR 
3035.105, and 39 CFR 3041.310; Public 
Representative: Jennaca Upperman; 
Comments Due: June 16, 2025. 

III. Summary Proceeding(s) 

None. See Section II for public 
proceedings. 

This Notice will be published in the 
Federal Register. 

Erica A. Barker, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–10756 Filed 6–12–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7710–FW–P 

RAILROAD RETIREMENT BOARD 

Agency Forms Submitted for OMB 
Review, Request for Comments 

In accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 
chapter 35), the Railroad Retirement 
Board (RRB) is forwarding an 
Information Collection Request (ICR) to 
the Office of Information and Regulatory 
Affairs (OIRA), Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB). Our ICR describes 
the information we seek to collect from 
the public. Review and approval by 
OIRA ensures that we impose 
appropriate paperwork burdens. 

The RRB invites comments on the 
proposed collections of information to 
determine (1) the practical utility of the 
collections; (2) the accuracy of the 
estimated burden of the collections; (3) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information that is the 
subject of collection; and (4) ways to 
minimize the burden of collections on 
respondents, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
Comments to the RRB or OIRA must 
contain the OMB control number of the 
ICR. For proper consideration of your 
comments, it is best if the RRB and 

OIRA receive them within 30 days of 
the publication date. 

1. Title and purpose of information 
collection: Application for Benefits Due 
but Unpaid at Death; OMB 3220–0055. 

Under Section 2(g) of the Railroad 
Unemployment Insurance Act (45 
U.S.C. 352), benefits that accrued but 
were not paid because of the death of 
the employee shall be paid to the same 
individual(s) to whom benefits are 
payable under Section 6(a)(1) of the 
Railroad Retirement Act. The provisions 
relating to the payment of such benefits 
are prescribed in 20 CFR 325.5 and 20 
CFR 335.5. 

The RRB provides Form UI–63, 
Application for Benefits Due But 
Unpaid at Death, to those applying for 
the accrued sickness or unemployment 
benefits unpaid at the death of the 
employee and for obtaining the 
information needed to identify the 
proper payee. One response is requested 
of each respondent. Completion is 
required to obtain a benefit. 

Previous Requests for Comments: The 
RRB has already published the initial 
60-day notice (90 FR 15373 on April 10, 
2025) required by 44 U.S.C. 3506(c)(2). 
That request elicited no comments. 

Information Collection Request (ICR) 

Title: Application for Benefits Due but 
Unpaid at Death. 

OMB Control Number: 3220–0055. 
Form(s) submitted: UI–63. 
Type of request: Reinstatement with 

change of a previously approved 
collection. 

Affected public: Individuals or 
Households. 

Abstract: The collection obtains the 
information needed by the Railroad 
Retirement Board to pay benefits 
accrued under section 2(g) of the 
Railroad Unemployment Insurance Act 
but not paid because of the death of the 
employee. 

Changes proposed: The RRB proposes 
the following changes to Form UI–63: 

• On the cover letter, removed ‘‘his or 
her’’ and replaced with ‘‘their’’ in 
second sentence and 

• On the second page, field 4, added 
‘‘Telephone No.’’ column. 

The burden estimate for the ICR is as 
follows: 

Form No. Annual 
responses 

Time 
(minutes) 

Burden 
(hours) 

UI–63 ........................................................................................................................................... 30 7 4 
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2. Title and purpose of information 
collection: Employee’s Certification; 
OMB 3220–0140. 

Section 2 of the Railroad Retirement 
Act (RRA) (45 U.S.C. 231a), provides for 
the payment of an annuity to the spouse 
or divorced spouse of a retired railroad 
employee. For the spouse or divorced 
spouse to qualify for an annuity, the 
RRB must determine if any of the 
employee’s current marriage to the 
applicant is valid. 

The requirements for obtaining 
documentary evidence to determine 
valid marital relationships are 
prescribed in 20 CFR 219.30 through 
219.35. Section 2(e) of the RRA requires 
that an employee must relinquish all 
rights to any railroad employer service 
before a spouse annuity can be paid. 

The RRB uses Form G–346, 
Employee’s Certification, to obtain the 
information needed to determine 
whether the employee’s current 
marriage is valid. Form G–346 is 
completed by the retired employee who 
is the husband or wife of the applicant 
for a spouse annuity. Completion is 
required to obtain a benefit. One 

response is requested of each 
respondent. The RRB proposes no 
changes to Form G–346 or Form G– 
346sum. 

Consistent with 20 CFR 217.17, the 
RRB uses Form G–346sum, Employee’s 
Certification Summary, which mirrors 
the information collected on Form G– 
346, when an employee, after being 
interviewed by an RRB field office 
representative ‘‘signs’’ the form using an 
alternative signature method known as 
‘‘attestation.’’ Attestation refers to the 
action taken by the RRB field office 
representative to confirm and annotate 
the RRB’s records of the applicant’s 
affirmation under penalty of perjury that 
the information provided is correct and 
the applicant’s agreement to sign the 
form by proxy. Completion is required 
to obtain a benefit. One response is 
requested of each respondent. 

Previous Requests for Comments: The 
RRB has already published the initial 
60-day notice (90 FR 15374 on April 10, 
2025) required by 44 U.S.C. 3506(c)(2). 
That request elicited no comments. 

Information Collection Request (ICR) 
Title: Employee’s Certification. 

OMB Control Number: 3220–0140. 
Forms submitted: G–346 and G– 

346sum. 
Type of request: Reinstatement with 

change of a previously approved 
collection. 

Affected public: Individuals or 
Households. 

Abstract: Under Section 2 of the 
Railroad Retirement Act, spouses of 
retired railroad employees may be 
entitled to an annuity. The collection 
obtains information from the employee 
about the employee’s previous 
marriages, if any, to determine if any 
impediment exists to the marriage 
between the employee and his or her 
spouse. 

Changes proposed: The RRB proposes 
minor changes to Form G–346 
certification statement on page 2 and 
Paperwork Reduction Act Notice 
contact information on page 3. The RRB 
proposes no changes to Form G– 
346sum. 

The burden estimate for the ICR is as 
follows: 

Form No. Annual 
responses 

Time 
(minutes) 

Burden 
(hours) 

G–346 .......................................................................................................................................... 2,060 5 172 
G–346sum ................................................................................................................................... 1,960 5 163 

Total ...................................................................................................................................... 4,020 ........................ 335 

3. Title and purpose of information 
collection: RUIA Claims Notification 
and Verification System; OMB 3220– 
0171. 

Section 5(b) of the Railroad 
Unemployment Insurance Act (RUIA) 
(45 U.S.C. 355), requires that effective 
January 1, 1990, when a claim for 
benefits is filed with the Railroad 
Retirement Board (RRB), the RRB shall 
provide notice of the claim to the 
claimant’s base year employer(s) to 
provide them an opportunity to submit 
information relevant to the claim before 
making an initial determination. If the 
RRB determines to pay benefits to the 
claimant under the RUIA, the RRB shall 
notify the base-year employer(s). 

The purpose of the RUIA Claims 
Notification and Verification System is 
to provide two notices, pre-payment 
Form ID–4K, Prepayment Notice of 
Employees’ Applications and Claims for 
Benefits Under the Railroad 
Unemployment Insurance Act, and post- 
payment Form ID–4E, Notice of RUIA 
Claim Determination. Prepayment Form 
ID–4K provides notice to a claimant’s 
base-year employer(s), of each 

unemployment application and 
unemployment and sickness claim filed 
for benefits under the RUIA and 
provides the employer an opportunity to 
convey information relevant to the 
proper adjudication of the claim. 

The railroad employer can elect to 
receive Form ID–4K by one of three 
options: a computer-generated paper 
notice, by Electronic Data Interchange 
(EDI), or online via the RRB’s Employer 
Reporting System (ERS). The railroad 
employer can respond to the ID–4K 
notice by telephone, manually by 
mailing a completed ID–4K back to the 
RRB, or electronically via EDI or ERS. 

Once the RRB determines to pay a 
claim post-payment Form Letter ID–4E, 
Notice of RUIA Claim Determination, is 
used to notify the base-year employer(s). 
This gives the employer a second 
opportunity to challenge the claim for 
benefits. 

The ID–4E mainframe-generated 
paper notice, EDI, and internet versions 
are transmitted on a daily basis, 
generally on the same day that the 
claims are approved for payment. 
Railroad employers who are mailed 

Form ID–4E are instructed to write if 
they want a reconsideration of the RRB’s 
determination to pay. Employers who 
receive the ID–4E electronically, may 
file a reconsideration request by 
completing the ID–4E by either EDI or 
ERS. Completion is voluntary. 

Previous Requests for Comments: The 
RRB has already published the initial 
60-day notice (90 FR 15374 on April 10, 
2025) required by 44 U.S.C. 3506(c)(2). 
That request elicited no comments. 

Information Collection Request (ICR) 
Title: RUIA Claims Notification and 

Verification System. 
OMB Control Number: 3220–0171. 
Form(s) submitted: ID–4K, ID–4K 

(INTERNET), ID–4E, ID–4E 
(INTERNET). 

Type of request: Reinstatement 
without change of a previously 
approved collection. 

Affected public: Private Sector; 
Businesses or other for-profits. 

Abstract: Section 5(b) of the RUIA 
requires that effective January 1, 1990, 
when a claim for benefits is filed with 
the Railroad Retirement Board (RRB), 
the RRB shall provide notice of such 
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1 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(1). 
2 17 CFR 240.19b–4. 

3 The term ‘‘Participant’’ has the meaning set 
forth in Equity 1, Section 1(a)(5). A ‘‘Participant’’ 
is an entity that fulfills the obligations contained in 
Equity 2, Section 3 regarding participation in the 
System, and includes Nasdaq ECNs, Nasdaq Market 
Makers, and Order Entry Firms. 

claim to the claimant’s base-year 
employer(s) and afford such employer(s) 
an opportunity to submit information 
relevant to the claim before making an 
initial determination on the claim. 
When the RRB determines to pay 

benefits to a claimant under the RUIA, 
the RRB shall provide notice of such 
determination to the claimant’s base 
year employer. 

Changes proposed: The RRB proposes 
no changes to Forms ID–4K, ID– 

4K(internet), ID–4E, and ID–4E 
(internet). 

The burden estimate for the ICR is as 
follows: 

Form No. Annual 
responses 

Time 
(minutes) 

Burden 
(hours) 

ID–4K (Manual) ............................................................................................................................ 1,250 2 42 
ID–4K (FTP) ................................................................................................................................. 15,600 (*) 210 
ID–4K (Internet) ........................................................................................................................... 63,000 2 2,100 
ID–4E (Manual) ............................................................................................................................ 50 2 2 
ID–4E (Internet) ........................................................................................................................... 120 2 4 

Total ...................................................................................................................................... 80,020 ........................ 2,358 

* The burden for the railroad employers receiving file transfer protocol (FTP) messages has been calculated in the following manner. We esti-
mate that 10 minutes a day would be required on average for each of the 5 railroad employers to operate the system. Based on 251 workdays in 
a year, we calculate the number of burden hours to be 210 hours, of which we allocated 40 percent to unemployment transactions (84 burden 
hours) and 60 percent to sickness transactions (126 burden hours). 

Additional Information or Comments: 
Copies of the forms and supporting 
documents or comments regarding the 
information collection should be 
addressed to Brian Foster, Railroad 
Retirement Board, 844 North Rush 
Street, Chicago, Illinois 60611–1275 or 
emailed to Brian.Foster@rrb.gov. 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 

Brian Foster, 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2025–10782 Filed 6–12–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7905–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[Release No. 34–103211; File No. SR– 
NASDAQ–2025–043] 

Self-Regulatory Organizations; The 
Nasdaq Stock Market LLC; Notice of 
Filing and Immediate Effectiveness of 
Proposed Rule Change To Amend 
Equity 6, Section 4 (Exchange Sharing 
of Participant Risk Settings) To Permit 
the Allocation of Responsibility to 
Clearing Members 

Pursuant to Section 19(b)(1) of the 
Securities Exchange Act of 1934 
(‘‘Act’’),1 and Rule 19b–4 thereunder,2 
notice is hereby given that on May 29, 
2025, The Nasdaq Stock Market LLC 
(‘‘Nasdaq’’ or ‘‘Exchange’’) filed with the 

Securities and Exchange Commission 
(‘‘SEC’’ or ‘‘Commission’’) the proposed 
rule change as described in Items I, II, 
and III, below, which Items have been 
prepared by the Exchange. The 
Commission is publishing this notice to 
solicit comments on the proposed rule 
change from interested persons. 

I. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Terms of Substance of 
the Proposed Rule Change 

The Exchange proposes to amend 
Equity 6, Section 4 (Exchange Sharing of 
Participant Risk Settings) to permit the 
allocation of responsibility to clearing 
members, as described further below. 

The text of the proposed rule change 
is available on the Exchange’s website at 
https://listingcenter.nasdaq.com/ 
rulebook/nasdaq/rulefilings, at the 
principal office of the Exchange, and at 
the Commission’s Public Reference 
Room. 

II. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Purpose of, and 
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule 
Change 

In its filing with the Commission, the 
Exchange included statements 
concerning the purpose of and basis for 
the proposed rule change and discussed 
any comments it received on the 
proposed rule change. The text of these 
statements may be examined at the 
places specified in Item IV below. The 
Exchange has prepared summaries, set 
forth in sections A, B, and C below, of 
the most significant aspects of such 
statements. 

A. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Purpose of, and 
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule 
Change 

1. Purpose 

The Exchange proposes to amend 
Equity 6, Section 4 to permit the 
allocation of responsibility to clearing 
members. Specifically, the Exchange 
proposes to add Section 4(b)(Clearing 
Member Designation) to allow for a 
Participant that does not self-clear to 
allocate responsibility for establishing 
and adjusting the risk levels to a 
clearing member that clears transactions 
on behalf of the Participant.3 A clearing 
member guarantees transactions 
executed on Nasdaq for members with 
whom it has entered into a clearing 
arrangement, and therefore bears the 
risk associated with those transactions. 
Because clearing members bear the risk 
on behalf of their Participant, the 
Exchange believes that it is appropriate 
for the clearing member to have 
knowledge of what risk settings the 
Participant may utilize within the 
Exchange’s trading system, as well as 
the option to set and adjust the risk 
levels. Therefore, the Exchange 
proposes to make the risk settings in 
Equity 6, Section 5 available to clearing 
members, as well as the option to set 
and adjust the risk levels, if authorized 
by the Participant. 

For clarification, the Exchange does 
not guarantee that these risk controls 
will be sufficiently comprehensive to 
meet all of a Participant’s needs, nor are 
the controls designed to be the sole 
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