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U.S.C. Chapter 35), which requires 
agencies to submit proposed reporting 
and recordkeeping requirements to 
OMB for review and approval, and to 
publish a notice in the Federal Register 
notifying the public that the agency has 
made such a submission. This notice 
also allows an additional 30 days for 
public comments. 

DATES: Submit comments on or before 
November 3, 2016. 

ADDRESSES: Comments should refer to 
the information collection by name and/ 
or OMB Control Number and should be 
sent to: Agency Clearance Officer, Curtis 
Rich, Small Business Administration, 
409 3rd Street SW., 5th Floor, 
Washington, DC 20416; and SBA Desk 
Officer, Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
Management and Budget, New 
Executive Office Building, Washington, 
DC 20503. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Curtis Rich, Agency Clearance Officer, 
(202) 205–7030 curtis.rich@sba.gov. 

Copies: A copy of the Form OMB 83– 
1, supporting statement, and other 
documents submitted to OMB for 
review may be obtained from the 
Agency Clearance Officer. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Small Business Administration SBA’s 

Premier Certified Lenders Program 
(PCLP) transfers considerable authority 
and autonomy to Premier Certified 
Development Companies (Premier 
CDCs). The PCLP forms (Forms 2233 
and 2234) collect loan information to 
assist the agency in carrying-out its 
lender, portfolio and program oversight 
responsibilities. Form 2233 will collect 
loan loss reserve information to ensure 
Premier CDC compliance with statutory 
requirements. SBA will use Form 2234 
to approve loan eligibility and track 
portfolio performance. 

Solicitation of Public Comments 

Title: PCLP Quarterly Loan Loss 
Reserve Report and PCLP Guarantee 
Request 

Description of Respondents: Small 
Business Lending Companies 

Form Number’s: SBA Form 2233, 
2234A, 2234B, 2234C 

Total Estimated Annual Responses: 
20 

Total Estimated Annual Hour Burden: 
30 

Curtis B. Rich, 
Management Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2016–23765 Filed 10–3–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8025–01–P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

Reporting and Recordkeeping 
Requirements Under OMB Review 

AGENCY: Small Business Administration. 

ACTION: Notice of 30-day Reporting 
Requirements Submitted for OMB 
Review. 

SUMMARY: Under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (44 U.S.C. 
Chapter 35), agencies are required to 
submit proposed reporting and 
recordkeeping requirements to OMB for 
review and approval, and to publish a 
notice in the Federal Register notifying 
the public that the agency has made 
such a submission. 

DATES: Submit comments on or before 
November 3, 2016. If you intend to 
comment but cannot prepare comments 
promptly, please advise the OMB 
Reviewer and the Agency Clearance 
Officer before the deadline. 

ADDRESSES: Address all comments 
concerning this notice to: Agency 
Clearance Officer, Curtis Rich, Small 
Business Administration, 409 3rd Street 
SW., 5th Floor, Washington, DC 20416; 
and OMB Reviewer, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget, New 
Executive Office Building, Washington, 
DC 20503. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Curtis Rich, Agency Clearance Officer, 
(202) 205–7030 curtis.rich@sba.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Copies: Request for clearance (OMB 

83–1), supporting statement, and other 
documents submitted to OMB for 
review may be obtained from the 
Agency Clearance Officer. 

Abstract: In accordance with Title 13 
of the Code of Federal Regulations, 
Section 124.403, each 8(a) participant 
must annually review its business plan 
with the assigned Business Opportunity 
Specialist (BOS) and modify the plan, as 
appropriate, within 30 days after the 
close of each program year. The 
Participant must also submit a statement 
describing its current contract 
performance capabilities as part of its 
update business plan. SBA uses the 
information collected to assess the 
participant’s financial condition and 
continued eligibility. 

Title: 8(a) Annual Update. 
Frequency: On Occasion. 
SBA Form Number: 1450. 
Description of Respondents: 8(a) 

Participants. 
Responses: 7,814. 

Annual Burden: 14,846. 

Curtis Rich, 
Management Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2016–23732 Filed 10–3–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8025–01–P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

Reporting and Recordkeeping 
Requirements Under OMB Review 

AGENCY: Small Business Administration. 
ACTION: 30-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Small Business 
Administration (SBA) is publishing this 
notice to comply with requirements of 
the Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) (44 
U.S.C. Chapter 35), which requires 
agencies to submit proposed reporting 
and recordkeeping requirements to 
OMB for review and approval, and to 
publish a notice in the Federal Register 
notifying the public that the agency has 
made such a submission. This notice 
also allows an additional 30 days for 
public comments. 
DATES: Submit comments on or before 
November 3, 2016. 
ADDRESSES: Comments should refer to 
the information collection by name and/ 
or OMB Control Number and should be 
sent to: Agency Clearance Officer, Curtis 
Rich, Small Business Administration, 
409 3rd Street SW., 5th Floor, 
Washington, DC 20416; and SBA Desk 
Officer, Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
Management and Budget, New 
Executive Office Building, Washington, 
DC 20503. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Curtis Rich, Agency Clearance Officer, 
(202) 205–7030 curtis.rich@sba.gov 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Respondent are applicants for a 
Certified Development Company (CDC) 
loan (or 504 loan) and the CDC’s 
certified by SBA to issue such loans. 
The information is necessary for the 
Small Business Administration (SBA) to 
determine whether applicants meet the 
Agency’s criteria for eligibility, 
creditworthiness, and repayment ability, 
and also whether to approve CDC’s 
request for debenture guarantees. 

Copies: A copy of the Form OMB 83– 
1, supporting statement, and other 
documents submitted to OMB for 
review may be obtained from the 
Agency Clearance Officer. 

Solicitation of Public Comments 

Title: Application for Section 504 
Loans. 

Description of Respondents: Small 
Business Lending Companies. 
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