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DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

August 10, 2006. 
The Department of Agriculture has 

submitted the following information 
collection requirement(s) to OMB for 
review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. Comments 
regarding (a) Whether the collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the agency’s estimate 
of burden including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on those who are to respond, including 
through the use of appropriate 
automated, electronic, mechanical, or 
other technological collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology should be addressed to: Desk 
Officer for Agriculture, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB), 
OIRA_Submission@OMB.EOP.GOV or 
fax (202) 395–5806 and to Departmental 
Clearance Office, USDA, OCIO, Mail 
Stop 7602, Washington, DC 20250– 
7602. Comments regarding these 
information collections are best assured 
of having their full effect if received 
within 30 days of this notification. 
Copies of the submission(s) may be 
obtained by calling (202) 720–8958. 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number and the agency informs 
potential persons who are to respond to 
the collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 

the collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Food and Nutrition Service 

Title: The Pennsylvania Rural 
Eligibility Pilot Evaluation. 

OMB Control Number: 0584–NEW. 
Summary of Collection: The 

Pennsylvania Rural Eligibility Pilot is a 
pilot of the Summer Food Service 
Program (SFSP). Congress created the 
SFSP in 1968 as the Special Food 
Service Program for Children. In 1975, 
separate Child Care Food Program and 
a Summer Food Service Program were 
authorized. SFSP was authorized to 
provide free and reduced price meals to 
children in residential Summer camps 
and sites serving areas of poor economic 
conditions, where at least one-third of 
the children qualify and are eligible to 
participate. The Pennsylvania Rural 
Area Eligibility Pilot will address the 
concern that some poor rural children 
may not be reached by the SFSP, Public 
Law 108–265 established a pilot for the 
SFSP in rural areas of Pennsylvania for 
Calendar 2005 and 2006. 

Need and Use of the Information: The 
information collected from the pilot will 
be used by managers and administrators 
of the USDA, in particular the Child 
Nutrition Program of the Food and 
Nutrition Service and the Pennsylvania 
Department of Education Food and 
Nutrition Division, for the purpose of 
planning, organizing, and delivering 
SFSP services. The information 
collected from the pilot will include the 
number of sponsors offering meals 
through SFSP; the number of sites 
offering meals through SFSP; the 
geographic location of the sites; and 
services provided to eligible children. 

Description of Respondents: Not-for- 
profit institutions; State, Local, or Tribal 
Government. 

Number of Respondents: 306. 
Frequency of Responses: Reporting: 

Annually. 
Total Burden Hours: 77. 

Ruth Brown, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. E6–13360 Filed 8–14–06; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–30–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Food Safety and Inspection Service 

[Docket No. FSIS–2006–0022] 

Codex Alimentarius Commission: 
Meeting of the Codex Committee on 
Fish and Fishery Products 

AGENCY: Office of the Under Secretary 
for Food Safety, USDA. 
ACTION: Notice of public meeting and 
request for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Office of the Under 
Secretary for Food Safety, U.S. 
Department of Agriculture (USDA), and 
the Food and Drug Administration 
(FDA), U.S. Department of Health and 
Human Services, are sponsoring a 
public meeting on September 6, 2006. 
The objective of the public meeting is to 
provide information and receive public 
comments on agenda items and draft 
United States positions that will be 
discussed at the 28th Session of the 
Codex Committee on Fish and Fishery 
Products (CCFFP) of the Codex 
Alimentarius Commission (Codex), 
which will be held in Beijing, China 
from September 18–22, 2006. The Under 
Secretary for Food Safety and FDA 
recognize the importance of providing 
interested parties with the opportunity 
to obtain background information on the 
28th Session of the CCFFP and to 
address items on the agenda. 
DATES: The public meeting is scheduled 
for Wednesday, September 6, 2006 from 
1 p.m. to 4 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: The public meeting will be 
held in room 3B–047, of the Harvey 
Wiley Federal Building, 5100 Paint 
Branch Parkway, College Park, 
Maryland 20740. Documents related to 
the 28th Session of the CCFFP will be 
accessible via the World Wide Web at 
the following address: http:// 
www.codexalimentarius.net/ 
current.asp. 

The Food Safety and Inspection 
Service (FSIS) invites interested persons 
to submit comments on this notice. 
Comments may be submitted by any of 
the following methods: 

Federal eRulemaking Portal: This 
Web site provides the ability to type 
short comments directly into the 
comment field on this Web page or 
attach a file for lengthier comments. 
FSIS prefers to receive comments 
through the Federal eRulemaking Portal. 
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