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Twenty-Fifth Revised Sheet No. 24
Twentieth Revised Sheet No. 26
Twentieth Revised Sheet No. 27
Sixteenth Revised Sheet No. 28
Seventh Revised Sheet No. 37
Seventh Revised Sheet No. 38
Third Revised Volume No. 2

Forty-Ninth Revised Sheet No. 1–D.2
Forty-Third Revised Sheet No. 1–D.3

El Paso states that the tariff sheets are
being filed to revise the Annual Charge
Adjustment (‘‘ACA’’) from $0.0022 to
$0.0021 per dth for the fiscal year
beginning October 1, 2001.

El Paso states that copies of this filing
are being mailed to its customers, state
commissions and other interested
parties.

Any person desiring to be heard or to
protest said filing should file a motion
to intervene or a protest with the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission,
888 First Street, N.E., Washington, D.C.
20426, in accordance with Sections
385.214 or 385.211 of the Commission’s
Rules and Regulations. All such motions
or protests must be filed on or before
September 14, 2001. Protests will be
considered by the Commission in
determining the appropriate action to be
taken, but will not serve to make
protestants parties to the proceedings.
Any person wishing to become a party
must file a motion to intervene. Copies
of this filing are on file with the
Commission and are available for public
inspection. This filing may also be
viewed on the web at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘RIMS’’ link,
select ‘‘Docket#’’ and follow the
instructions (call 202–208–2222 for
assistance). Comments, protests and
interventions may be filed electronically
via the Internet in lieu of paper. See, 18
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the
instructions on the Commission’s web
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link.

Linwood A. Watson, Jr.,
Acting Secretary.
[FR Doc. 01–23128 Filed 9–14–01; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory
Commission

[Docket Nos. EC01–145–000 and EL01–110–
000]

EME Homer City Generation L.P.;
Notice of Filing

September 7, 2001.
Take notice that on August 28, 2001,

EME Homer City Generation, L.P.
(Applicant) filed with the Federal
Energy Regulatory Commission, and

application pursuant to section 203 of
the Federal Power Act for authorization
of the disposition of jurisdictional
facilities in connection with a sale and
leaseback transaction involving the
Home City Electric Generating Station,
an 1,884–MW coal-fired generating
plant located in Indiana County,
Pennsylvania. Applicant also requests
the Commission to issue an order
disclaiming jurisdiction over certain
passive participants in the transaction.

Any person desiring to be heard or to
protest such filing should file a motion
to intervene or protest with the Federal
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888
First Street, NE, Washington, DC 20426,
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and
385.214). All such motions and protests
should be filed on or before September
18, 2001. Protests will be considered by
the Commission to determine the
appropriate action to be taken, but will
not serve to make protestants parties to
the proceedings. Any person wishing to
become a party must file a motion to
intervene. Copies of this filing are on
file with the Commission and are
available for public inspection. This
filing may also be viewed on the web at
http://www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘RIMS’’
link, select ‘‘Docket#’’ and follow the
instructions (call 202–208–2222 for
assistance). Comments, protests and
interventions may be filed electronically
via the Internet in lieu of paper. See, 18
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the
instructions on the Commission’s web
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link.

Linwood A. Watson, Jr.,
Acting Secretary.
[FR Doc. 01–23098 Filed 9–14–01; 8:45 am]
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DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory
Commission

[Docket No. RP01–536–000]

Florida Gas Transmission Company;
Notice of Proposed Changes in FERC
Gas Tariff

September 7, 2001.
Take notice that on August 31, 2001,

Florida Gas Transmission Company
(‘‘FGT’’) tendered for filing as part of its
FERC Gas Tariff, Third Revised Volume
No. 1 (‘‘Tariff’’), the tariff sheets listed
in Appendix A to the filing, to become
effective October 1, 2001.

FGT states that the purpose of the
instant filing is to reflect the electronic
contracting and capacity release

capability that will be implemented on
the FGT system on October 1, 2001.
Concurrent with these tariff changes
FGT is implementing a new contracting
and capacity release system that will,
among other things, enable FGT and its
shippers to comply with GISB timelines
and the Commission’s policies on
contracting. FGT anticipates that this
electronic contacting capability will
replace current facsimile and mail
methods for exchange of contractual
documents. FGT is currently working
with its shippers to transition to the
new system and will continue to accept
written requests, contracts and
amendments during the transition
period. FGT states that the proposed
tariff modifications permit shippers to
request service and execute service
agreements electronically on FGT’s Web
site located at www.fgt.enron.com. The
instant filing also includes minor
corrections, as well as changes to update
or clarify certain provisions in
conformance with the electronic
processes provided for herein.

Any person desiring to be heard or to
protest said filing should file a motion
to intervene or a protest with the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission,
888 First Street, NE, Washington, DC
20426, in accordance with Sections
385.214 or 385.211 of the Commission’s
Rules and Regulations. All such motions
or protests must be filed in accordance
with Section 154.210 of the
Commission’s Regulations. Protests will
be considered by the Commission in
determining the appropriate action to be
taken, but will not serve to make
protestants parties to the proceedings.
Any person wishing to become a party
must file a motion to intervene. Copies
of this filing are on file with the
Commission and are available for public
inspection. This filing may also be
viewed on the Web at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘RIMS’’ link,
select ‘‘Docket#’’ and follow the
instructions (call 202–208–2222 for
assistance).

Comments, protests and interventions
may be filed electronically via the
Internet in lieu of paper. See, 18 CFR
385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the instructions
on the Commission’s Web site under the
‘‘e-Filing’’ link.

Linwood A. Watson, Jr.,
Acting Secretary.
[FR Doc. 01–23110 Filed 9–14–01; 8:45 am]
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