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DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before November 14, 2018. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by the Docket Identification 
(ID) Number and the File Symbol of 
interest as shown in the body of this 
document, by one of the following 
methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the online 
instructions for submitting comments. 
Do not submit electronically any 
information you consider to be 
Confidential Business Information (CBI) 
or other information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. 

• Mail: OPP Docket, Environmental 
Protection Agency Docket Center (EPA/ 
DC), (28221T), 1200 Pennsylvania Ave. 
NW, Washington, DC 20460–0001. 

• Hand Delivery: To make special 
arrangements for hand delivery or 
delivery of boxed information, please 
follow the instructions at http://
www.epa.gov/dockets/contacts.html. 

Additional instructions on 
commenting or visiting the docket, 
along with more information about 
dockets generally, is available at http:// 
www.epa.gov/dockets. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Robert McNally, Biopesticides and 
Pollution Prevention Division (7511P), 
Office of Pesticide Programs, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave. NW, Washington, DC 
20460–0001; main telephone number: 
(703) 305–7090; email address: 
BPPDFRNotices@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

A. Does this action apply to me? 

You may be potentially affected by 
this action if you are an agricultural 
producer, food manufacturer, or 
pesticide manufacturer. The following 
list of North American Industrial 
Classification System (NAICS) codes is 
not intended to be exhaustive, but rather 
provides a guide to help readers 
determine whether this document 
applies to them. Potentially affected 
entities may include: 

• Crop production (NAICS code 111). 
• Animal production (NAICS code 

112). 
• Food manufacturing (NAICS code 

311). 
• Pesticide manufacturing (NAICS 

code 32532). 

B. What should I consider as I prepare 
my comments for EPA? 

1. Submitting CBI. Do not submit this 
information to EPA through 
regulations.gov or email. Clearly mark 
the part or all of the information that 

you claim to be CBI. For CBI 
information in a disk or CD–ROM that 
you mail to EPA, mark the outside of the 
disk or CD–ROM as CBI and then 
identify electronically within the disk or 
CD–ROM the specific information that 
is claimed as CBI. In addition to one 
complete version of the comment that 
includes information claimed as CBI, a 
copy of the comment that does not 
contain the information claimed as CBI 
must be submitted for inclusion in the 
public docket. Information so marked 
will not be disclosed except in 
accordance with procedures set forth in 
40 CFR part 2. 

2. Tips for preparing your comments. 
When preparing and submitting your 
comments, see the commenting tips at 
http://www.epa.gov/dockets/ 
comments.html. 

II. Registration Applications 
EPA has received applications to 

register pesticide products containing 
active ingredients not included in any 
currently registered pesticide products. 
Pursuant to the provisions of FIFRA 
section 3(c)(4) (7 U.S.C. 136a(c)(4)), EPA 
is hereby providing notice of receipt and 
opportunity to comment on these 
applications. Notice of receipt of these 
applications does not imply a decision 
by the Agency on these applications. 

III. New Active Ingredients 
1. File Symbol: 67690–IE. Docket ID 

number: EPA–HQ–OPP–2018–0096. 
Applicant: SePRO Corporation, 11550 
North Meridian St., Suite 600, Carmel, 
IN 46032. Product name: SP2700 2%. 
Active ingredient: Plant activator and 
fungicide—Ningnanmycin at 2.0%. 
Proposed use: For control of fungal and 
viral diseases on cherries, cucurbits, 
grapes, lettuce, ornamentals, peppers, 
pome fruits, snap beans, strawberries, 
tobacco, tomatoes, rice, seed treatment, 
soybean, wheat, and turf. 

2. File Symbol: 67690–IG. Docket ID 
number: EPA–HQ–OPP–2018–0096. 
Applicant: SePRO Corporation, 11550 
North Meridian St., Suite 600, Carmel, 
IN 46032. Product name: SP2700 
Technical. Active ingredient: Plant 
activator and fungicide—Ningnanmycin 
at 2%. Proposed use: Manufacturing 
use. 

3. File Symbol: 87978–A. Docket ID 
number: EPA–HQ–OPP–2018–0570. 
Applicant: AgBiTech Pty Ltd, 8 Rocla 
Ct., Glenvale, Queensland 4350, 
Australia (c/o MacIntosh & Associates, 
Inc., 1203 Hartford Ave., St. Paul, MN 
55116–1622). Product name: Surtivo 
Soy. Active ingredients: Insecticides— 
Chrysodeixis includens 
Nucleopolyhedrovirus isolate #460 at 
17.1% and Helicoverpa armigera 

Nucleopolyhedrovirus ABA–NPV–U at 
17.1%. Proposed use: Field and 
greenhouse. 

4. File Symbol: 87978–L. Docket ID 
number: EPA–HQ–OPP–2018–0570. 
Applicant: AgBiTech Pty Ltd, 8 Rocla 
Ct., Glenvale, Queensland 4350, 
Australia (c/o MacIntosh & Associates, 
Inc., 1203 Hartford Ave., St. Paul, MN 
55116–1622). Product name: ChinNPV 
Liquid Formulation. Active ingredient: 
Insecticide—Chrysodeixis includens 
Nucleopolyhedrovirus isolate #460 at 
32.0%. Proposed use: Field and 
greenhouse. 

5. File Symbol: 91873–R. Docket ID 
number: EPA–HQ–OPP–2018–0122. 
Applicant: Evolva, Duggingerstrasse 23, 
4153 Reinach, Switzerland (c/o SciReg 
Inc., 12733 Director’s Loop, 
Woodbridge, VA 22192). Product name: 
Nootkatone. Active ingredient: 
Insecticide and arachnicide— 
Nootkatone at 99.4%. Proposed use: 
Manufacturing use. 

Authority: 7 U.S.C. 136 et seq. 

Dated: October 1, 2018. 
Delores Barber, 
Director, Information Technology and 
Resources Management Division, Office of 
Pesticide Programs. 
[FR Doc. 2018–22392 Filed 10–12–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL ACCOUNTING STANDARDS 
ADVISORY BOARD 

Notice of Issuance of Statement of 
Federal Financial Accounting 
Standards 56, Classified Activities 

AGENCY: Federal Accounting Standards 
Advisory Board. 
ACTION: Notice. 

Pursuant to 31 U.S.C. 3511(d), the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (Pub. 
L. 92–463), as amended, and the FASAB 
Rules Of Procedure, as amended in 
October 2010, notice is hereby given 
that the Federal Accounting Standards 
Advisory Board (FASAB) has issued 
Statement of Federal Financial 
Accounting Standards 56, Classified 
Activities. 

The Statement is available on the 
FASAB website at http://
www.fasab.gov/accounting-standards/. 
Copies can be obtained by contacting 
FASAB at (202) 512–7350. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ms. 
Wendy M. Payne, Executive Director, 
441 G Street NW, Suite 1155, 
Washington, DC 20548, or call (202) 
512–7350. 

Authority: Federal Advisory Committee 
Act, Pub. L. 92–463. 
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Dated: October 4, 2018. 
Wendy M. Payne, 
Executive Director. 
[FR Doc. 2018–22375 Filed 10–12–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 1610–02–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0508] 

Information Collection Being 
Submitted for Review and Approval to 
the Office of Management and Budget 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995, the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 

The Commission may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) control number. No person shall 
be subject to any penalty for failing to 
comply with a collection of information 
subject to the PRA that does not display 
a valid OMB control number. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
submitted on or before November 14, 
2018. If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments, but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contacts listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Nicholas A. Fraser, OMB, via email 
Nicholas_A._Fraser@omb.eop.gov; and 
to Cathy Williams, FCC, via email PRA@

fcc.gov and to Cathy.Williams@fcc.gov. 
Include in the comments the OMB 
control number as shown in the 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information or copies of the 
information collection, contact Cathy 
Williams at (202) 418–2918. To view a 
copy of this information collection 
request (ICR) submitted to OMB: (1) Go 
to the web page <http://
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain>, 
(2) look for the section of the web page 
called ‘‘Currently Under Review,’’ (3) 
click on the downward-pointing arrow 
in the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box below the 
‘‘Currently Under Review’’ heading, (4) 
select ‘‘Federal Communications 
Commission’’ from the list of agencies 
presented in the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box, 
(5) click the ‘‘Submit’’ button to the 
right of the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box, (6) 
when the list of FCC ICRs currently 
under review appears, look for the OMB 
control number of this ICR and then 
click on the ICR Reference Number. A 
copy of the FCC submission to OMB 
will be displayed. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: As part of 
its continuing effort to reduce 
paperwork burdens, and as required by 
the Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) of 
1995 (44 U.S.C. 3501–3520), the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0508. 
Title: Parts 1 and 22 Reporting and 

Recordkeeping Requirements. 
Form Number: Not applicable. 
Type of Review: Revision of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit entities, Individuals or 
households, and State, Local or Tribal 
Governments. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 15,465 respondents; 16,183 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.13 
hours–10 hours. 

Frequency of Response: 
Recordkeeping requirement; On 
occasion, quarterly, and semi-annual 
reporting requirements; Third-party 
disclosure requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. The statutory 
authority for this collection is contained 
in 47 U.S.C. 154, 222, 303, 309 and 332. 

Total Annual Burden: 2,606 hours. 
Annual Cost Burden: $19,138,350. 
Privacy Act Impact Assessment: Yes. 
Nature and Extent of Confidentiality: 

There is no need for confidentiality with 
this collection of information. The 
information to be collected will be made 
available for public inspection. 
Applicants may request materials or 
information submitted to the 
Commission be given confidential 
treatment under 47 CFR 0.459 of the 
Commission’s rules. 

Needs and Uses: Part 22 contains the 
technical and legal requirements for 
radio stations operating in the Public 
Mobile Services. The information 
collected is used to determine on a case- 
by-case basis, whether or not to grant 
licenses authorizing construction and 
operation of wireless 
telecommunications facilities to 
common carriers. Further, this 
information is used to develop statistics 
about the demand for various wireless 
licenses and/or the licensing process 
itself, and occasionally for rule 
enforcement purposes. 

This revised information collection 
reflects deletion of a rule applicable to 
all licensees and applicants governed by 
Part 22 of the Commission’s rules, as 
adopted by the Commission in a Third 
Report and Order in WT Docket Nos. 
12–40 (Cellular Third R&O) (FCC 18– 
92). The Cellular Third R&O deleted 
certain Part 22 rules that either imposed 
administrative and recordkeeping 
burdens that are outdated and no longer 
serve the public interest, or that are 
largely duplicative of later-adopted 
rules and are thus no longer necessary. 
Among the rule deletions and of 
relevance to this information collection, 
the Commission deleted rule section 
22.303, resulting in discontinued 
information collection for that rule 
section. 

Federal Communications Commission. 

Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary. Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2018–22391 Filed 10–12–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 
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