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43 Essex Radez LLC, Fidelity Market Data, and 
Lloyds TSB Bank plc. 

44 Essex Radez LLC. 
45 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(3)(A). 
46 17 CFR 240.19b–4(f)(2). 
47 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(2)(B). 48 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(12). 

service, which the Exchange has 
provided above. 

Three commenters 43 asked for 
examples of how the Exchange would 
charge for customers that use both 
display and non-display devices. The 
Exchange believes that the pricing 
examples provided above are responsive 
to this request. 

One commenter 44 stated that the 
proposed fees are excessive. The 
Exchange believes that the proposed 
fees are reasonable, equitable, and not 
unfairly discriminatory for the reasons 
discussed in Section 3(b) above. 

III. Date of Effectiveness of the 
Proposed Rule Change and Timing for 
Commission Action 

The foregoing rule change is effective 
upon filing pursuant to Section 
19(b)(3)(A) 45 of the Act and 
subparagraph (f)(2) of Rule 19b–4 46 
thereunder, because it establishes a due, 
fee, or other charge imposed by the 
Exchange. 

At any time within 60 days of the 
filing of such proposed rule change, the 
Commission summarily may 
temporarily suspend such rule change if 
it appears to the Commission that such 
action is necessary or appropriate in the 
public interest, for the protection of 
investors, or otherwise in furtherance of 
the purposes of the Act. If the 
Commission takes such action, the 
Commission shall institute proceedings 
under Section 19(b)(2)(B) 47 of the Act to 
determine whether the proposed rule 
change should be approved or 
disapproved. 

IV. Solicitation of Comments 
Interested persons are invited to 

submit written data, views, and 
arguments concerning the foregoing, 
including whether the proposed rule 
change is consistent with the Act. 
Comments may be submitted by any of 
the following methods: 

Electronic Comments 
• Use the Commission’s Internet 

comment form (http://www.sec.gov/ 
rules/sro.shtml); or 

• Send an email to rule- 
comments@sec.gov. Please include File 
Number SR–NYSEMKT–2013–32 on the 
subject line. 

Paper Comments 
• Send paper comments in triplicate 

to Elizabeth M. Murphy, Secretary, 

Securities and Exchange Commission, 
100 F Street NE., Washington, DC 
20549–1090. 
All submissions should refer to File 
Number SR–NYSEMKT–2013–32. This 
file number should be included on the 
subject line if email is used. To help the 
Commission process and review your 
comments more efficiently, please use 
only one method. The Commission will 
post all comments on the Commission’s 
Internet Web site (http://www.sec.gov/ 
rules/sro.shtml). Copies of the 
submission, all subsequent 
amendments, all written statements 
with respect to the proposed rule 
change that are filed with the 
Commission, and all written 
communications relating to the 
proposed rule change between the 
Commission and any person, other than 
those that may be withheld from the 
public in accordance with the 
provisions of 5 U.S.C. 552, will be 
available for Web site viewing and 
printing in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, 100 F Street NE., 
Washington, DC 20549, on official 
business days between the hours of 
10:00 a.m. and 3:00 p.m. Copies of the 
filing also will be available for 
inspection and copying at the principal 
office of the Exchange. All comments 
received will be posted without change; 
the Commission does not edit personal 
identifying information from 
submissions. You should submit only 
information that you wish to make 
available publicly. All submissions 
should refer to File Number SR– 
NYSEMKT–2013–32 and should be 
submitted on or before April 30, 2013. 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Trading and Markets, pursuant to delegated 
authority.48 
Kevin M. O’Neill, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2013–08176 Filed 4–8–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

Announcement of the 2013 SBA-Visa 
Export Video Contest Under the 
America COMPETES Reauthorization 
Act of 2011 

AGENCY: U.S. Small Business 
Administration (SBA) 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Small Business 
Administration (SBA) and Visa U.S.A. 
Inc. (Visa) (collectively the 
‘‘Cosponsors’’) announce a video contest 
for eligible small businesses to 

showcase the advantages of exporting 
and increase awareness of government 
assistance available to support small 
business exporters. This Federal 
Register Notice is required under 
Section 105 of the America COMPETES 
Reauthorization Act of 2011. 
DATES: The submission period for 
entries begins 12:00 p.m. EDT, February 
25, 2013 and ends 5:00 p.m. EDT, April 
22, 2013. Winners will be announced no 
later than May 31, 2013. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Christopher Eskelinen, Office of 
International Trade, U.S. Small Business 
Administration, 409 Third Street SW., 
Washington, DC 20416; Telephone (202) 
205–6726; 
christopher.eskelinen@sba.gov 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Competition Details 
1. Subject of the Competition: The 

U.S. Small Business Administration 
(SBA) and Visa U.S.A. Inc. (Visa) 
(collectively the ‘‘Cosponsors’’) are 
cosponsoring an export video contest 
that seeks to inform small businesses 
about the advantages of exporting and 
increase awareness of government 
assistance available to support small 
business exporters. The Cosponsors are 
looking for creative videos from small 
businesses that show how they became 
successful exporters. Videos can focus 
on how the small business became a 
successful exporter. Videos must 
highlight at least one of the following: 
Important lessons learned; factors that 
influenced the decision to become an 
exporter; advice for small businesses 
considering exporting; or a favorite 
exporting story. 

2. Prizes: Five prizes are available: 
First place: $10,000 cash award; Second 
place: $8,000 cash award; Third place: 
$6,000 cash award; Fourth place: $4,000 
cash award; and Fifth place: $2,000 cash 
award. Only one prize will be awarded 
for each winning submission, regardless 
of the number of Contest participants 
that created the winning video. Visa 
will issue the prizes directly to the 
Winners. 

The Cosponsors (SBA and VISA) may 
choose to cohost an awards ceremony to 
announce the Winners. To the extent 
the Cosponsors cohost an awards 
ceremony, Winners that choose to travel 
to such award ceremony for the 
announcement of the Winners will each 
receive $1,000 for travel expenses per 
winning entry, regardless of the number 
of Contest participants that created the 
winning video. Any necessary travel 
arrangements are the sole responsibility 
of the Winner. Winner will not receive 
$1,000 for travel expenses if the 
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Cosponsors do not cohost an awards 
ceremony or if Winner does not attend 
the awards ceremony. All federal, state 
and local taxes are the sole 
responsibility of the Winner. 

Competition Rules 

1. Eligibility to participate: The 
contest is open to small businesses in 
the United States and its territories 
including, but not limited to, Puerto 
Rico, the U. S. Virgin Islands and Guam. 
You must be a small business as 
determined by SBA’s size standards 
(www.sba.gov/size); have successfully 
completed at least one export 
transaction; and used at least one 
Federal program or service to support an 
export transaction. The small business 
owner(s) must be a U.S. citizen or 
permanent resident and at least 18 years 
old to enter and win the Contest. Small 
businesses who have won any prize in 
the SBA Visa Export Video Contest 
within the past two years are not 
eligible. Eligible small businesses may 
submit only one video. Any videos 
developed with federal funding, either 
grant, contract, or loan proceeds, are not 
eligible to win. Federal employees and 
their immediate families, Visa U.S.A. 
Inc. employees and their immediate 
families, current SBA contractors and 
SBA grant recipients may enter the 
Contest but are not eligible to win. 
‘‘Immediate family members’’ include 
spouses, siblings, parents, children, 
grandparents, and grandchildren, 
whether as ‘‘in-laws’’, or by current or 
past marriage, remarriage, adoption, co- 
habitation or other familial extension, 
and any other persons residing at the 
same household location, whether or 
not related. 

2. Process for participants to register: 
All Contest Participants must enter the 
Competition through the Competition 
Web page on the Challenge.gov portal 
http://exportvideo.challenge.gov/by 5 
p.m. EDT on April 22, 2013. 
Submissions will be accepted starting at 
12 p.m. EDT on February 25, 2013. 
Contest participants should review all 
contest rules and eligibility 
requirements. In order for a video to be 
eligible to win this Contest, the entry 
must meet the following requirements: 

• Contest participants must create an 
original video. 

• Contest participants must end their 
video with the following words: ‘‘That’s 
my exporting story. Where will your 
next customer come from?’’ This 
statement can be spoken, written, 
embedded or delivered in any 
appropriate way deemed effective by the 
submitter. 

• All videos must have a unique title 
or they will not be judged (i.e., not ‘‘My 
Export Story’’). 

• Videos must highlight one of the 
following: Important lessons learned; 
factors that influenced the decision to 
become an exporter; advice for small 
businesses considering exporting; or a 
favorite exporting story. 

• Videos must be 3 minutes or less 
(no more than 180 seconds) in length 
and produced in a high-resolution 
format. 

• Videos must be educational, not 
promotional in nature (i.e., a 
commercial for the small business’ 
products or services). Videos should tell 
a story. 

• Only one video may be submitted 
per business. 

• Videos must not contain violence, 
profanity, sex, images of a prurient 
nature, or direct attacks on individuals 
or organizations. SBA will disqualify 
any entries it deems to contain offensive 
material. 

• Contest participants may not use 
the SBA seal or logo or the Visa 
trademark in the video. 

• The video must be the contest 
participant’s own original creation and 
must not infringe on any third party 
rights. No copyrighted music, video, or 
images may be used in submissions to 
this contest without appropriate 
permission. Entrants are responsible for 
obtaining all necessary permissions. 
Videos previously developed for other 
organizations may be submitted. Videos 
must not have been previously 
produced for compensation, posted on 
any SBA page, or submitted to SBA 
prior to the contest. 

• All Contest submissions must 
adhere to the Challenge.gov Standards 
of Conduct (http://challenge.gov/ 
terms#standards). 

3. Basis on which the winners will be 
selected: Prior to judging, all 
Submissions will be screened for 
Contest participant eligibility and video 
eligibility. All videos will be judged by 
a panel of senior officials from SBA, 
Visa, and other member Federal 
Agencies from the Trade Promotion 
Coordinating Committee Small Business 
Working Group, selected by SBA in its 
sole discretion. The Judging Panel will 
rate each Submission approved by the 
screening panel on the following 
criteria: Inspirational nature of the 
message for potential exporters and 
effectiveness in promoting exporting; 
Creativity and uniqueness of video 
concept; Value of lessons learned/ 
communicated; Use of U.S. Government 
program/service; Innovative means of 
delivering the message and Audio and 
visual quality of the video. Winners will 

be selected based on an overall score. 
All judging is in SBA’s sole discretion 
and all decisions are final. 

Authority: Public Law 111–358 (2011). 

Dated: April 3, 2013. 
Jonathan Swain, 
Chief of Staff. 
[FR Doc. 2013–08179 Filed 4–8–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8025–01–P 

SOCIAL SECURITY ADMINISTRATION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Request and 
Comment Request 

The Social Security Administration 
(SSA) publishes a list of information 
collection packages requiring clearance 
by the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) in compliance with 
Public Law 104–13, the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995, effective October 
1, 1995. This notice includes revisions 
and an extension of OMB-approved 
information collections. 

SSA is soliciting comments on the 
accuracy of the agency’s burden 
estimate; the need for the information; 
its practical utility; ways to enhance its 
quality, utility, and clarity; and ways to 
minimize burden on respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. Mail, email, or 
fax your comments and 
recommendations on the information 
collection(s) to the OMB Desk Officer 
and SSA Reports Clearance Officer at 
the following addresses or fax numbers. 
(OMB) 

Office of Management and Budget, 
Attn: Desk Officer for SSA, Fax: 
202–395–6974, Email address: 
OIRA_Submission@omb.eop.gov. 

(SSA) 
Social Security Administration, 

DCRDP, Attn: Reports Clearance 
Director, 107 Altmeyer Building, 
6401 Security Blvd., Baltimore, MD 
21235, Fax: 410–966–2830, Email 
address: OR.Reports.Clearance@ 
ssa.gov. 

I. The information collections below 
are pending at SSA. SSA will submit 
them to OMB within 60 days from the 
date of this notice. To be sure we 
consider your comments, we must 
receive them no later than June 10, 
2013. Individuals can obtain copies of 
the collection instruments by writing to 
the above email address. 

1. Application for Lump Sum Death 
Payment—20 CFR 404.390–404.392— 
0960–0013. SSA uses Form SSA–8–F4 
to collect information needed to 
authorize payment of the lump sum 
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