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national security, resulting from a 
suspected or confirmed breach; 

(6) To appropriate Federal, State, and 
local authorities in connection with 
hiring or retaining an individual; 
conducting a background security or 
suitability investigation; adjudication of 
liability; or eligibility for a license, 
contract, grant, or other benefit; 

(7) To appropriate Federal, State, and 
local authorities, agencies, arbitrators, 
and other parties responsible for 
processing any personnel actions or 
conducting administrative hearings or 
corrective actions or grievances or 
appeals, or if needed in the performance 
of other authorized duties; 

(8) To appropriate Federal agencies 
and other public authorities for use in 
records management inspections; 

(9) To contractors, grantees, 
volunteers, and others performing or 
working on a contract, service, grant, 
cooperative agreement, or project for the 
FDIC, the Office of Inspector General, or 
the Federal Government for use in 
carrying out their obligations under 
such contract, grant, agreement or 
project; 

(10) To Federal, State, and local 
agencies for use in meeting their 
statutory or regulatory requirements; 
and 

(11) To the public or certain 
stakeholders in the form of FDIC 
documents, such as final rules or 
reports, that use, consider, discuss, or 
publish comments received by the FDIC. 

POLICIES AND PRACTICES FOR STORAGE OF 
RECORDS: 

Records are stored in paper and 
electronic media. 

POLICIES AND PRACTICES FOR RETRIEVAL OF 
RECORDS: 

FDIC may retrieve records by a variety 
of fields, including but not limited to, 
keyword, name of individual or entity 
submitting a comment, contact 
information or any data elements 
submitted in or as part of a comment, 
document title, Code of Federal 
Regulations (CFR) (search for a specific 
title within the CFR), CFR citation 
(search for the part or parts within the 
CFR title being searched), document 
type, document subtype, or date (e.g., 
date comment received or posted, 
Federal Register publication date, 
comment period end date). 

POLICIES AND PRACTICES FOR RETENTION AND 
DISPOSAL OF RECORDS: 

Public comments received in response 
to rulemakings are temporary records 
that are destroyed/deleted 15 years after 
the rule or regulation becomes effective, 
in accordance with approved records 
retention schedules. 

ADMINISTRATIVE, TECHNICAL, AND PHYSICAL 
SAFEGUARDS: 

Records are protected from 
unauthorized access and improper use 
through administrative, technical, and 
physical security measures. 
Administrative safeguards include 
written guidelines on handling personal 
information including agency-wide 
procedures for safeguarding personally 
identifiable information. In addition, all 
FDIC staff are required to take annual 
privacy and security training. Technical 
security measures within FDIC include 
restrictions on computer access to 
authorized individuals who have a 
legitimate need to know the 
information; required use of strong 
passwords that are frequently changed; 
multi-factor authentication for remote 
access and access to many FDIC 
network components; use of encryption 
for certain data types and transfers; 
firewalls and intrusion detection 
applications; and regular review of 
security procedures and best practices 
to enhance security. Physical safeguards 
include restrictions on building access 
to authorized individuals, 24-hour 
security guard service, and maintenance 
of records in lockable offices and filing 
cabinets. 

RECORD ACCESS PROCEDURES: 

Individuals wishing to request access 
to records about them in this system of 
records must submit their request in 
writing to the FDIC FOIA & Privacy Act 
Group, 550 17th Street NW, 
Washington, DC 20429, or email efoia@
fdic.gov. Requests must include full 
name, address, and verification of 
identity in accordance with FDIC 
regulations at 12 CFR part 310. 

CONTESTING RECORD PROCEDURES: 

Individuals wishing to contest or 
request an amendment to their records 
in this system of records must submit 
their request in writing to the FDIC 
FOIA & Privacy Act Group, 550 17th 
Street NW, Washington, DC 20429, or 
email efoia@fdic.gov. Requests must 
specify the information being contested, 
the reasons for contesting it, and the 
proposed amendment to such 
information in accordance with FDIC 
regulations at 12 CFR part 310. 

NOTIFICATION PROCEDURES: 

Individuals wishing to know whether 
this system contains information about 
them must submit their request in 
writing to the FDIC FOIA & Privacy Act 
Group, 550 17th Street NW, 
Washington, DC 20429, or email efoia@
fdic.gov. Requests must include full 
name, address, and verification of 

identity in accordance with FDIC 
regulations at 12 CFR part 310. 

EXEMPTIONS PROMULGATED FOR THE SYSTEM: 

None. 

HISTORY: 

None. 

Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation. 

Dated at Washington, DC, on July 26, 2022. 

James P. Sheesley, 
Assistant Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–19042 Filed 9–1–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6714–01–P 

FEDERAL MARITIME COMMISSION 

[Docket No. 22–18] 

Color Brands, LLC, Complainant. v. 
AAF Logistics, Inc., Respondent; 
Notice of Filing of Complaint and 
Assignment 

Notice is given that a complaint has 
been filed with the Federal Maritime 
Commission (Commission) by Color 
Brands, LLC, hereinafter 
‘‘Complainant,’’ against AAF Logistics, 
Inc., hereinafter ‘‘Respondent.’’ 
Complainant states that it is a 
corporation under the laws of the State 
of Michigan, with its principal place of 
business in Chicago, Illinois. 
Complainant states that Respondent is a 
non-vessel-operating common carrier 
incorporated under the laws of the State 
of California. 

Complainant alleges that Respondent 
violated 46 U.S.C. 41102 (a)(c), 46 
U.S.C. 41104(a)(4)(e) and 46 U.S.C. 
41104(a)(14) on the matter of insurance 
premiums and the adjustment and 
settlement of insurance claims on its 
cargo shipments. The full text of the 
complaint can be found in the 
Commission’s Electronic Reading Room 
at https://www2.fmc.gov/readingroom/ 
proceeding/22-18/. This proceeding has 
been assigned to Office of 
Administrative Law Judges. The initial 
decision of the presiding office in this 
proceeding shall be issued by August 
30, 2023, and the final decision of the 
Commission shall be issued by March 
15, 2024. 

Served: August 30, 2022. 

William Cody, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–19079 Filed 9–1–22; 8:45 am] 
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