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applications shall be filed electronically 
in the International Bureau Filing 
System (IBFS). 

(3) [Reserved] 
(4) FCC Form 340, ‘‘Application for 

Authority to Construct or Make Changes 
in a Noncommercial Educational 
Broadcast Station.’’ 

(5) FCC Form 346, ‘‘Application for 
Authority to Construct or Make Changes 
in a Low Power TV, TV Translator or TV 
Booster Station.’’ 

(6) FCC Form 349, ‘‘Application for 
Authority to Construct or Make Changes 
in an FM Translator or FM Booster 
Station.’’ 

(7) FCC Form 318, ‘‘Application for 
Construction Permit for a Low Power 
FM Broadcast Station.’’ 

(b) The filing of an application for 
modification of construction permit 
does not extend the expiration date of 
the construction permit. Extension of 
the expiration date must be applied for 
on FCC Form 307, in accordance with 
the provisions of § 73.3533. 

(c) In each application referred to in 
paragraph (a) of this section, the 
applicant will provide the Antenna 
Structure Registration Number (FCC 
Form 854R) of the antenna structure 
upon which it will locate its proposed 
antenna. In the event the antenna 
structure does not already have a 
Registration Number, either the antenna 
structure owner shall file FCC Form 854 
(‘‘Application for Antenna Structure 
Registration’’) in accordance with part 
17 of this chapter or the applicant shall 
provide a detailed explanation why 
registration and clearance of the antenna 
structure is not necessary. 

21. 47 CFR 73.3536(b)(2) Application 
for license to cover construction permit. 

(a) The application for station license 
shall be filed by the permittee pursuant 
to the requirements of § 73.1620 
Program tests. 

(b) The following application forms 
shall be used: 

(1) 
i. Form 302–AM for AM stations, 

‘‘Application for New AM Station 
Broadcast License.’’ 

ii. Form 302–FM for FM stations, 
‘‘Application for FM Station License.’’ 

iii. Form 302–TV for television 
stations, ‘‘Application for TV Station 
Broadcast License.’’ 

(2) FCC Form 310, ‘‘Application for an 
International or Experimental Broadcast 
Station License.’’ 

(3) [Reserved] 
(4) FCC Form 347, ‘‘Application for a 

Low Power TV, TV Translator or TV 
Booster Station License.’’ 

(5) FCC Form 350, ‘‘Application for an 
FM Translator or FM Booster Station 
License.’’ 

(6) FCC Form 319, ‘‘Application for a 
Low Power FM Broadcast Station 
License.’’ 

(c) Eligible low power television 
stations which have been granted a 
certificate of eligibility may file FCC 
Form 302–CA, ‘‘Application for Class A 
Television Broadcast Station 
Construction Permit Or License.’’ 

22. 47 CFR 73.3539 Application for 
renewal of license. 

(a) Unless otherwise directed by the 
FCC, an application for renewal of 
license shall be filed not later than the 
first day of the fourth full calendar 
month prior to the expiration date of the 
license sought to be renewed, except 
that applications for renewal of license 
of an experimental broadcast station 
shall be filed not later than the first day 
of the second full calendar month prior 
to the expiration date of the license 
sought to be renewed. If any deadline 
prescribed in this paragraph falls on a 
nonbusiness day, the cutoff shall be the 
close of business of the first full 
business day thereafter. For 
International Broadcast Stations, 
applications shall be filed electronically 
in the International Bureau Filing 
System (IBFS). 

(b) No application for renewal of 
license of any broadcast station will be 
considered unless there is on file with 
the FCC the information currently 
required by §§ 73.3612 through 73.3615, 
inclusive, for the particular class of 
station. 

(c) Whenever the FCC regards an 
application for a renewal of license as 
essential to the proper conduct of a 
hearing or investigation, and 
specifically directs that it be filed by a 
date certain, such application shall be 
filed within the time thus specified. If 
the licensee fails to file such application 
within the prescribed time, the hearing 
or investigation shall proceed as if such 
renewal application had been received. 

(d) Renewal application forms titles 
and numbers are listed in § 73.3500, 
Application and Report Forms. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Katura Jackson, 
Federal Register Liaison Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2021–16871 Filed 8–6–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 

(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The public portions of the 
applications listed below, as well as 
other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated below and at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
This information may also be obtained 
on an expedited basis, upon request, by 
contacting the appropriate Federal 
Reserve Bank and from the Board’s 
Freedom of Information Office at 
https://www.federalreserve.gov/foia/ 
request.htm. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
standards enumerated in the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). 

Comments regarding each of these 
applications must be received at the 
Reserve Bank indicated or the offices of 
the Board of Governors, Ann E. 
Misback, Secretary of the Board, 20th 
Street and Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20551–0001, not later 
than September 8, 2021. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Boston 
(Prabal Chakrabarti, Senior Vice 
President) 600 Atlantic Avenue, Boston, 
Massachusetts 02210–2204. Comments 
can also be sent electronically to 
BOS.SRC.Applications.Comments@
bos.frb.org: 

1. Community Bancorp of the 
Berkshires, MHC and Community 
Bancorp of the Berkshires, Inc., both of 
Adams, Massachusetts; to become a 
mutual bank holding company and 
stock bank holding company, 
respectively, by acquiring Adams 
Community Bank, Adams, 
Massachusetts. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, August 4, 2021. 
Ann Misback, 
Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2021–17013 Filed 8–6–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

FEDERAL TRADE COMMISSION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request 

AGENCY: Federal Trade Commission 
(FTC). 
ACTION: Notice and request for comment. 
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