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C—Requests from Indian Lessors for 
MMS to Issue an Order to 30 CFR Part 
242—Orders. The subpart explained 
how Indian lessors could formally 
request that MMS issue an order to 
persons concerning the reporting of 
production and the reporting and 
payment of royalties and other 
payments due under their leases. A final 
rule codifying these provisions has not 
been published yet. Because OMB 
approval of this information collection 
expires July 31, 2002, we are seeking 
OMB approval to renew these reporting 
requirements until a final rule is 
published. 

This information collection covers the 
hour burden associated with submitting 
requests to MMS to issue an order. 
Submission of the information in this 
collection is necessary for MMS to 
determine the validity of the request 
and investigate the reasons for 
perceived errors or underpayments. 
Proprietary information that is 
submitted is protected, and there are no 
questions of a sensitive nature included 
in this information collection. 

Frequency: On occasion. 
Estimated Number and Description of 

Respondents: 12 Indian lessors. 
Estimated Annual Reporting and 

Recordkeeping ‘‘Hour’’ Burden: 180 
hours. 

Estimated Annual Reporting and 
Recordkeeping ‘‘Non-hour Cost’’ 
Burden: We have identified no ‘‘non-
hour’’ cost burdens. 

Comments: Section 3506(c)(2)(A) of 
the PRA (44 U.S.C. 3501 et seq.) requires 
each agency ‘‘* * * to provide notice 
* * * and otherwise consult with 
members of the public and affected 
agencies concerning each proposed 
collection of information * * *.’’ 
Agencies must specifically solicit 
comments to: (a) Evaluate whether the 
proposed collection of information is 
necessary for the agency to perform its 
duties, including whether the 
information is useful; (b) evaluate the 
accuracy of the agency’s estimate of the 
burden of the proposed collection of 
information; (c) enhance the quality, 
usefulness, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (d) 
minimize the burden on the 
respondents, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

To comply with the public 
consultation process, on March 22, 
2002, we published a Federal Register 
notice (67 FR 13360) with the required 
60-day comment period announcing 
that we would submit this ICR to OMB 
for approval. We did not receive any 
comments. We have posted a copy of 
the ICR at our Internet web site http://

www.mrm.mms.gov/Laws_R_D/
FRNotices/FRInfColl.htm. We will also 
provide a copy of the ICR to you 
without charge upon request. 

If you wish to comment in response 
to this notice, please send your 
comments directly to the offices listed 
under the ADDRESSES section of this 
notice. OMB has up to 60 days to 
approve or disapprove the information 
collection but may respond after 30 
days. Therefore, to ensure maximum 
consideration, OMB should receive your 
comments by July 29, 2002. The PRA 
provides that an agency may not 
conduct or sponsor, and a person is not 
required to respond to, a collection of 
information unless it displays a 
currently valid OMB control number. 

Public Comment Policy. We will post 
all comments received in response to 
this notice on our Internet web site at 
http://www.mrm.mms.gov/Laws_R_D/
InfoColl/InfoColCom.htm for public 
review. We also make copies of the 
comments, including names and 
addresses of respondents, available for 
public review during regular business 
hours at our offices in Lakewood, 
Colorado. 

Individual respondents may request 
that we withhold their home address 
from the public record, which we will 
honor to the extent allowable by law. 
There also may be circumstances in 
which we would withhold from the 
record a respondent’s identity, as 
allowable by law. If you wish us to 
withhold your name and/or address, 
you must state this prominently at the 
beginning of your comment. However, 
we will not consider anonymous 
comments. We will make all 
submissions from organizations or 
businesses, and from individuals 
identifying themselves as 
representatives or officials of 
organizations or businesses, available 
for public inspection in their entirety. 

MMS Information Collection 
Clearance Officer: Jo Ann Lauterbach, 
(202) 208–7744.

Dated: June 5, 2002. 

Lucy Querques Denett, 
Associate Director for Minerals Revenue 
Management.
[FR Doc. 02–16313 Filed 6–27–02; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4310–MR–P

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

National Park Service 

Notice of a National Park Service 
Concession Workshop, Subject: ‘‘How 
To Apply for a Concession 
Authorization’’

AGENCY: National Park Service, Interior.
ACTION: Notice of a National Park 
Service Concession Workshop, subject: 
‘‘How to Apply for a Concession 
Authorization.’’

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given that 
the National Park Service (NPS) will be 
conducting a 1-day workshop on the 
NPS concession contracting process. 
This workshop is being held in 
conjunction with the National Parks 
Conservation Association’s (NPCA) 
‘‘Mosaic in Motion 2002’’ which is 
being held in Atlanta, Georgia on July 
7–10, 2002, at Stone Mountain at the 
Evergreen Conference Center.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: All 
persons interested in doing business in 
a national park and obtaining 
information on how to respond to a 
concession prospectus are invited to 
attend. The workshop’s focus will be on 
concession contracts. Discussions will 
include guidelines describing how to 
submit responsive proposals in response 
to concession prospectuses and how the 
NPS evaluates the proposals. The 
workshop is scheduled to begin at 8 
a.m. on July 10, 2002. The cost for the 
workshop is $125.00. For further 
information concerning this workshop 
and for registration details and 
information, contact Iantha Gantt-
Wright at the National Parks 
Conservation Association on 202/454–
3381 or visit the NPCA web site at 
www.npca.org.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Sherrill Watson, Concession Program, 
National Park Service, Washington, DC 
20240, telephone 202–565–1210.

Dated: June 4, 2002. 
Richard G. Ring, 
Associate Director, Park Operations and 
Education.
[FR Doc. 02–16340 Filed 6–27–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4310–70–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Drug Enforcement Administration 

Manufacturer of Controlled 
Substances; Notice of Application 

Pursuant to § 1301.33(a) of Title 21 of 
the Code of Federal Regulations (CFR), 
this is notice that on March 7, 2002, 
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Sigma Aldrich Research Biochemicals, 
Inc., 1–3 Strathmore Road, Natick, 
Massachusetts 01760, made application 
by renewal to the Drug Enforcement 
Administration (DEA) for registration as 
a bulk manufacturer of the basic classes 
of controlled substances listed below:

Drug Schedule 

Cathinone (1235) .......................... I 
Methcathinone (1237) .................. I 
Aminorex (1585) ........................... I 
Alpha-Ethyltryptamine (7249) ....... I 
Lysergic acid diethylamide (7315) I 
Tetrahydrocannabinols (7370) ..... I 
4-Bromo-2,5-dimethoxy-

amphetamine (7391).
I 

4-Bromo-2,5-dimethoxy-
phenethylamine (7392).

I 

2,5-Dimethoxyamphetamine 
(7396).

I 

3,4-Methylenedioxyamphetamine 
(7400).

I 

N-Hydroxy-3,4-methylenedioxy-
amphetamine (7402).

I 

3,4-Methylenedioxy-N-ethyl-
amphetamine (7404).

I 

3,4-Methylenedioxy-
methamphetamine (7405).

I 

1-[1-(2-Thienyl) cyclohexyl] piper-
idine (7470).

I 

Heroin (9200) ............................... I 
Normorphine (9313) ..................... I 
Amphetamine (1100) .................... II 
Methamphetamine (1105) ............ II 
Nabilone (7379) ............................ II 
Phenylcyclohexylamine (7460) ..... II 
Phencyclidine (7471) .................... II 
Cocaine (9041) ............................. II 
Codeine (9050) ............................. II 
Diprenorphine (9085) ................... II 
Benzoylecgonine (9180) ............... II 
Levomethorphan (9210) ............... II 
Levorphanol (9220) ...................... II 
Meperidine (9230) ........................ II 
Metazocine (9240) ........................ II 
Methadone (9250) ........................ II 
Morphine (9300) ........................... II 
Thebaine (9333) ........................... II 
Carfentanil (9773) ......................... II 
Levo-alphacetylmethadol (LAAM) 

(9648).
II 

Fentanyl (9801) ............................ II 

The firm plans to manufacture the 
listed controlled substances for 
laboratory reference standards and 
neurochemicals. 

Any other such applicant and any 
person who is presently registered with 
DEA to manufacture such substance 
may file comments or objections to the 
issuance of the proposed registration. 

Any such comments or objections 
may be addressed, in quintuplicate, to 
the Deputy Assistant Administrator, 
Office of Diversion Control, Drug 
Enforcement Administration, United 
States Department of Justice, 
Washington, DC 20537, Attention: DEA 

Federal Register Representative (CCR), 
and must be filed no later than August 
27, 2002.

Dated: June 14, 2002. 
Laura M. Nagel, 
Deputy Assistant Administrator, Office of 
Diversion Control, Drug Enforcement 
Administration.
[FR Doc. 02–16364 Filed 6–27–02; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–09–M

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR

Employment Standards 
Administration; Wage and Hour 
Division 

Minimum Wages for Federal and 
Federally Assisted Construction; 
General Wage Determination; 
Decisions 

General wage determination decisions 
of the Secretary of Labor are issued in 
accordance with applicable law and are 
based on the information obtained by 
the Department of Labor from its study 
of local wage conditions and data made 
available from other sources. They 
specify the basic hourly wage rates and 
fringe benefits which are determined to 
be prevailing for the described classes of 
laborers and mechanics employed on 
construction projects of a similar 
character and in the localities specified 
therein. 

The determinations in these decisions 
of prevailing rates and fringe benefits 
have been made in accordance with 29 
CFR Part 1, by authority of the Secretary 
of Labor pursuant to the provisions of 
the Davis-Bacon Act of March 3, 1931, 
as amended (46 Stat. 1494, as amended, 
40 U.S.C. 276a) and of other Federal 
statutes referred to in 29 CFR part 1, 
Appendix, as well as such additional 
statutes as may from time to time be 
enacted containing provisions for the 
payment of wages determined to be 
prevailing by the Secretary of labor in 
accordance with the Davis-Bacon Act. 
The prevailing rates and fringe benefits 
determined in these decisions shall, in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
foregoing statutes, constitute the 
minimum wages payable on Federal and 
federally assisted construction projects 
to laborers and mechanics of the 
specified classes engaged on contract 
work of the character and in the 
localities described therein. 

Good cause is hereby found for not 
utilizing notice and public comment 
procedure thereon prior to the issuance 
of these determinations as prescribed in 
5 U.S.C. 553 and not providing for delay 
in the effective date as prescribed in that 
section, because the necessity to issue 

current construction industry wage 
determinations frequently and in large 
volume causes procedures to be 
impractical and contrary to the public 
interest. 

General wage determination 
decisions, and modifications and 
supersedes decisions thereto, contain no 
expiration dates and are effective from 
their date of notice in the Federal 
Register, or on the date written notice 
is received by the agency, whichever is 
earlier. These decisions are to be used 
in accordance with the provisions of 29 
CFR Parts 1 and 5. Accordingly, the 
applicable decision, together with any 
modifications issued, must be made a 
part of every contract for performance of 
the described work within the 
geographic area indicated as required by 
an applicable Federal prevailing wage 
law and 29 CFR Part 5. The wage rates 
and fringe benefits, notice of which is 
published herein, and which are 
contained in the Government Printing 
Office (GPO) document entitled 
‘‘General Wage Determinations Issued 
Under The Davis-Bacon And Related 
Acts,’’ shall be the minimum paid by 
contractors and subcontractors to 
laborers and mechanics. 

Any person, organization, or 
governmental agency having an interest 
in the rates determined as prevailing is 
encouraged to submit wage rate and 
fringe benefit information for 
consideration by the Department. 
Further information and self-
explanatory forms for the purpose of 
submitting this data may be obtained by 
writing to the U.S. Department of Labor, 
Employment Standards Administration, 
Wage and Hour Division, Division of 
Wage Determinations, 200 Constitution 
Avenue, NW., Room S–3014, 
Washington, DC 20210. 

Withdrawal General Wage 
Determination Decisions 

This is to advise all interested parties 
that the Department of Labor is 
withdrawing, from the date of this 
notice, General Wage Determinations 
KS020005 and KS020067. See 
KS020004. 

Contracts for which bids have been 
opened shall not be affected by this 
notice. Also, consistent with 29 CFR 
1.6(c)(2)(i)(A), when the opening of bids 
is less than ten (10) days from the date 
of this notice, this action shall be 
effective unless the agency finds that 
there is insufficient time to notify 
bidders of the change and the finding is 
documented in the contract file. 
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