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–0.35″ w.c. Once the external static 
pressure is set, do not adjust the test 
duct for the remainder of the test. 
Measure furnace fan electrical input 
power (EMax), fuel or electric resistance 
heat kit input energy (QIN, Max), external 
static pressure (ESPMax), steady-state 
efficiency for this setting (EffySS, Max) as 
specified in sections 11.2 and 11.3 of 
ASHRAE 103–2007, outlet air 
temperature (TMax,Out), and temperature 
rise (DTMax). 

(3) Representations. ECR may not 
make representations about the energy 
use of a basic model listed in paragraph 
(1) of this Order for compliance, 
marketing, or other purposes, unless the 
basic model has been tested in 
accordance with the provisions set forth 
in the Order and such representations 
fairly disclose the results of such 
testing. 

(4) This waiver shall remain in effect 
according to the provisions of 10 CFR 
430.27. 

(5) DOE issues this waiver on the 
condition that the statements, 
representations, and information 
provided by ECR are valid and on the 
condition that ECR makes no 
representation on any public-facing 
materials, including websites, marketing 
materials, product spec sheets, labels, 
nameplates, etc., that these basic models 
are designed to be installed in systems 
that provide both heating and cooling. If 
ECR makes any modifications to the 
controls or configurations of these basic 
models, such modifications will render 
the waiver invalid with respect to that 
basic model, and ECR will either be 
required to use the current Federal test 
method or submit a new application for 
a test procedure waiver. DOE may 
rescind or modify this waiver at any 
time if it determines the factual basis 
underlying the petition for waiver is 
incorrect, or the results from the 
alternate test procedure are 
unrepresentative of a basic model’s true 
energy consumption characteristics. 10 
CFR 430.27(k)(1). Likewise, ECR may 
request that DOE rescind or modify the 
waiver if ECR discovers an error in the 
information provided to DOE as part of 
its petition, determines that the waiver 
is no longer needed, or for other 
appropriate reasons. 10 CFR 
430.27(k)(2). 

(6) Granting of this waiver does not 
release ECR from the various 
certification requirements set forth at 10 
CFR part 429. 

Signing Authority 
This document of the Department of 

Energy was signed on March 4, 2021, by 
Kelly Speakes-Backman, Principal 
Deputy Assistant Secretary and Acting 

Assistant Secretary for Energy Efficiency 
and Renewable Energy, pursuant to 
delegated authority from the Secretary 
of Energy. That document with the 
original signature and date is 
maintained by DOE. For administrative 
purposes only, and in compliance with 
requirements of the Office of the Federal 
Register, the undersigned DOE Federal 
Register Liaison Officer has been 
authorized to sign and submit the 
document in electronic format for 
publication, as an official document of 
the Department of Energy. This 
administrative process in no way alters 
the legal effect of this document upon 
publication in the Federal Register. 

Signed in Washington, DC, on March 4, 
2021. 
Treena V. Garrett, 
Federal Register Liaison Officer, U.S. 
Department of Energy. 
[FR Doc. 2021–04866 Filed 3–8–21; 8:45 am] 
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Take notice that on March 2, 2021, 
pursuant to sections 206, 306, and 309 
of the Federal Power Act, 16 U.S.C. 
824e, 825e, and 825h and Rule 206 of 
the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission’s (Commission) Rules of 
Practice and Procedure, 18 CFR 385.206, 
Louisiana Public Service Commission, 
Arkansas Public Service Commission, 
and Council of The City of New Orleans, 
Louisiana (Complainants) filed a formal 
complaint against System Energy 
Resources, Inc. (SERI), Entergy Services, 
LLC, Entergy Operations, Inc., and 
Entergy Corporation, (collectively, 
Respondents) alleging that SERI has 
violated the obligation of prudent utility 
management in operating the Grand 
Gulf nuclear unit, resulting in large 
overcharges to its four affiliated 
customers, Entergy Arkansas, LLC, 
Entergy Louisiana, LLC, Entergy New 
Orleans, LLC, and Entergy Mississippi, 
LLC and their customers, pursuant to a 
Unit Power Sales Agreement, all as 
more fully explained in the complaint. 

The Complainants certify that copies 
of the complaint were served on the 

contacts listed for Respondents in the 
Commission’s list of Corporate Officials. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. The Respondent’s answer 
and all interventions, or protests must 
be filed on or before the comment date. 
The Respondent’s answer, motions to 
intervene, and protests must be served 
on the Complainants. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings of comments, protests 
and interventions in lieu of paper using 
the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://
www.ferc.gov. Persons unable to file 
electronically may mail similar 
pleadings to the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First Street 
NE, Washington, DC 20426. Hand 
delivered submissions in docketed 
proceedings should be delivered to 
Health and Human Services, 12225 
Wilkins Avenue, Rockville, Maryland 
20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (https://
www.ferc.gov/) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ 
link. Enter the docket number excluding 
the last three digits in the docket 
number field to access the document. At 
this time, the Commission has 
suspended access to the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on March 22, 2021. 

Dated: March 3, 2021. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2021–04852 Filed 3–8–21; 8:45 am] 
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