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Interagency Council on Environmental 
Justice (Interagency Council). The 
WHEJAC will provide advice and 
recommendations about broad cross- 
cutting issues, related but not limited to, 
issues of environmental justice and 
pollution reduction, energy, climate 
change mitigation and resiliency, 
environmental health, and racial 
inequity. The WHEJAC’s efforts will 
include a broad range of strategic, 
scientific, technological, regulatory, 
community engagement, and economic 
issues related to environmental justice. 

Registration: Individual registration is 
required for each of the virtual public 
meetings. Information on how to register 
is located at https://www.epa.gov/ 
environmentaljustice/white-house- 
environmental-justice-advisory-council. 
Registration for the meetings is available 
through the scheduled end time of each 
meeting day. Registration to speak 
during the public comment period will 
close 11:59 p.m., Eastern Daylight Time, 
one (1) week prior to meeting date. 
When registering, please provide your 
name, organization, city and state, and 
email address for follow up. Please also 
indicate whether you would like to 
provide public comment during the 
meetings, and whether you are 
submitting written comments at the 
time of registration. 

A. Public Comment 

Every effort will be made to hear from 
as many registered public commenters 
during the time specified on the agenda. 
Individuals or groups making remarks 
during the public comment period will 
be limited to three (3) minutes. To 
accommodate the number of people 
who want to address the WHEJAC 
during the time allotted on the agenda, 
only one representative of a particular 
community, organization, or group will 
be allowed to speak. Submission of 
written comments for the record are 
strongly encouraged. The suggested 
format for individuals providing public 
comments is as follows: Name of 
speaker; name of organization/ 
community; city and state; and email 
address; brief description of the 
concern, and what you want the 
WHEJAC to advise CEQ to do. Written 
comments received by registration 
deadline, will be included in the 
materials distributed to the WHEJAC 
prior to the meeting. Written comments 
received after that time will be provided 
to the WHEJAC as time allows. All 
written commenters should use the 
webform at https://www.epa.gov/ 
environmentaljustice/forms/white- 
house-environmental-justice-advisory- 
council-whejac-public-comment to 

submit comments, and email any 
additional materials to whejac@epa.gov. 

B. Information About Services for 
Individuals With Disabilities or 
Requiring English Language 
Translation Assistance 

For information about access or 
services for individuals requiring 
assistance, please contact Karen L. 
Martin, via email at whejac@epa.gov. To 
request special accommodations for a 
disability or other assistance, please 
submit your request at least seven (7) 
working days prior to the meeting, to 
give EPA sufficient time to process your 
request. All requests should be sent to 
the email listed in the FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT section. 

Matthew Tejada, 
Director for the Office of Environmental 
Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2021–08107 Filed 4–19–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

EXPORT-IMPORT BANK OF THE 
UNITED STATES 

[Public Notice: 2021–3002] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Comment Request 

AGENCY: Export-Import Bank of the 
United States. 
ACTION: Submission for OMB review and 
comments request. 

SUMMARY: The Export-Import Bank of 
the United States (EXIM), as part of its 
continuing effort to reduce paperwork 
and respondent burden, invites the 
general public and other Federal 
Agencies to comment on the proposed 
information collection, as required by 
the paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before May 20, 2021 to be assured of 
consideration. 
ADDRESSES: Comments may be 
submitted electronically on 
WWW.REGULATIONS.GOV (EIB 92–29) 
or by mail to Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, 725 17th Street NW, 
Washington, DC 20038, Attn: OMB 
3048–0017 The application tool can be 
reviewed at: https://www.exim.gov/ 
sites/default/files//forms/eib92-29.pdf. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Export-Import Bank of the United 
States, pursuant to the Export-Import 
Bank Act of 1945, as amended (12 
U.S.C. 635, et seq.), facilitates the 
finance of the export of U.S. goods and 
services. The ‘‘Report of Premiums 
Payable for Exporters Only’’ form will 
be used by exporters to report and pay 

premiums on insured shipments to 
various foreign buyers. 

Title and Form Number: EIB 92–29 
Export-Import Bank Report of Premiums 
Payable for Exporters Only. 

OMB Number: 3048–0017. 
Type of Review: Renewal. 
Need and Use: The ‘‘Report of 

Premiums Payable for Exporters Only’’ 
form is used by exporters to report and 
pay premiums on insured shipments to 
various foreign buyers under the terms 
of the policy and to certify that 
premiums have been correctly 
computed and remitted. The ‘Report of 
Premiums Payable for Exporters Only’ is 
used by EXIM to determine the 
eligibility of the shipment(s) and to 
calculate the premium due to EXIM for 
its support of the shipment(s) under its 
insurance program. 

Affected Public: This form affects 
entities involved in the export of U.S. 
goods and services. 

Monthly Number of Respondents: 
2,600. 

Estimated Time per Respondent: 15 
minutes. 

Annual Burden Hours: 7,800 hours. 
Frequency of Reporting or Use: 

Monthly. 
Government Expenses: 
Reviewing Time per Year: 7,800 

hours. 
Average Wages per Hour: $42.50. 
Average Cost per Year: $331,500. 
Benefits and Overhead: 20%. 
Total Government Cost: $397,800. 

Bassam Doughman, 
IT Specialist. 
[FR Doc. 2021–08028 Filed 4–19–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6690–01–P 

EXPORT-IMPORT BANK 

[Public Notice: 2021–6004] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request; Generic Clearance 
for the Collection of Qualitative 
Feedback on Agency Service Delivery 

AGENCY: Export-Import Bank of the 
United States. 
ACTION: Submission for OMB review and 
comments request. 

SUMMARY: The Export-Import Bank of 
the United States (EXIM), as part of its 
continuing effort to reduce paperwork 
and respondent burden, invites the 
general public and other Federal 
Agencies to comment on the proposed 
information collection, as required by 
the paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before June 21, 2021 to be assured of 
consideration. 
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