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15 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(12). 

Division of Trading and Markets, 
pursuant to delegated authority.15 

Kevin M. O’Neill, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2013–26269 Filed 11–1–13; 8:45 am] 
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In the Matter of Heritage Worldwide, 
Inc., Impala Mineral Exploration Corp., 
Klondike Star Mineral Corporation, MIV 
Therapeutics Inc., Most Home Corp., 
Moventis Capital, Inc., and 
OrganiTECH USA, Inc.; Order of 
Suspension of Trading 

October 31, 2013. 
It appears to the Securities and 

Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Heritage 
Worldwide, Inc. because it has not filed 
any periodic reports since the period 
ended December 31, 2008. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Impala 
Mineral Exploration Corp. because it 
has not filed any periodic reports since 
the period ended March 31, 2009. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Klondike 
Star Mineral Corporation because it has 
not filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended May 31, 2008. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of MIV 
Therapeutics Inc. because it has not 
filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended November 30, 2008. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Most Home 
Corp. because it has not filed any 
periodic reports since the period ended 
April 30, 2008. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Moventis 
Capital, Inc. because it has not filed any 
periodic reports since the period ended 
March 31, 2007. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 

concerning the securities of 
OrganiTECH USA, Inc. because it has 
not filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended September 30, 2008. 

The Commission is of the opinion that 
the public interest and the protection of 
investors require a suspension of trading 
in the securities of the above-listed 
companies. Therefore, it is ordered, 
pursuant to Section 12(k) of the 
Securities Exchange Act of 1934, that 
trading in the securities of the above- 
listed companies is suspended for the 
period from 9:30 a.m. EDT on October 
31, 2013, through 11:59 p.m. EST on 
November 13, 2013. 

By the Commission. 
Jill M. Peterson, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2013–26446 Filed 10–31–13; 4:15 pm] 
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Acies Corporation, Immtech 
Pharmaceuticals, Inc., MRU Holdings, 
Inc., MSTI Holdings, Inc., Nestor, Inc., 
New Generation Holdings, Inc., and 
Nuevo Financial Center, Inc.; Order of 
Suspension of Trading 

October 31, 2013. 
It appears to the Securities and 

Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Acies 
Corporation because it has not filed any 
periodic reports since the period ended 
June 30, 2010. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Immtech 
Pharmaceuticals, Inc. because it has not 
filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended March 31, 2009. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of MRU 
Holdings, Inc. because it has not filed 
any periodic reports since the period 
ended September 30, 2008. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of MSTI 
Holdings, Inc. because it has not filed 
any periodic reports since the period 
ended September 30, 2008. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Nestor, Inc. 
because it has not filed any periodic 

reports since the period ended 
September 30, 2008. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of New 
Generation Holdings, Inc. because it has 
not filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended June 30, 2009. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Nuevo 
Financial Center, Inc. because it has not 
filed any periodic reports since the 
period ended September 30, 2007. 

The Commission is of the opinion that 
the public interest and the protection of 
investors require a suspension of trading 
in the securities of the above-listed 
companies. Therefore, it is ordered, 
pursuant to Section 12(k) of the 
Securities Exchange Act of 1934, that 
trading in the securities of the above- 
listed companies is suspended for the 
period from 9:30 a.m. EDT on October 
31, 2013, through 11:59 p.m. EST on 
November 13, 2013. 

By the Commission. 
Jill M. Peterson, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2013–26447 Filed 10–31–13; 4:15 pm] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Requests for Comments; 
Clearance of New Approval of 
Information Collection: Safety 
Awareness, Feedback, and Evaluation 
(SAFE) Program 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, FAA 
invites public comments about our 
intention to request the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) 
approval for a new information 
collection. The Federal Register Notice 
with a 60-day comment period soliciting 
comments on the following collection of 
information was published on April 12, 
2013, vol. 78, no. 71, pages 22020– 
22021. The information collected will 
be used by FAA Flight Standards 
Service to improve the quality and 
delivery of the services and products 
provided to their stakeholders. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
submitted by December 4, 2013. 
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