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(b) Frequency of response: Twice. 
(c) Estimated average burden per 

response: .188 hours. 
(d) Estimated total reporting burden: 

2333.32 hours. 
(e) Estimated annual cost to 

respondents: 0.00. 
General Description of Collection: The 

Peace Corps experienced unprecedented 
challenges during the COVID–19 
pandemic, including recalling its entire 
Volunteer workforce in March 2020. 
The Peace Corps will launch a new 
national awareness and recruitment 
campaign as it returns to full service to 
promote the organization, its mission, 
goals, and values, and to attract and 
recruit qualified and diverse Volunteer 
applicants. The Peace Corps’ Office of 
Communications will use the 
information collected by the Peace 
Corps Awareness and Affinity: National 
Survey of U.S. Adults to help assess the 
effectiveness of the new campaign. The 
survey will also collect information to 
help broaden the pool of potential 
Volunteers and engage more diverse 
audiences. This information collection 
will also be used to gather information 
and insights to identify key audience 
segments and help ensure the efficiency 
and success of future marketing efforts 
by: 

• Identifying levels of awareness, 
knowledge, attitudes and opinions 
about the Peace Corps among the 
general U.S. public and targeted 
audience segments; 

• Collecting insights to inform 
communications, education, and 
outreach strategies by understanding 
which themes resonate most with 
different audience segments; and, 

• Determining the best channels for 
communication. 

The Office of Communications will 
conduct this survey twice: once to serve 
as a baseline prior to the launch of its 
national awareness and recruitment 
campaign, and once after the campaign 
has launched to assess campaign 
impact. 

Request for Comment: Peace Corps 
invites comments on whether the 
proposed collections of information are 
necessary for proper performance of the 
functions of the Peace Corps, including 
whether the information will have 
practical use; the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the information 
to be collected; and, ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
automated collection techniques, when 
appropriate, and other forms of 
information technology. 

This notice is issued in Washington, DC, 
on December 13, 2022. 
Brianna Johnson, 
Acting FOIA/Privacy Act Officer, 
Management. 
[FR Doc. 2022–27360 Filed 12–15–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6051–01–P 

PENSION BENEFIT GUARANTY 
CORPORATION 

Solicitation of Nominations for 
Appointment to the Advisory 
Committee of the Pension Benefit 
Guaranty Corporation 

AGENCY: Pension Benefit Guaranty 
Corporation. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Pension Benefit Guaranty 
Corporation (PBGC) is soliciting 
nominations for appointment to the 
Advisory Committee of the PBGC. 
DATES: Nominations must be received 
on or before January 30, 2023. Please 
allow three weeks for regular mail 
delivery to PBGC. 
ADDRESSES: Nominations must be 
submitted electronically to 
OfficeOfTheDirector@pbgc.gov as email 
attachments in Word or pdf format, or 
by mail to Office of the Director, 
Pension Benefit Guaranty Corporation, 
445 12th Street SW, Washington, DC 
20024–2101. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

The Pension Benefit Guaranty 
Corporation (PBGC or the Corporation) 
administers the pension plan 
termination insurance program under 
Title IV of the Employee Retirement 
Income Security Act of 1974 (ERISA). 
Section 4002(h) of ERISA provides for 
the establishment of an Advisory 
Committee to the Corporation. The 
Advisory Committee consists of seven 
members appointed by the President 
from among individuals recommended 
by the PBGC Board of Directors, which 
consists of the Secretaries of Labor, 
Treasury, and Commerce. The Advisory 
Committee members are as follows: Two 
representatives of employee 
organizations; two representatives of 
employers who maintain pension plans; 
and three representatives of the general 
public. 

No more than four members of the 
Committee shall be members of the 
same political party. Anyone currently 
subject to federal registration 
requirements as a lobbyist is not eligible 
for appointment. 

Advisory Committee members must 
have experience with employee 
organizations, employers who maintain 

defined benefit pension plans, the 
administration or advising of pension 
plans, or in related fields. Appointments 
are for 3-year terms. Reappointments are 
possible but are subject to the 
appointment process. 

The Advisory Committee’s prescribed 
duties include advising the Corporation 
as to its policies and procedures relating 
to investment of moneys, and other 
issues as the Corporation may request or 
as the Advisory Committee determines 
appropriate. The Advisory Committee 
meets at least six times each year. At 
least one meeting is a joint meeting with 
the PBGC Board of Directors. 

By February 19, 2023, the terms of 
three of the Advisory Committee 
members, one representing the general 
public and two representing employee 
organizations, will have expired. 
Therefore, PBGC is seeking nominations 
for three seats. 

PBGC is committed to equal 
opportunity in the workplace and seeks 
a broad-based and diverse Advisory 
Committee. 

If you or your organization wants to 
nominate one or more people for 
appointment to the Advisory Committee 
to represent the general public or 
employee organizations, you may 
submit nominations to PBGC. 
Nominations may be in the form of a 
letter, resolution or petition, signed by 
the person making the nomination. 
PBGC encourages you to include 
additional supporting letters of 
nomination. PBGC will not consider 
self-nominees who have no supporting 
letters. Please do not include any 
information that you do not want 
publicly disclosed. 

Nominations, including supporting 
letters, should: state the person’s 
qualifications to serve on the Advisory 
Committee (including any specialized 
knowledge or experience relevant to the 
nominee’s proposed Advisory 
Committee position to represent the 
general public or employee 
organizations); state that the candidate 
will accept appointment to the Advisory 
Committee if offered; include the 
nominee’s full name, work affiliation, 
mailing address, phone number, and 
email address; include the nominator’s 
full name, mailing address, phone 
number, and email address; and include 
the nominator’s signature, whether sent 
by email or otherwise. 

PBGC will contact nominees for 
information on their political affiliation 
and their status as registered lobbyists. 
Nominees should be aware of the time 
commitment for attending meetings and 
actively participating in the work of the 
Advisory Committee. Historically, this 
has meant a commitment of at least 15 
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1 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(1). 
2 17 CFR 240.19b–4. 
3 See Securities Exchange Act Release No. 96046 

(October 12, 2022), 87 FR 63119. 
4 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(12). 
1 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(1). 
2 17 CFR 240.19b–4. 
3 See Securities Exchange Act Release No. 96144 

(October 24, 2022), 87 FR 65273. 
4 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(12). 

days per year. PBGC has a process for 
vetting nominees under consideration 
for appointment. 

Issued in Washington, DC. 

Gordon Hartogensis, 
Director, Pension Benefit Guaranty 
Corporation. 
[FR Doc. 2022–27267 Filed 12–15–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7709–02–P 

POSTAL SERVICE 

International Product Change— 
International Priority Airmail, 
Commercial ePacket, Priority Mail 
Express International, Priority Mail 
International & First-Class Package 
International Service Agreement 

AGENCY: Postal ServiceTM. 

ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Postal Service gives 
notice of filing a request with the Postal 
Regulatory Commission to add an 
International Priority Airmail, 
Commercial ePacket, Priority Mail 
Express International, Priority Mail 
International & First-Class Package 
International Service contract to the list 
of Negotiated Service Agreements in the 
Competitive Product List in the Mail 
Classification Schedule. 

DATES: Date of notice: December 16, 
2022. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Christopher C. Meyerson, (202) 268– 
7820. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
United States Postal Service® hereby 
gives notice that, pursuant to 39 U.S.C. 
3642 and 3632(b)(3), on December 9, 
2022, it filed with the Postal Regulatory 
Commission a USPS Request to Add 
International Priority Airmail, 
Commercial ePacket, Priority Mail 
Express International, Priority Mail 
International & First-Class Package 
International Service Contract 11 to 
Competitive Product List. Documents 
are available at www.prc.gov, Docket 
Nos. MC2023–75 and CP2023–76. 

Ruth B. Stevenson, 
Chief Counsel, Ethics & Legal Compliance. 
[FR Doc. 2022–27253 Filed 12–15–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

POSTAL SERVICE 

International Product Change— 
International Priority Airmail, 
Commercial ePacket, Priority Mail 
Express International, Priority Mail 
International & First-Class Package 
International Service with Reseller 
Agreement 

AGENCY: Postal ServiceTM. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Postal Service gives 
notice of filing a request with the Postal 
Regulatory Commission to add an 
International Priority Airmail, 
Commercial ePacket, Priority Mail 
Express International, Priority Mail 
International & First-Class Package 
International Service with Reseller 
contract to the list of Negotiated Service 
Agreements in the Competitive Product 
List in the Mail Classification Schedule. 
DATES: Date of notice: December 16, 
2022. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Christopher C. Meyerson, (202) 268– 
7820. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
United States Postal Service® hereby 
gives notice that, pursuant to 39 U.S.C. 
3642 and 3632(b)(3), on December 9, 
2022, it filed with the Postal Regulatory 
Commission a USPS Request to Add 
International Priority Airmail, 
Commercial ePacket, Priority Mail 
Express International, Priority Mail 
International & First-Class Package 
International Service with Reseller 
Contract 6 to Competitive Product List. 
Documents are available at 
www.prc.gov, Docket Nos. MC2023–76 
and CP2023–77. 

Sarah Sullivan, 
Attorney, Ethics & Legal Compliance. 
[FR Doc. 2022–27251 Filed 12–15–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7710–12–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[Release No. 34–96476; File No. SR–MRX– 
2022–20] 

Self-Regulatory Organizations; Nasdaq 
MRX, LLC; Notice of Withdrawal of 
Proposed Rule Change To Amend 
Options 7, Section 6 To Add Port Fees 

December 12, 2022. 
On October 11, 2022, Nasdaq MRX, 

LLC (‘‘MRX’’) filed with the Securities 
and Exchange Commission 
(‘‘Commission’’), pursuant to Section 
19(b)(1) of the Securities Exchange Act 

of 1934 1 and Rule 19b–4 thereunder,2 a 
proposed rule change to assess port fees. 
The proposed rule change was 
published for comment in the Federal 
Register on October 18, 2022.3 

On December 8, 2022, MRX withdrew 
the proposed rule change (SR–MRX– 
2022–20). 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Trading and Markets, pursuant to delegated 
authority.4 

Sherry R. Haywood, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–27256 Filed 12–15–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[Release No. 34–96477; File No. SR–MRX– 
2022–22] 

Self-Regulatory Organizations; Nasdaq 
MRX, LLC; Notice of Withdrawal of 
Proposed Rule Change To Amend 
Options 7, Section 7 To Add Market 
Data Fees 

December 12, 2022. 

On October 14, 2022, Nasdaq MRX, 
LLC (‘‘MRX’’) filed with the Securities 
and Exchange Commission 
(‘‘Commission’’), pursuant to Section 
19(b)(1) of the Securities Exchange Act 
of 1934 1 and Rule 19b–4 thereunder,2 a 
proposed rule change to assess market 
data fees. The proposed rule change was 
published for comment in the Federal 
Register on October 28, 2022.3 

On December 8, 2022, MRX withdrew 
the proposed rule change (SR–MRX– 
2022–22). 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Trading and Markets, pursuant to delegated 
authority.4 

Sherry R. Haywood, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–27257 Filed 12–15–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 
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