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SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, this 
notice announces the Small Business 
Administration’s intentions to request 
approval on a new and/or currently 
approved information collection. 
DATES: Submit comments on or before 
February 18, 2014. 
ADDRESSES: Send all comments 
regarding whether this information 
collection is necessary for the proper 
performance of the function of the 
agency, whether the burden estimates 
are accurate, and if there are ways to 
minimize the estimated burden and 
enhance the quality of the collection, to 
John Wade, Financial Analyst, Office of 
Financial Assistance, Small Business 
Administration, 409 3rd Street, 8th 
Floor, Washington, DC 20416. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: John 
Wade, Financial Analyst, 202–205– 
3647, john.wade@sba.gov; Curtis B. 
Rich, Management Analyst, 202–205– 
7030, curtis.rich@sba.gov. 

Title: ‘‘Secondary Market for Section 
504 First Mortgage Loan Pool Program’’. 

Abstract: These forms captures the 
terms and conditions of the Small 
Business Administration’s (SBA) new 
Secondary Market for Section 504 First 
Mortgage Loan Pool Program. SBA 
needs this information collection in 
order to identify program participants, 
terms of financial transactions involving 
federal government guaranties, and 
reporting on program efficiency, 
including the proper use of Recovery 
Act funds. 

Form Numbers: 2401, 2402, 2403, 
2404. 

Annual Responses: 12,490. 
Annual Burden: 33,075. 

Curtis Rich, 
Management Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2013–30061 Filed 12–17–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8025–01–P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

Data Collection Available for Public 
Comments 

ACTION: 60-Day notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, this 
notice announces the Small Business 
Administration’s intentions to request 
approval on a new and/or currently 
approved information collection. 
DATES: Submit comments on or before 
February 18, 2014. 
ADDRESSES: Send all comments 
regarding whether this information 
collection is necessary for the proper 

performance of the function of the 
agency, whether the burden estimates 
are accurate, and if there are ways to 
minimize the estimated burden and 
enhance the quality of the collection, to 
Mary Frias, Loan Specialist, Office of 
Financial Assistance, Small Business 
Administration, 409 3rd Street, 8th 
Floor, Washington, DC 20416. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Mary Frias, Loan Specialist, 202–401– 
8234, mary.frias@sba.gov; Curtis B. 
Rich, Management Analyst, 202–205– 
7030, curtis.rich@sba.gov. 

Title: ‘‘Intermediary Lending Pilot 
Program Application and Reporting 
Requirements’’. 

Abstract: SBA has established a pilot 
loan program, the Intermediary Lending 
Pilot Program (ILPP), to make direct 
loans to eligible intermediaries, for the 
purpose of making loans to startup, 
newly established, and growing small 
business concerns. This requested 
information, which will be provided by 
intermediaries that wish to participate 
in ILPP, will be used to select ILPP 
intermediaries, to monitor disbursement 
of ILPP loan proceeds, and to monitor 
program effectiveness while minimizing 
risk to the federal taxpayer. 

Form Number’s: 2417, 2418. 
Annual Responses: 840. 
Annual Burden: 10,520. 

Curtis Rich, 
Management Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2013–30062 Filed 12–17–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8025–01–P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

Data Collection Available for Public 
Comments 

ACTION: 60 Day notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, this 
notice announces the Small Business 
Administration’s intentions to request 
approval on a new and/or currently 
approved information collection. 
DATES: Submit comments on or before 
February 18, 2014. 
ADDRESSES: Send all comments 
regarding whether this information 
collection is necessary for the proper 
performance of the function of the 
agency, whether the burden estimates 
are accurate, and if there are ways to 
minimize the estimated burden and 
enhance the quality of the collection, to 
John Wade, Financial Analyst, Office of 
Financial Assistance, Small Business 
Administration, 409 3rd Street, 8th 
Floor, Washington, DC 20416. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: John 
Wade, Financial Analyst, 202–205– 
3647, johnwade@sba.gov; Curtis B. Rich, 
Management Analyst, 202–205–7030, 
curtis.rich@sba.gov. 

Title: ‘‘Form of Detached Assignment 
for U.S. Small Business Administration 
Loan Pool or Guarantee Interest 
Certificate’’. 

Abstract: Pursuant 5(h)(i)(c)to The 
Small Business Market Improvement 
Act the seller of a loan or pool 
certificate must disclose the information 
on this form to the purchaser, constant 
annual prepayment rate based upon the 
seller’s analysis of the prepayment 
histories of SBA guaranteed loans with 
similar maturities and additional 
disclosure information on the terms, 
conditions and yield of the securities. 

Form Number: 1088. 
Annual Responses: 856. 
Annual Burden: 733. 

Curtis Rich, 
Management Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2013–30060 Filed 12–17–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

[License No. 09/09–0467v] 

The Central Valley Fund Il SBIC, L.P.; 
Notice Seeking Exemption Under 
Section 312 of the Small Business 
Investment Act, Conflicts of Interest 

Notice is hereby given that The 
Central Valley Fund II SBIC, L.P., 1590 
Drew Avenue, Suite 110, Davis, CA 
95618, a Federal Licensee under the 
Small Business Investment Act of 1958, 
as amended (‘‘the Act’’), in connection 
with the financing of a small concerns, 
has sought an exemption under Section 
312 of the Act and Section 107.730, 
Financings which Constitute Conflicts 
of Interest of the Small Business 
Administration (‘‘SBA’’) Rules and 
Regulations (13 CFR 107.730). The 
Central Valley Fund Il SBIC, L.P. is 
proposing to provide financing to Quest 
Discovery Services, Inc., 981 Ridder 
Park Drive, San Jose, CA 95131. The 
financing will be used, in part, for 
working capital, to pay the seller, to pay 
off existing debt, and to pay fees and 
expenses. 

The proposed transaction is brought 
within the purview of § 107.730 of the 
Regulations because Quest Discovery 
Services, Inc. will be using financing 
proceeds from The Central Valley Fund 
II SBIC, L.P. in part to discharge 
obligations to The Central Valley Fund 
I, L.P., which is an Associate of The 
Central Valley Fund II SBIC, L.P. as 
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