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rail service. Although not all Class I 
carriers are experiencing service 
problems to the same degree, the Board 
is also requiring certain reporting 
requirements to apply to all Class I 
carriers so that the Board can assess the 
current service issues across the rail 
network as a whole. Because the U.S. 
rail system is an interconnected 
network, problems in one geographic 
area can quickly spread elsewhere. The 
supplemented reporting requirements 
will give the agency and stakeholders 
access to data needed for a more-timely 
understanding of the extent and location 
of the acute service issues and labor and 
equipment shortages. The information 
received by the Board from this 
collection will be filed in Docket No. EP 
770 (Sub-No. 1) and will be publicly 
available at www.stb.gov and may be 
found by a search in that docket under 
the ‘‘Proceedings and Actions’’ pull- 
down menu. 

The Board makes this submission 
because, under the PRA, a federal 
agency that conducts or sponsors a 
collection of information must display a 
currently valid OMB control number. A 
collection of information, which is 
defined in 44 U.S.C. 3502(3) and 5 CFR 
1320.3(c), includes agency requirements 
that persons submit reports, keep 
records, or provide information to the 
agency, third parties, or the public. 
Under 5 CFR 1320.13, emergency 
processing is appropriate here and the 
Board is providing an extended two- 
week comment period through 
publication in the Federal Register 
concerning each proposed collection of 
information. 

Dated: June 13, 2022. 
Aretha Laws-Byrum, 
Clearance Clerk. 
[FR Doc. 2022–13029 Filed 6–16–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4915–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

Notice of Intent To Release Certain 
Properties From All Terms, Conditions, 
Reservations and Restrictions of a 
Quitclaim Deed Agreement Between 
the City of Fernandina Beach and the 
Federal Aviation Administration for the 
Fernandina Beach Municipal Airport, 
Fernandina Beach, FL 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA), DOT. 
ACTION: Request for public comment. 

SUMMARY: The FAA hereby provides 
notice of intent to release 0.28 acres at 
the Fernandina Beach Municipal 

Airport, Fernandina Beach, FL from the 
conditions, reservations, and 
restrictions as contained in a Quitclaim 
Deed agreement between the FAA and 
the City of Fernandina Beach, dated July 
9, 1947. The release of property will 
allow the City of Fernandina Beach to 
dispose of the property for other than 
aeronautical purposes. The property is 
located on the North side of Airport 
Road at the Fernandina Beach 
Municipal Airport, within the city 
limits of Fernandina Beach, Nassau 
County, Florida. The parcel is currently 
designated as surplus property. The 
property will be released of its federal 
obligations for the purpose of selling the 
property at fair market value for light 
industrial future commmerical 
development. The fair market value 
lease of this parcel has been determined 
to be $40,000. 

Documents reflecting the Sponsor’s 
request are available, by appointment 
only, for inspection at the Fernandina 
Beach Municipal Airport and the FAA 
Airports District Office. 

ADDRESSES: Documents are available for 
review at Fernandina Beach Municipal 
Airport, and the FAA Airports District 
Office, 8427 SouthPark Circle, Suite 
524, Orlando, FL 32819. Written 
comments on the Sponsor’s request 
must be delivered or mailed to: Jenny 
Iglesias-Hamann, Community Planner, 
Orlando Airports District Office, 8427 
SouthPark Circle, Suite 524, Orlando, 
FL 32819. 

DATES: Comments are due on or before 
July 18, 2022. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section 
125 of The Wendell H. Ford Aviation 
Investment and Reform Act for the 21st 
Century (AIR–21) requires the FAA to 
provide an opportunity for public notice 
and comment prior to the ‘‘waiver’’ or 
‘‘modification’’ of a sponsor’s Federal 
obligation to use certain airport land for 
non-aeronautical purposes. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Jenny Iglesias-Hamann, Community 
Planner, Orlando Airports District 
Office, 8427 SouthPark Circle, Suite 
524, Orlando, FL 32819. 

Rebecca Henry Harper, 
Acting Manager, Orlando Airports District 
Office, Southern Region. 
[FR Doc. 2022–13027 Filed 6–16–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–13–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

Membership in the National Parks 
Overflights Advisory Group 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration, (FAA), DOT. 
ACTION: Solicitation of applications. 

SUMMARY: The Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA) and the National 
Park Service (NPS) invite interested 
persons to apply to fill one current and 
one upcoming vacancy on the National 
Parks Overflights Advisory Group 
(NPOAG). This notice invites interested 
persons to apply for the current and 
upcoming openings. The current 
opening is for a representative of Native 
American tribes. The upcoming opening 
is for a representative of environmental 
concerns. 
DATES: Persons interested in these 
membership openings will need to 
apply by July 29, 2022. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Keith Lusk, Special Programs Staff, 
Federal Aviation Administration, 
Western-Pacific Region Headquarters, 
777 S Aviation Boulevard, Suite 150, El 
Segundo, CA 90245, telephone: (424) 
405–7017, email: Keith.Lusk@faa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 

The National Parks Air Tour 
Management Act of 2000 (the Act) was 
enacted on April 5, 2000, as Public Law 
106–181, and subsequently amended in 
the FAA Modernization and Reform Act 
of 2012. The Act required the 
establishment of the advisory group 
within one year after its enactment. The 
NPOAG was established in March 2001. 
The advisory group is comprised of 
representatives of general aviation, 
commercial air tour operators, 
environmental concerns, and Native 
American tribes. The Administrator of 
the FAA and the Director of NPS (or 
their designees) serve as ex officio 
members of the group. Representatives 
of the Administrator and Director serve 
alternating 1-year terms as chairman of 
the advisory group. 

In accordance with the Act, the 
advisory group provides ‘‘advice, 
information, and recommendations to 
the Administrator and the Director— 

(1) On the implementation of this title 
[the Act] and the amendments made by 
this title; 

(2) On commonly accepted quiet 
aircraft technology for use in 
commercial air tour operations over a 
national park or tribal lands, which will 
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receive preferential treatment in a given 
air tour management plan; 

(3) On other measures that might be 
taken to accommodate the interests of 
visitors to national parks; and 

(4) At the request of the Administrator 
and the Director, safety, environmental, 
and other issues related to commercial 
air tour operations over a national park 
or tribal lands.’’ 

Membership 
The current NPOAG is made up of 

one member representing general 
aviation, three members representing 
the commercial air tour industry, four 
members representing environmental 
concerns, and two members 
representing Native American tribes. 
Members serve three year terms. Current 
members of the NPOAG are as follows: 

Murray Huling representing general 
aviation; Eric Lincoln, James Viola, and 
John Becker representing commercial air 
tour operators; Robert Randall, Dick 
Hingson, Les Blomberg, and John 
Eastman representing environmental 
interests; and Carl Slater representing 
Native American tribes, with one 
current opening. The three-year term of 
Mr. Randall expires on September 18, 
2022. 

Selections 
In order to retain balance within the 

NPOAG, the FAA and NPS are seeking 
candidates interested in filling the one 
current vacant seat representing Native 
American tribes and the one upcoming 
seat representing environmental 
concerns. The FAA and NPS invite 
persons interested in these openings on 
the NPOAG to contact Mr. Keith Lusk 
(contact information is written above in 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT). 
Requests to serve on the NPOAG must 
be made to Mr. Lusk in writing and 
postmarked or emailed on or before July 
29, 2022. Any request to fill one of these 
seats must describe the requestor’s 
affiliation with federally-recognized 
Native American tribes or any 
environmental stakeholder groups, as 
appropriate. The request should also 
explain what expertise the requestor 
would bring to the NPOAG as related to 
issues and concerns with aircraft flights 
over national parks or tribal lands. The 
term of service for NPOAG members is 
3 years. Members may re-apply for 
another term. 

On August 13, 2014, the Office of 
Management and Budget issued revised 
guidance regarding the prohibition 
against appointing or not reappointing 
federally registered lobbyists to serve on 
advisory committees (79 FR 47482). 

Therefore, before appointing an 
applicant to serve on the NPOAG, the 

FAA and NPS will require the 
prospective candidate to certify that 
they are not a federally registered 
lobbyist. 

Issued in El Segundo, CA, on June 13, 
2022. 
Keith Lusk, 
Program Manager, Special Programs Staff, 
Western-Pacific Region. 
[FR Doc. 2022–13055 Filed 6–16–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–13–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Highway Administration 

[Docket No. FHWA 2022–0019] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Notice of Request for New 
Information Collection 

AGENCY: Federal Highway 
Administration (FHWA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The FHWA invites public 
comments about our intention to request 
the Office of Management and Budget’s 
(OMB) approval to submit one 
information collection, which is 
summarized below under 
Supplementary Information. We are 
required to publish this notice in the 
Federal Register by the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Please submit comments by 
August 16, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments 
identified by Docket ID FHWA 2022– 
0019 by any of the following methods: 

Website: For access to the docket to 
read background documents or 
comments received, go to the Federal 
eRulemaking Portal: http://
www.regulations.gov. Follow the online 
instructions for submitting comments. 

Fax: 1–202–493–2251. 
Mail: Docket Management Facility, 

U.S. Department of Transportation, 
West Building Ground Floor, Room 
W12–140, 1200 New Jersey Avenue SE, 
Washington, DC 20590–0001. 

Hand Delivery or Courier: U.S. 
Department of Transportation, West 
Building Ground Floor, Room W12–140, 
1200 New Jersey Avenue SE, 
Washington, DC 20590, between 9 a.m. 
and 5 p.m. ET, Monday through Friday, 
except Federal holidays. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Patricia Sergeson, 202–493–3166, 
Department of Transportation, Federal 
Highway Administration, Office of 
Corporate Research, Technology and 
Innovation Management, Turner- 
Fairbank Highway Research Center, 

6300 Georgetown Pike, McLean, VA 
22101. Office hours are from 8 a.m. to 
5:30 p.m., Monday through Friday, 
except Federal holidays. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Title: 
Transportation Pooled Fund Excellence 
Award. 

OMB Control Number: (if applicable). 

Summary 
Respondents: Any participant in the 

Transportation Pooled Fund (TPF) 
program can submit a nomination of a 
TPF study for the TPF Excellence 
Award, including staff from the 50 
States, the District of Columbia, and 
Puerto Rico. 

Background: FHWA is partnering 
with the American Association of State 
Highway and Transportation Officials 
(AASHTO) Research Advisory 
Committee (RAC) to further promote 
research, innovation, and excellence 
through a new TPF Program Excellence 
Award. 

For more than 45 years, the FHWA’s 
TPF Program has enabled public and 
private entities to collaboratively 
conduct cutting-edge transportation 
research. Through the TPF Program, 
participants are able to pool funds and 
expertise to develop innovative 
solutions at a lower cost while 
extending the reach and impact of their 
research. 

The TPF Excellence Award will 
recognize outstanding TPF studies that 
have made significant advancements in 
national research efforts in the areas of 
safety, economic growth, equity, and/or 
transformative climate solutions. The 
future award will highlight the 
importance of meaningful collaboration 
and partnership in transportation 
research. Administered through a 
partnership between FHWA and the 
AASHTO RAC, the biennial TPF 
Excellence Award will recognize one 
FHWA-led TPF study and one State 
department of transportation (DOT)-led 
study. Nominations would be received 
between February 1 and May 1 every 2 
yr. Nomination forms would be sent to 
FHWA Division Offices and State DOTs 
to solicit nominees. 

Award: Any participant in the TPF 
program can nominate a TPF study that 
is completed and has posted a final 
report by June 30 of the year submitted. 
The nominator is responsible for 
completing the nomination form that 
summarizes the outstanding 
accomplishments of the entry. FHWA 
will use the collected information to 
evaluate, showcase, and enhance the 
public’s knowledge of research and 
innovation conducted through these 
TPF projects. Nominations will be 
reviewed by an independent panel of 
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