
22500 Federal Register / Vol. 87, No. 73 / Friday, April 15, 2022 / Notices 

8217), to solicit applications for the 
RISE program for FY 2022. The NOSA 
afforded potential applicants an 
opportunity to electronically submit 
concept proposals for review by the 
Agency at SM.RISE-RD.RISE@usda.gov 
no later than February 18, 2022, in 
accordance with 7 CFR 4284.1115(a). 
The Agency experienced technical 
issues with its receiving method as the 
email inbox referenced above did not 
allow properly submitted proposals to 
be accepted through the intake system. 

Potential applicants that submitted 
their concept proposals by the deadline 
but did not receive communication from 
the Agency are asked to reach out to 
Rachel Reister as identified in the FOR 
FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT section of 
this Notice by no later than April 26, 
2022, so the Agency can provide 
feedback on the concept proposals. 

Karama Neal, 
Administrator, Rural Business-Cooperative 
Service. 
[FR Doc. 2022–08243 Filed 4–13–22; 4:15 pm] 

BILLING CODE 3410–XY–P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Notice of Public Meetings of the 
Mississippi Advisory Committee to the 
U.S. Commission on Civil Rights 

AGENCY: U.S. Commission on Civil 
Rights. 
ACTION: Announcement of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission) and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act that 
the Mississippi Advisory Committee 
(Committee) will hold a meeting on 
Monday, April 25, 2022 at 12:00 p.m. 
Central time. The Committee will 
continue identifying potential civil 
rights topics for their first study of the 
2021–2025 term. 
DATES: The meeting will take place on 
Monday, April 25, 2022 at 12:00 p.m. 
Central Time. 

Public Call Information: Dial: 800– 
360–9505, Confirmation Code: 2764 784 
6162. 

Web Access: https://
civilrights.webex.com/civilrights/ 
j.php?MTID=m4abff3264bd5
ff40803093e9eebb496a. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
David Barreras, DFO, at dbarreras@
usccr.gov or (312) 353–8311. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Members 
of the public may listen to this 
discussion through the above call in 
number. An open comment period will 

be provided to allow members of the 
public to make a statement as time 
allows. The conference call operator 
will ask callers to identify themselves, 
the organization they are affiliated with 
(if any), and an email address prior to 
placing callers into the conference 
room. Callers can expect to incur regular 
charges for calls they initiate over 
wireless lines, according to their 
wireless plan. The Commission will not 
refund any incurred charges. Callers 
will incur no charge for calls they 
initiate over land-line connections to 
the toll-free telephone number. 
Individual who is deaf, deafblind and 
hard of hearing may also follow the 
proceedings by first calling the Federal 
Relay Service at 1–800–877–8339 and 
providing the Service with the 
conference call number and 
confirmation code. 

Members of the public are entitled to 
submit written comments; the 
comments must be received in the 
regional office within 30 days following 
the meeting. Written comments may be 
mailed to the Regional Programs Unit, 
U.S. Commission on Civil Rights, 230 S 
Dearborn, Suite 2120, Chicago, IL 
60604. They may also be faxed to the 
Commission at (312) 353–8324, or 
emailed to Corrine Sanders at csanders@
usccr.gov. Persons who desire 
additional information may contact the 
Regional Programs Unit at (312) 353– 
8311. 

Records generated from this meeting 
may be inspected and reproduced at the 
Regional Programs Unit Office, as they 
become available, both before and after 
the meeting. Records of the meeting will 
be available via www.facadatabase.gov 
under the Commission on Civil Rights, 
Mississippi Advisory Committee link. 
Persons interested in the work of this 
Committee are directed to the 
Commission’s website, http://
www.usccr.gov, or may contact the 
Regional Programs Unit at the above 
email or street address. 

Agenda 

I. Welcome and roll call 
II. Discuss Civil Rights Topics 
III. Public comment 
IV. Next steps 
V. Adjournment 

Exceptional Circumstance: Pursuant 
to 41 CFR 102–3.150, the notice for this 
meeting is given fewer than 15 calendar 
days prior to the meeting because of the 
exceptional circumstances of pending 
expiration of Committee member 
appointment terms. 

Dated: April 12, 2022. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2022–08089 Filed 4–14–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Notice of Public Meeting of the Georgia 
Advisory Committee to the U.S. 
Commission on Civil Rights 

AGENCY: U.S. Commission on Civil 
Rights. 
ACTION: Announcement of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission) and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act that 
the Georgia Advisory Committee 
(Committee) to the U.S. Commission on 
Civil Rights will hold a business 
meeting via web conference on Tuesday, 
May 3, 2022, at 12:00 p.m. Eastern time 
for the purpose of discussing findings 
and recommendations from panels I–IV 
on Civil Asset Forfeiture and its Impact 
on Communities of Color in Georgia. 
DATES: The meeting will take place on 
Tuesday, May 3, 2022, from 12:00 p.m.– 
1:00 p.m. Eastern time. 

Online Registration (Audio/Visual): 
https://tinyurl.com/4jr7h7ed. 

Telephone (Audio Only): Dial 800– 
360–9505 USA Toll Free; Access code: 
2762 195 9568. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Melissa Wojnaroski, DFO, at 
mwojnaroski@usccr.gov or 202–618– 
4158. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Members 
of the public can listen to these 
discussions. 

Committee meetings are available to 
the public through the above call-in 
number. Any interested member of the 
public may call this number and listen 
to the meeting. An open comment 
period will be provided to allow 
members of the public to make a 
statement as time allows. Callers can 
expect to incur regular charges for calls 
they initiate over wireless lines, 
according to their wireless plan. The 
Commission will not refund any 
incurred charges. Callers will incur no 
charge for calls they initiate over land- 
line connections to the toll-free 
telephone number. Individuals who are 
deaf, deafblind and hard of hearing may 
follow the proceedings by first calling 
the Federal Relay Service at 800–877– 
8339 and providing the Service with the 
conference call number and conference 
ID number. 
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Members of the public are also 
entitled to submit written comments; 
the comments must be received in the 
regional office within 30 days following 
the meeting. Written comments may be 
emailed to Sarah Villanueva at 
svillanueva@usccr.gov. Persons who 
desire additional information may 
contact the Regional Programs Unit at 
202–618–4158. 

Records generated from this meeting 
may be inspected and reproduced at the 
Regional Programs Unit Office, as they 
become available, both before and after 
the meeting. Records of the meeting will 
be available via www.facadatabase.gov 
under the Commission on Civil Rights, 
Georgia Advisory Committee link. 
Persons interested in the work of this 
Committee are directed to the 
Commission’s website, http://
www.usccr.gov, or may contact the 
Regional Programs Unit at the above 
email or street address. 

Agenda 

I. Welcome and Roll Call 
II. Approval of Minutes: April 7, 2022 
III. Announcements and Updates 
IV. Discussion: Civil Asset Forfeiture in 

Georgia 
V. Next Steps 
VI. Public Comment 
VII. Adjournment 

Dated: April 12, 2022. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2022–08090 Filed 4–14–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Census Bureau 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; Addition of Title 13 U.S.C. 
Section 221 to the Citation of 
Mandatory Collection Authority for the 
Vehicle Inventory and Use Survey 

The Department of Commerce will 
submit the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and clearance in accordance 
with the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995. We invite the general public and 
other Federal agencies to comment on 
proposed, and continuing information 
collections, which helps us assess the 
impact of our information collection 
requirements and minimize the public’s 
reporting burden. This notice allows for 
30 days for public comments. 

Agency: U.S. Census Bureau. 

Title: Addition of Title 13 U.S.C. 
Section 221 to the Citation of Mandatory 
Collection Authority for the Vehicle 
Inventory and Use Survey (VIUS). 

OMB Control Number: 0607–XXXX. 
Form Number(s): The VIUS form 

number are TC–9501 and TC–9502. 
Type of Request: Emergency 

submission, New Information Collection 
Request. 

Number of Respondents: There are 
150,000 respondents to the VIUS. 

Average Hours per Response: The 
average response time for the VIUS is 65 
minutes. 

Burden Hours: The annual burden of 
the VIUS is 162,500 hours. This 
clearance will not impact this burden. 

Needs and Uses: The Office of 
Management and Budget approved the 
VIUS under OMB Approval number 
0607–0892 on October 12, 2021. The 
2021 VIUS collects data to measure the 
physical and operational characteristics 
of trucks from a sample of 
approximately 150,000 trucks. These 
trucks are selected from more than 190 
million private and commercial trucks 
registered with motor vehicle 
departments in the 50 states and the 
District of Columbia. The Census 
Bureau is collecting the data for the 
sampled trucks from the registered truck 
owners. 

The VIUS is the only comprehensive 
source of information on the physical 
and operational characteristics of the 
Nation’s truck population. The VIUS 
provides unique, essential information 
for government, business, and academia. 
The U.S. Department of Transportation, 
State Departments of Transportation, 
and transportation consultants 
compliment VIUS microdata as 
extremely useful and flexible to meet 
constantly changing requests that 
cannot be met with predetermined 
tabular publications. The planned 
microdata file will enable them to cross- 
tabulate data to meet their needs. 

Due to an oversight, the materials 
submitted to OMB for review in the 
original request for clearance of the 
VIUS did not include the complete legal 
authority for the mandatory collection 
of the VIUS. Currently our collection 
authority cites that Title 13, United 
States Code, Sections 131 and 182, 
authorizes the collection and Sections 
224 and 225 make the collection 
mandatory. However, Sections 224 and 
225 only apply to respondents who are 
part of a company, business, or 
organization. Section 221 also needs to 
be cited to require mandatory response 
for individual owners of personal 
vehicles who are included in the VIUS 
sample. Including the correct citation 
will allow us to make VIUS mandatory 

for individuals who own personal 
vehicles, as intended. 

Affected Public: Individuals and 
Business. 

Frequency: One time. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Mandatory. 
Legal Authority: Title 13 U.S.C., 

Sections 131 and 182 authorize the 
collection of VIUS data. Sections 221, 
224 and 225 of Title 13 U.S.C. make 
reporting mandatory for all respondents, 
including both individuals and 
businesses. 

This information collection request 
may be viewed at www.reginfo.gov. 
Follow the instructions to view the 
Department of Commerce collections 
currently under review by OMB. 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be 
submitted within 30 days of the 
publication of this notice to 
pracomments@doc.gov. 

Sheleen Dumas, 
Department PRA Clearance Officer, Office of 
the Chief Information Officer, Commerce 
Department. 
[FR Doc. 2022–08112 Filed 4–14–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–07–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Census Bureau 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; The American Community 
Survey and Puerto Rico Community 
Survey 

The Department of Commerce will 
submit the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and clearance in accordance 
with the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995, on or after the date of publication 
of this notice. We invite the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
comment on proposed, and continuing 
information collections, which helps us 
assess the impact of our information 
collection requirements and minimize 
the public’s reporting burden. Public 
comments were previously requested 
via the Federal Register on September 
14, 2021 during a 60-day comment 
period. This notice allows for an 
additional 30 days for public comments. 

Agency: U.S. Census Bureau. 
Title: The American Community 

Survey and The Puerto Rico Community 
Survey. 

OMB Control Number: 0607–0810. 
Form Number(s): ACS–1, ACS–1(SP), 

ACS–1(PR), ACS–1(PR)SP, ACS–1(GQ), 
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