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River District, Owyhee Field Office, 
Jim Schmid, Trails Specialist, 
LSRD–OFO; 

• Idaho Department of Parks and 
Recreation (IDPR)—Trail Ranger 
Partnership Program—Rick 
Collignon, Director, IDPR; 

• Idaho’s Noxious Weed Program—
Weed Awareness Campaign—Spring 
Workshops and Field trips—Brenda 
Waters, Noxious Weed Program 
Coordinator, Idaho State Department of 
Agriculture; 

• Three Field Office Managers and 
District Fire Manager provide updates 
on current issues and planned activities 
in their field office and the District; and 

• RAC review of Charter, work plan, 
priorities, and identify dates for 2004 
meetings. 

Agenda items may change due to 
changing circumstances. All meetings 
are open to the public. The public may 
present written comments to the 
Council. Each formal Council meeting 
will also have time allocated for hearing 
public comments. Depending on the 
number of persons wishing to comment 
and time available, the time for 
individual oral comments may be 
limited. Individuals who plan to attend 
and need special assistance, such as 
sign language interpretation, tour 
transportation or other reasonable 
accommodations, should contact the 
BLM as provided below. Expedited 
publication is requested to give the 
public adequate notice.

Dated: October 14, 2003. 
Howard Hedrick, 
Associate District Manager.
[FR Doc. 03–26363 Filed 10–17–03; 8:45 am] 
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AGENCY: United States International 
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ACTION: Notice.

SUMMARY: The U.S. International Trade 
Commission (the Commission) hereby 
gives notice of the court-ordered remand 
of its five-year review in Investigation 
Nos. 731–TA–391–394, 396–397, and 
399 (Review).
EFFECTIVE DATE: October 10, 2003.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Larry Reavis (Office 615–D) (205–3185) 

(lreavis@usitc.gov) or Robert Carpenter 
(Office 615–AA) (205–3160) 
(rcarpenter@usitc.gov). Hearing-
impaired individuals are advised that 
information on this matter can be 
obtained by contacting the 
Commission’s TDD terminal on 202–
205–1810. General information 
concerning the Commission may also be 
obtained by accessing its Internet server 
(http://www.usitc.gov).
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Reopening Record 

In order to assist it in making its 
determination on remand, the 
Commission is reopening the record in 
this five-year review for the limited 
purpose of gathering evidence relevant 
to the subject of the importation and 
production of commodity-grade ball 
bearings 26 mm or less in outer 
diameter, and competition between 
such bearings from either imported or 
domestic sources during the period of 
review and the likelihood of such 
importation, production, or competition 
upon revocation. Any party wishing to 
submit information on this matter must 
do so by close of business on October 
24, 2003. The Commission will provide 
interested parties with an opportunity to 
file comments on any new information 
received pertaining to that subject. 

Participation in the Proceedings 

Only those persons who were 
interested parties to the five-year review 
(i.e., persons listed on the Commission 
Secretary’s service list) may participate 
in these remand proceedings. 

Written Submissions 

Each party who is an interested party 
in this remand proceeding may submit 
one set of written comments to the 
Commission. These comments must be 
concise and must be limited specifically 
to commenting on the issue of the 
importation and domestic production of 
commodity-grade ball bearings 26 mm 
in outer diameter or less and 
competition between such bearings from 
various sources, and to any related new 
information obtained by the 
Commission during the remand 
proceedings. Any material in the 
interested parties’ comments that does 
not address these limited issues will be 
stricken from the record. No new factual 
information may be included in such 
comments. Comments shall be 
submitted in a font of no smaller than 
11-point (Times new roman) and shall 
be limited to no more than 5 double-
spaced pages (inclusive of footnotes, 
tables, graphs, exhibits, appendices, 
etc.). These comments must be filed no 

later than the close of business on 
October 31, 2003. 

All comments must conform with the 
provisions of § 201.8 of the 
Commission’s rules; any submissions 
that contain business proprietary 
information (BPI) must also conform 
with the requirements of §§ 201.6, 
207.3, and 207.7 of the Commission’s 
rules. In accordance with §§ 201.16(c) 
and 207.3 of the rules, each document 
filed by a party to the five-year review 
must be served on all other parties to 
the five-year review (as identified by 
either the public or BPI service list), and 
a certificate of service must be timely 
filed. The Secretary will not accept a 
document for filing without a certificate 
of service. 

Limited Disclosure of BPI Under an 
Administrative Protective Order (APO) 
and BPI Service List 

Information obtained during the 
remand proceedings will be released to 
parties under the APO in effect in the 
five-year review. Pursuant to § 207.7(a) 
of the Commission’s rules, the Secretary 
will make BPI gathered in the five-year 
review and in these remand proceedings 
available to additional authorized 
applicants, that are not covered under 
the original APO, provided that the 
application is made not later than seven 
(7) days after publication of this notice 
in the Federal Register. Applications 
must be filed for persons on the Judicial 
Protective Order in the related CIT case, 
but not covered under the original APO. 
A separate service list will be 
maintained by the Secretary for those 
parties authorized to receive BPI under 
the APO in these remand proceedings.

Authority: This action is taken under the 
authority of the Tariff Act of 1930, title VII.

By order of the Commission.
Issued: October 14, 2003. 

Marilyn R. Abbott, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 03–26380 Filed 10–17–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 7020–02–P

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Office of Community Oriented Policing 
Services; Agency Information 
Collection Activities: Proposed 
Collection; Comments Requested

ACTION: 60-Day notice of information 
collection under review: Community 
Policing Development Application 
Packet. 

The Department of Justice (DOJ), 
Office of Community Oriented Policing 
Services (COPS) has submitted the 
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