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at (866) 208–FERC, or on the FERC 
website (www.ferc.gov) using the 
eLibrary link. The eLibrary link also 
provides access to the texts of all formal 
documents issued by the Commission, 
such as orders, notices, and 
rulemakings. 

In addition, the Commission offers a 
free service called eSubscription which 
allows you to keep track of all formal 
issuances and submittals in specific 
dockets. This can reduce the amount of 
time you spend researching proceedings 
by automatically providing you with 
notification of these filings, document 
summaries, and direct links to the 
documents. Go to https://www.ferc.gov/ 
ferc-online/overview to register for 
eSubscription. 

Dated: December 17, 2020. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–28390 Filed 12–22–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 2883–009] 

Aquenergy Systems, LLC; Notice of 
Availability of Environmental 
Assessment 

In accordance with the National 
Environmental Policy Act of 1969 and 
the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission’s (Commission) 
regulations, 18 CFR part 380, the Office 
of Energy Projects has reviewed the 
application for a new license for the 
Fries Hydroelectric Project, located on 
the New River, in Grayson County, 
Virginia and has prepared an 
Environmental Assessment (EA) for the 
project. The project does not occupy 
federal land. 

The EA contains staff’s analysis of the 
potential environmental impacts of the 
project and concludes that licensing the 
project, with appropriate environmental 
protective measures, would not 
constitute a major federal action that 
would significantly affect the quality of 
the human environment. 

The Commission provides all 
interested persons with an opportunity 
to view and/or print the EA via the 
internet through the Commission’s 
Home Page (http://www.ferc.gov) using 
the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. Enter the docket 
number, excluding the last three digits 
in the docket number field, to access the 
document. At this time, the Commission 
has suspended access to the 
Commission’s Public Reference Room, 

due to the proclamation declaring a 
National Emergency concerning the 
Novel Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), 
issued by the President on March 13, 
2020. For assistance, contact FERC 
Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or toll- 
free at (866) 208–3676, or for TTY, (202) 
502–8659. 

You may also register online at 
https://ferconline.ferc.gov/ 
eSubscription.aspx to be notified via 
email of new filings and issuances 
related to this or other pending projects. 
For assistance, contact FERC Online 
Support. 

Any comments should be filed within 
45 days from the date of this notice. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings. Please file comments 
using the Commission’s eFiling system 
at https://ferconline.ferc.gov/ 
eFiling.aspx. Commenters can submit 
brief comments up to 6,000 characters, 
without prior registration, using the 
eComment system at https://
ferconline.ferc.gov/ 
QuickComment.aspx. You must include 
your name and contact information at 
the end of your comments. For 
assistance, please contact FERC Online 
Support. In lieu of electronic filing, you 
may submit a paper copy. Submissions 
sent via the U.S. Postal Service must be 
addressed to: Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 888 First Street NE, Room 
1A, Washington, DC 20426. 
Submissions sent via any other carrier 
must be addressed to: Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. The first 
page of any filing should include docket 
number P–2883–009. 

For further information, contact Jody 
Callihan at (202) 502–8278 or by email 
at jody.callihan@ferc.gov. 

Dated: December 17, 2020. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–28392 Filed 12–22–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings 

Take notice that the Commission has 
received the following Natural Gas 
Pipeline Rate and Refund Report filings: 

Docket Numbers: RP21–310–000. 
Applicants: NGO Transmission, Inc. 

Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: 
Negotiated Rate Filing to be effective 1/ 
1/2021. 

Filed Date: 12/16/20. 
Accession Number: 20201216–5006. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/28/20. 
Docket Numbers: RP21–311–000. 
Applicants: Northwest Pipeline LLC. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: Revise 

Customer-Specific Entitlement 
Provisions—GT&C 14.6 & 15.3 to be 
effective 1/16/2021. 

Filed Date: 12/16/20. 
Accession Number: 20201216–5069. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/28/20. 
Docket Numbers: RP21–312–000. 
Applicants: Sea Robin Pipeline 

Company, LLC. 
Description: Compliance filing 

Annual Flowthrough Crediting 
Mechanism Filing on 12/16/20 to be 
effective N/A. 

Filed Date: 12/16/20. 
Accession Number: 20201216–5070. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/28/20. 
Docket Numbers: RP21–313–000. 
Applicants: Iroquois Gas 

Transmission System, L.P. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: 121620 

Negotiated Rates—Freepoint 
Commodities LLC R–7250–30 to be 
effective 1/1/2021. 

Filed Date: 12/16/20. 
Accession Number: 20201216–5096. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/28/20. 
Docket Numbers: RP21–314–000. 
Applicants: Iroquois Gas 

Transmission System, L.P. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: 121620 

Negotiated Rates—Freepoint 
Commodities LLC R–7250–31 to be 
effective 1/1/2021. 

Filed Date: 12/16/20. 
Accession Number: 20201216–5097. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/28/20. 
Docket Numbers: RP21–315–000. 
Applicants: Guardian Pipeline, L.L.C. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: Update 

Non-Conform Agmt RW0068-Wisconsin 
Elec Power Co to be effective 1/16/2021. 

Filed Date: 12/16/20. 
Accession Number: 20201216–5147. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/28/20. 
Docket Numbers: RP21–316–000. 
Applicants: Guardian Pipeline, L.L.C. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: Update 

Part 6.0 Reserving for Future Use to be 
effective 1/16/2021. 

Filed Date: 12/16/20. 
Accession Number: 20201216–5151. 
Comments Due: 5 p.m. ET 12/28/20. 
The filings are accessible in the 

Commission’s eLibrary system (https://
elibrary.ferc.gov/idmws/search/ 
fercgensearch.asp) by querying the 
docket number. 

Any person desiring to intervene or 
protest in any of the above proceedings 
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