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Any person desiring to intervene or 
protest in any of the above proceedings 
must file in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s 
Regulations (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 
Protests may be considered, but 
intervention is necessary to become a 
party to the proceeding. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at:http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

Dated: November 18, 2022. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–25718 Filed 11–23–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER23–452–000] 

EEC Skyhawk Lessee LLC; 
Supplemental Notice That Initial 
Market-Based Rate Filing Includes 
Request for Blanket Section 204 
Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced proceeding of EEC 
Skyhawk Lessee LLC’s application for 
market-based rate authority, with an 
accompanying rate tariff, noting that 
such application includes a request for 
blanket authorization, under 18 CFR 
part 34, of future issuances of securities 
and assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is December 8, 
2022. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 

service, persons with internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
may mail similar pleadings to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. Hand delivered submissions in 
docketed proceedings should be 
delivered to Health and Human 
Services, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
www.ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Dated: November 18, 2022. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–25713 Filed 11–23–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPPT–2022–0132; FRL–9411–10– 
OCSPP] 

Certain New Chemicals; Receipt and 
Status Information for October 2022 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: EPA is required under the 
Toxic Substances Control Act (TSCA), 
as amended by the Frank R. Lautenberg 
Chemical Safety for the 21st Century 
Act, to make information publicly 
available and to publish information in 
the Federal Register pertaining to 
submissions under TSCA section 5, 
including notice of receipt of a 

Premanufacture notice (PMN), 
Significant New Use Notice (SNUN) or 
Microbial Commercial Activity Notice 
(MCAN), including an amended notice 
or test information; an exemption 
application (Biotech exemption); an 
application for a test marketing 
exemption (TME), both pending and/or 
concluded; a notice of commencement 
(NOC) of manufacture (including 
import) for new chemical substances; 
and a periodic status report on new 
chemical substances that are currently 
under EPA review or have recently 
concluded review. This document 
covers the period from 10/1/2022 to 10/ 
31/2022. 
DATES: Comments identified by the 
specific case number provided in this 
document must be received on or before 
December 27, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPP–2022–0132, 
through the Federal eRulemaking Portal 
at https://www.regulations.gov. Follow 
the online instructions for submitting 
comments. Do not submit electronically 
any information you consider to be 
Confidential Business Information (CBI) 
or other information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Additional 
instructions on commenting and visiting 
the docket, along with more information 
about dockets generally, is available at 
https://www.epa.gov/dockets. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 

For technical information contact: Jim 
Rahai, Project Management and 
Operations Division (MC 7407M), Office 
of Pollution Prevention and Toxics, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave. NW, Washington, DC 
20460–0001; telephone number: (202) 
564–8593; email address: rahai.jim@
epa.gov. 

For general information contact: The 
TSCA-Hotline, ABVI-Goodwill, 422 
South Clinton Ave., Rochester, NY 
14620; telephone number: (202) 554– 
1404; email address: TSCA-Hotline@
epa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Executive Summary 

A. What action is the Agency taking? 

This document provides the receipt 
and status reports for the period from 
10/01/2022 to 10/31/2022. The Agency 
is providing notice of receipt of PMNs, 
SNUNs, and MCANs (including 
amended notices and test information); 
an exemption application under 40 CFR 
part 725 (Biotech exemption); TMEs, 
both pending and/or concluded; NOCs 
to manufacture a new chemical 
substance; and a periodic status report 
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