
10497 Federal Register / Vol. 90, No. 35 / Monday, February 24, 2025 / Notices 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[FR ID 277199] 

Radio Broadcasting Services; AM or 
FM Proposals To Change the 
Community of License 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 

ACTION: Notice. 

DATES: The agency must receive 
comments on or before April 25, 2025. 

ADDRESSES: Federal Communications 
Commission, 45 L Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20554. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Rolanda F. Smith, 202–418–2054, 
Rolanda-Faye.Smith@fcc.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The Media 
Bureau shall provide notice in the 
Federal Register that an application to 
modify an AM or FM station’s 
community of license has been filed. 
See 71 FR 76208, 76211 (published 
December 20, 2006). The following 
applicants filed AM or FM proposals to 
change the community of license: 
CHRISTOPHER W JOHNSON, WAPC, 
FAC. ID NO. 66212, FROM: OPP, AL, 
TO: CLANTON, AL, FILE NO. 
0000257876; PUNJABI AMERICAN 
MEDIA, LLC, KSPA, FAC ID NO. 13899, 
FROM: ONTARIO, CA, TO: COLTON, 
CA, FILE NO. 0000266268; AMERICAN 
EDUCATION FOUNDATION, INC., 
WOAM, FAC. ID NO. 33878, FROM: 
PEORIA, IL, TO: TREMONT, IL, FILE 
NO. 0000222555; CARLOS LOPEZ, 
KQSA, FAC. ID NO. 198796, FROM: 
BATESVILLE, TX, TO: PEARSALL, TX, 
FILE NO. 0000258313; AND EDUARDO 
GALLEGOS, KRIX, FAC. ID NO. 198768, 
FROM: PORT ISABEL, TX, TO: LOS 
FRESNOS, TX, FILE NO. 0000222738. 

The full text of these applications is 
available electronically via Licensing 
and Management System (LMS), https:// 
apps2int.fcc.gov/dataentry/public/tv/ 
publicAppSearch.html. 

Federal Communications Commission. 

Nazifa Sawez, 
Assistant Chief, Audio Division, Media 
Bureau. 
[FR Doc. 2025–02963 Filed 2–21–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0292; FR ID 276336] 

Information Collection Being 
Submitted for Review and Approval to 
Office of Management and Budget 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995, the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
public and other Federal Agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 
Pursuant to the Small Business 
Paperwork Relief Act of 2002, the FCC 
seeks specific comment on how it might 
‘‘further reduce the information 
collection burden for small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 
employees.’’ The Commission may not 
conduct or sponsor a collection of 
information unless it displays a 
currently valid Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) control number. No 
person shall be subject to any penalty 
for failing to comply with a collection 
of information subject to the PRA that 
does not display a valid OMB control 
number. 
DATES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be 
submitted on or before March 26, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: Comments should be sent to 
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain. 
Find this particular information 
collection by selecting ‘‘Currently under 
30-day Review—Open for Public 
Comments’’ or by using the search 
function. Your comment must be 
submitted into www.reginfo.gov per the 
above instructions for it to be 
considered. In addition to submitting in 
www.reginfo.gov also send a copy of 
your comment on the proposed 
information collection to Nicole Ongele, 
FCC, via email to PRA@fcc.gov and to 
Nicole.Ongele@fcc.gov. Include in the 
comments the OMB control number as 
shown in the SUPPLEMENTARY 
INFORMATION below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information or copies of the 
information collection, contact Nicole 
Ongele at (202) 418–2991. To view a 
copy of this information collection 
request (ICR) submitted to OMB: (1) go 
to the web page https://
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain, 

(2) look for the section of the web page 
called ‘‘Currently Under Review,’’ (3) 
click on the downward-pointing arrow 
in the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box below the 
‘‘Currently Under Review’’ heading, (4) 
select ‘‘Federal Communications 
Commission’’ from the list of agencies 
presented in the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box, 
(5) click the ‘‘Submit’’ button to the 
right of the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box, (6) 
when the list of FCC ICRs currently 
under review appears, look for the Title 
of this ICR and then click on the ICR 
Reference Number. A copy of the FCC 
submission to OMB will be displayed. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: As part of 
its continuing effort to reduce 
paperwork burdens, as required by the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) of 1995 
(44 U.S.C. 3501–3520), the FCC invited 
the general public and other Federal 
Agencies to take this opportunity to 
comment on the following information 
collection. Comments are requested 
concerning: (a) Whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Commission, including 
whether the information shall have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of the 
Commission’s burden estimates; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information collected; and 
(d) ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on the 
respondents, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
Pursuant to the Small Business 
Paperwork Relief Act of 2002, Public 
Law 107–198, see 44 U.S.C. 3506(c)(4), 
the FCC seeks specific comment on how 
it might ‘‘further reduce the information 
collection burden for small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 
employees.’’ 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0292. 
Title: Section 69.605, Reporting and 

Distribution of Pool Access Revenues, 
Part 69—Access Charges. 

Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit. 
Number of Respondents and 

Responses: 803 respondents; 9,625 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.75 
hours–1 hour. 

Frequency of Response: Annual and 
monthly reporting requirements and 
third party disclosure requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. Statutory 
authority for this information collection 
is contained in 47 U.S.C. 154, 201, 202, 
203, 205, 218 and 403 of the 
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Communications Act of 1934, as 
amended. 

Total Annual Burden: 7,219 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: No cost. 
Needs and Uses: Section 69.605 

requires that access revenues and cost 
data shall be reported by participants in 
association tariffs to the association for 
computation of monthly pool revenues 
distributions. The association shall 
submit a report on or before February 1 
of each calendar year describing the 
associations’ cost study review process 
for the preceding calendar year as well 
as the results of that process. For any 
revisions to the cost study results made 
or recommended by the association that 
would change the respective carrier’s 
calculated annual common line or 
traffic sensitive revenue requirement by 
ten percent or more, the report shall 
include the following information: 

(1) Name of the carrier; 
(2) A detailed description of the 

revisions; 
(3) The amount of the revisions; 
(4) The impact of the revisions on the 

carrier’s calculated common line and 
traffic sensitive revenue requirements; 
and 

(5) The carrier’s total annual common 
line and traffic sensitive revenue 
requirement. The information is used to 
compute charges in tariffs for access 
service (or origination and termination) 
and to compute revenue pool 
distributions. Neither process could be 
implemented without the information. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–02957 Filed 2–21–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0743, OMB 3060–1298; FR ID 
277468] 

Information Collections Being 
Submitted for Review and Approval to 
Office of Management and Budget 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995, the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
public and other Federal Agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 

Pursuant to the Small Business 
Paperwork Relief Act of 2002, the FCC 
seeks specific comment on how it might 
‘‘further reduce the information 
collection burden for small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 
employees.’’ The Commission may not 
conduct or sponsor a collection of 
information unless it displays a 
currently valid Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) control number. No 
person shall be subject to any penalty 
for failing to comply with a collection 
of information subject to the PRA that 
does not display a valid OMB control 
number. 
DATES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be 
submitted on or before March 26, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: Comments should be sent to 
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain. 
Find this particular information 
collection by selecting ‘‘Currently under 
30-day Review—Open for Public 
Comments’’ or by using the search 
function. Your comment must be 
submitted into www.reginfo.gov per the 
above instructions for it to be 
considered. In addition to submitting in 
www.reginfo.gov also send a copy of 
your comment on the proposed 
information collection to Nicole Ongele, 
FCC, via email to PRA@fcc.gov and to 
Nicole.Ongele@fcc.gov. Include in the 
comments the OMB control number as 
shown in the SUPPLEMENTARY 
INFORMATION below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information or copies of the 
information collection, contact Nicole 
Ongele at (202) 418–2991. To view a 
copy of this information collection 
request (ICR) submitted to OMB: (1) go 
to the web page https://
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain, 
(2) look for the section of the web page 
called ‘‘Currently Under Review,’’ (3) 
click on the downward-pointing arrow 
in the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box below the 
‘‘Currently Under Review’’ heading, (4) 
select ‘‘Federal Communications 
Commission’’ from the list of agencies 
presented in the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box, 
(5) click the ‘‘Submit’’ button to the 
right of the ‘‘Select Agency’’ box, (6) 
when the list of FCC ICRs currently 
under review appears, look for the Title 
of this ICR and then click on the ICR 
Reference Number. A copy of the FCC 
submission to OMB will be displayed. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: As part of 
its continuing effort to reduce 
paperwork burdens, as required by the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) of 1995 
(44 U.S.C. 3501–3520), the FCC invited 
the general public and other Federal 
Agencies to take this opportunity to 

comment on the following information 
collection. Comments are requested 
concerning: (a) Whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Commission, including 
whether the information shall have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of the 
Commission’s burden estimates; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information collected; and 
(d) ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on the 
respondents, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
Pursuant to the Small Business 
Paperwork Relief Act of 2002, Public 
Law 107–198, see 44 U.S.C. 3506(c)(4), 
the FCC seeks specific comment on how 
it might ‘‘further reduce the information 
collection burden for small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 
employees.’’ 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0743. 
Title: Implementation of the Pay 

Telephone Reclassification and 
Compensation Provisions of the 
Telecommunications Act of 1996, CC 
Docket No. 96–128. 

Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit. 
Number of Respondents and 

Responses: 4,471 respondents; 10,071 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.50– 
100 hours. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion, 
monthly and quarterly reporting 
requirements, recordkeeping 
requirement and third party disclosure 
requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. Statutory 
authority for this collection of 
information is contained in 47 U.S.C. 
276 of the Telecommunications Act of 
1996. 

Total Annual Burden: 118,137 hours. 
Need and Uses: This collection of 

information implements the following 
requirements under section 276 of the 
Telecommunications Act of 1996. They 
are: (a) state showing of proof of market 
failure for exception to market-rate local 
coin call requirement; (b) state review of 
adequacy of provision of public interest 
payphone; (c) payphone providers’ 
transmission of specific payphone 
coding digits; (d) LEC verification of 
disputed ANIS and maintaining and 
making available the verification data; 
(e) LEC timely notification of payphone 
disconnection; (f) LEC indication on the 
payphone’s monthly bill that the 
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