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and its impacts on the human 
environment. 

To promote informed decision- 
making, comments should be as specific 
as possible and should provide as much 
detail as necessary to meaningfully and 
fully inform DOE of why the issues 
raised are important to the agency’s 
review of the proposed action. 

The draft EIS will include as an 
appendix a summary of issues raised in 
public scoping comments that DOE 
considered in preparing the EIS and 
comments outside the scope of the 
analysis. 

Signing Authority 

This document of the Department of 
Energy was signed on December 11, 
2024, by Kelly Cummins, Acting 
Director, Office of Clean Energy 
Demonstrations, pursuant to delegated 
authority from the Secretary of Energy. 
That document with the original 
signature and date is maintained by 
DOE. For administrative purposes only, 
and in compliance with requirements of 
the Office of the Federal Register, the 
undersigned DOE Federal Register 
Liaison Officer has been authorized to 
sign and submit the document in 
electronic format for publication, as an 
official document of the Department of 
Energy. This administrative process in 
no way alters the legal effect of this 
document upon publication in the 
Federal Register. 

Signed in Washington, DC, on December 
13, 2024. 
Treena V. Garrett, 
Federal Register Liaison Officer, U.S. 
Department of Energy. 
[FR Doc. 2024–30020 Filed 12–17–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Energy Information Administration 

Agency Information Collection 
Extension 

AGENCY: U.S. Energy Information 
Administration (EIA), U.S. Department 
of Energy (DOE). 
ACTION: Notice of requests for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: DOE submitted an 
information collection request for 
extension as required by the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. The information 
collection requests a three-year 
extension, with changes, to the Form 
NWPA–830G ‘‘Appendix G—Standard 
Remittance Advice for Payment of 
Fees’’, including annex A to appendix 
G, under OMB Control Number 1901– 

0260. Form NWPA–830G is part of the 
Standard Contract for Disposal of Spent 
Nuclear Fuel and/or High-Level 
Radioactive Waste. Generators and 
owners of spent nuclear fuel and high- 
level radioactive waste of domestic 
origin paid fees into the Nuclear Waste 
Fund based on net electricity generated 
and sold as defined in the Standard 
Contract. 
DATES: Comments regarding this 
proposed information collection must 
be received on or before January 17, 
2025. If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, please 
advise the DOE Desk Officer at OMB of 
your intention to make a submission as 
soon as possible. The Desk Officer may 
be telephoned at (202) 395–4718. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you need additional information, 
contact Guang Wei, Office of Standard 
Contract Management, U.S. Department 
of Energy, telephone (240) 388–5685, or 
by email at standardcontracts@
hq.doe.gov. The forms and instructions 
are available on DOE’s website at 
https://www.energy.gov/gc/office- 
standard-contract-management and at 
EIA’s website at www.eia.gov/survey/. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
information collection request contains: 

(1) OMB No.: 1901–0260; 
(2) Information Collection Request 

Title: Form NWPA–830G, Standard 
Contract for Disposal of Spent Nuclear 
Fuel and/or High-Level Radioactive 
Waste, Appendix G; 

(3) Type of Request: Three-year 
extension with changes; 

(4) Purpose: The Form NWPA–830G 
survey included in the Standard 
Contract for Disposal of Spent Nuclear 
Fuel and/or High-Level Radioactive 
Waste, Appendix G, collects information 
on energy resource reserves, production, 
demand, technology, and related 
economic and statistical information. 

The Federal Energy Administration 
Act of 1974 (15 U.S.C. 761 et seq.) and 
the DOE Organization Act (42 U.S.C. 
7101 et seq.) require EIA to carry out a 
centralized, comprehensive, and unified 
energy information program. This 
program collects, evaluates, assembles, 
analyzes, and disseminates information 

on energy resource reserves, production, 
demand, technology, and related 
economic and statistical information. 
This information is used to assess the 
adequacy of energy resources to meet 
near and longer-term domestic 
demands. 

As part of its effort to comply with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. 3501 et seq.), EIA provides the 
general public and other federal 
agencies with opportunities to comment 
on collections of energy information 
conducted by or in conjunction with 
EIA. Also, EIA will later seek approval 
for this collection by OMB under 
Section 3507(a) of the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 

The Nuclear Waste Policy Act of 1982 
(42 U.S.C. 10101 et seq.) required that 
DOE enter into Standard Contracts with 
all generators or owners of spent nuclear 
fuel and high-level radioactive waste of 
domestic origin. Form NWPA–830G 
Appendix G—Standard Remittance 
Advice for Payment of Fees, including 
annex A to appendix G, is an Appendix 
to this Standard Contract. Appendix G 
and annex A to appendix G are 
commonly referred to as Remittance 
Advice (RA) forms. RA forms must be 
submitted quarterly by generators and 
owners of spent nuclear fuel and high- 
level radioactive waste of domestic 
origin who signed the Standard 
Contract. Appendix G is designed to 
serve as the source document for entries 
into DOE accounting records to transmit 
data to DOE concerning payment of fees 
into the Nuclear Waste Fund for spent 
nuclear fuel and high-level waste 
disposal. Annex A to appendix G is 
used to provide data on the amount of 
net electricity generated and sold, upon 
which these fees are based. 

(4a) Changes to Information 
Collection: The reduction of 20 annual 
burden hours for Form NWPA–830G 
results from the reduction of the number 
of total respondents representing 
reactors that decreased from 95 to 94. 
One reactor permanently shut down 
since the last clearance cycle and no 
longer is required to pay fees into the 
Nuclear Waste Fund nor respond to this 
survey. 

(5) Annual Estimated Number of 
Respondents: 94. 

(6) Annual Estimated Number of 
Total Responses: 376. 

(7) Annual Estimated Number of 
Burden Hours: 1,880. 

(8) Annual Estimated Reporting and 
Recordkeeping Cost Burden: $171,381 
(1,880 estimated number of burden 
hours times $91.16 per hour current 
average loaded wage rate). DOE 
estimates that respondents will have no 
additional costs associated with the 
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surveys other than the burden hours and 
the maintenance of the information 
during the normal course of business. 

Statutory Authority: 15 U.S.C. 772(b), 
42 U.S.C. 7101, and 42 U.S.C. 10101 et 
seq. 

Signed in Washington, DC, on December 
12, 2024. 
Samson A. Adeshiyan, 
Director, Office of Statistical Methods and 
Research, U.S. Energy Information 
Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2024–29986 Filed 12–17–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings 

Take notice that the Commission has 
received the following Natural Gas 
Pipeline Rate and Refund Report filings: 

Filings Instituting Proceedings 

Docket Numbers: RP25–277–000. 
Applicants: Bear Creek Storage 

Company, L.L.C. 
Description: Compliance filing: 

Annual Fuel Summary 2024 to be 
effective N/A. 

Filed Date: 12/11/24. 
Accession Number: 20241211–5053. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 12/23/24. 
Docket Numbers: RP25–278–000. 
Applicants: Columbia Gas 

Transmission, LLC. 
Description: Compliance filing: 

Penalty Revenue Crediting Report 2024 
to be effective N/A. 

Filed Date: 12/12/24. 
Accession Number: 20241212–5128. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 12/24/24. 
Docket Numbers: RP25–279–000. 
Applicants: Columbia Gulf 

Transmission, LLC. 
Description: Compliance filing: 

Penalty Revenue Crediting Report 2024 
to be effective N/A. 

Filed Date: 12/12/24. 
Accession Number: 20241212–5147. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 12/24/24. 
Any person desiring to intervene, to 

protest, or to answer a complaint in any 
of the above proceedings must file in 
accordance with Rules 211, 214, or 206 
of the Commission’s Regulations (18 
CFR 385.211, 385.214, or 385.206) on or 
before 5:00 p.m. Eastern time on the 
specified comment date. Protests may be 
considered, but intervention is 
necessary to become a party to the 
proceeding. 

Filings in Existing Proceedings 

Docket Numbers: RP24–744–000 

Applicants: Southern Natural Gas 
Company, L.L.C. 

Description: Report Filing: SNG Rate 
Case 45-Day Update Filing to correct 
filing type to be effective N/A. 

Filed Date: 12/12/24 
Accession Number: 20241212–5094 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 12/24/24 
Any person desiring to protest in any 

the above proceedings must file in 
accordance with Rule 211 of the 
Commission’s Regulations (18 CFR 
385.211) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 

The filings are accessible in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system (https://
elibrary.ferc.gov/idmws/search/ 
fercgensearch.asp) by querying the 
docket number. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: https://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, environmental justice 
communities, Tribal members and 
others, access publicly available 
information and navigate Commission 
processes. For public inquiries and 
assistance with making filings such as 
interventions, comments, or requests for 
rehearing, the public is encouraged to 
contact OPP at (202) 502–6595 or OPP@
ferc.gov. 

Dated: December 12, 2024. 
Carlos D. Clay, 
Acting Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2024–29980 Filed 12–17–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings #1 

Take notice that the Commission 
received the following exempt 
wholesale generator filings: 

Docket Numbers: EG25–60–000. 
Applicants: Redfield PV I, LLC. 
Description: Redfield PV I, LLC 

submits Notice of Self–Certification of 
Exempt Wholesale Generator Status. 

Filed Date: 12/11/24. 
Accession Number: 20241211–5231. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 1/1/25. 

Take notice that the Commission 
received the following Complaints and 
Compliance filings in EL Dockets: 

Docket Numbers: EL25–37–000. 
Applicants: Voltus, Inc. v. 

Midcontinent Independent System 
Operator, Inc. 

Description: Complaint of Voltus, Inc. 
v. Midcontinent Independent System 
Operator, Inc. 

Filed Date: 12/11/24. 
Accession Number: 20241211–5134. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 12/31/24. 
Take notice that the Commission 

received the following electric rate 
filings: 

Docket Numbers: ER10–2881–040; 
ER10–2882–040; ER10–2883–038; 
ER10–2884–038; ER17–2401–010; 
ER17–2404–010; ER16–2509–009; 
ER17–2400–010; ER17–2403–010. 

Applicants: SP Pawpaw Solar, LLC, 
SP Butler Solar, LLC, Rutherford Farm, 
LLC, SP Sandhills Solar, LLC, SP 
Decatur Parkway Solar, LLC, Georgia 
Power Company, Mississippi Power 
Company, Southern Power Company, 
Alabama Power Company. 

Description: Supplement to 06/30/ 
2023 Triennial Market Power Analysis 
for Southeast Region of Alabama Power 
Company et al. 

Filed Date: 12/11/24. 
Accession Number: 20241211–5295. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 1/1/25. 
Docket Numbers: ER24–1906–001. 
Applicants: Cheyenne Light, Fuel and 

Power Company. 
Description: Compliance filing: Order 

Nos. 2023 and 2023—A Further 
Compliance Filing to be effective 7/1/ 
2024. 

Filed Date: 12/12/24. 
Accession Number: 20241212–5184. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 1/2/25. 
Docket Numbers: ER24–2825–001. 
Applicants: Southwest Power Pool, 

Inc. 
Description: Compliance filing: 

Compliance Filing Revising SPP Tariff 
to Implement JTIQ Framework to be 
effective 11/14/2024. 

Filed Date: 12/12/24. 
Accession Number: 20241212–5040. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 1/2/25. 
Docket Numbers: ER24–2871–002. 
Applicants: Midcontinent 

Independent System Operator, Inc. 
Description: Compliance filing: 2024– 

12–12_JTIQ Compliance to be effective 
11/14/2024. 

Filed Date: 12/12/24. 
Accession Number: 20241212–5199. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 1/2/25. 
Docket Numbers: ER24–3049–001. 
Applicants: PJM Interconnection, 

L.L.C. 
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