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Technology Security Requirements, in 
all correspondence. 

Jeffrey A. Koses, 
Senior Procurement Executive, Office of 
Acquisition Policy, Office of Government- 
wide Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2024–01105 Filed 1–19–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Submission for OMB Review; Child 
Care and Development Fund Plan 
Preprint for States/Territories for FFY 
2025–2027 (ACF–118) and Extension of 
Child Care and Development Fund 
Plan Preprint for States/Territories for 
FFY 2022–2024 (OMB #0970–0114) 

AGENCY: Office of Child Care; 
Administration for Children and 
Families; Health and Human Services. 
ACTION: Request for public comments. 

SUMMARY: The Administration for 
Children and Families (ACF) is 
requesting an extension without 
changes of the form ACF–118: Child 
Care and Development Fund Plan 
Preprint for States/Territories for FFY 
2022–2024 (OMB #0970–0114, 
expiration 02/29/2024), and a separate 
three-year extension of the form ACF– 

118: Child Care and Development Fund 
Plan Preprint for States/Territories for 
FFY 2025–2027. There are changes 
requested to the form ACF–118: Child 
Care and Development Fund Plan 
Preprint for States/Territories for FFY 
2025–2027 to improve formatting, 
collect additional information about 
program implementation, and 
streamline questions. 
DATES: Comments due within 30 days of 
publication. OMB must make a decision 
about the collection of information 
between 30 and 60 days after 
publication of this document in the 
Federal Register. Therefore, a comment 
is best assured of having its full effect 
if OMB receives it within 30 days of 
publication. 

ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. You can also obtain 
copies of the proposed collection of 
information by emailing infocollection@
acf.hhs.gov. Identify all emailed 
requests by the title of the information 
collection. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Description: The Child Care and 
Development Fund (CCDF) Plan (the 

Plan) for States and Territories is 
required from each CCDF Lead agency 
in accordance with Section 658E of the 
Child Care and Development Block 
Grant Act of 1990 (CCDBG Act), as 
amended, CCDBG Act of 2014 (Pub. L. 
113–186), and 42 U.S.C. 9858. The Plan, 
submitted on the ACF–118, is required 
triennially, and remains in effect for 
three years. The Plan provides ACF and 
the public with a description of and 
assurance about the states’ and 
territories’ child care programs. These 
Plans are the applications for CCDF 
funds. 

At this time, the ACF Office of Child 
Care (OCC) is proposing an extension of 
the approval of the currently approved 
CCDF Plan Preprint for FFY 2022–2024 
to allow states and territories to 
continue to submit amendments for 
substantial program changes effective 
through September 30, 2024, as 
required. There are no changes 
proposed to the FFY 2022–2024 Plan 
Preprint. In addition, OCC is requesting 
comments on the proposed CCDF Plan 
Preprint for FFY 2025–2027. Updates 
were made to clarify questions, enhance 
the ability to align data with OCC 
monitoring data, reflect OCC priorities, 
ensure alignment with federal 
requirements, and facilitate grantee 
submission in the Child Care 
Automated Reporting System (CARS) 
data system. 

Respondents: State and Territory Lead 
Agencies. 

ANNUAL BURDEN ESTIMATES 

Instrument 
Total 

number of 
respondents 

Total 
number of 

responses per 
respondent 

Average 
burden hours 
per response 

Annual 
burden 
hours 

Child Care and Development Fund for States and Territories (ACF—118) ............. 56 0.33 150 2,800 

Estimated Total Burden Hours: 8,400; 
however, since Plans are required 
triennially, and remain in effect for 3 
years, the actual Total Annual Burden 
Hours is 2,800. 

Authority: Pub. L. 113–186 and 42 
U.S.C. 9858. 

Mary B. Jones, 
ACF/OPRE Certifying Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2024–01058 Filed 1–19–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4184–87–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Food and Drug Administration 

[Docket No. FDA–2024–N–0015] 

Notice of Approval of Product Under 
Voucher: Material Threat Medical 
Countermeasure Priority Review 
Voucher for QULIPTA 

AGENCY: Food and Drug Administration, 
HHS. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Food and Drug 
Administration (FDA) is announcing the 
approval of a product redeeming a 
material threat medical countermeasure 
(MCM) priority review voucher. The 

Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act 
(FD&C Act) authorizes FDA to award 
priority review vouchers to sponsors of 
approved material threat MCM product 
applications that meet certain criteria. 
FDA is required to publish notice of the 
issuance of material threat MCM 
priority review vouchers as well as the 
approval of products redeeming a 
voucher. FDA has determined that 
QULIPTA (atogepant) tablets, approved 
September 28, 2021, meets the 
redemption criteria. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Cathryn Lee, Center for Drug Evaluation 
and Research, Food and Drug 
Administration, 10903 New Hampshire 
Ave., Silver Spring, MD 20993–0002, 
301–796–1394, email: Cathryn.Lee@
fda.hhs.gov. 
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