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DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Forest Service 

Directive Publication Notice 

AGENCY: Forest Service, Agriculture 
(USDA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Forest Service (Forest 
Service or Agency), U.S. Department of 
Agriculture, provides direction to 
employees through issuances in its 
Directive System, comprised of the 
Forest Service Manual and Forest 
Service Handbooks. The Agency must 
provide public notice of and 
opportunity to comment on directives 
that formulate standards, criteria, or 
guidelines applicable to Forest Service 
programs. Once per quarter, the Agency 
provides advance notice of proposed 
and interim directives that will be made 
available for public comment during the 
next three months; proposed and 
interim directives that were previously 
published for public comment but not 
yet finalized and issued; and notice of 
final directives issued in the last three 
months. 
DATES: This notice identifies proposed 
and interim directives that have been 
published for public comment between 
January 1, 2025, and March 31, 2025; 
proposed and interim directives that 
were previously published for public 
comment but not yet finalized and 
issued; and final directives that have 
been issued since October 1, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Questions or comments may 
be submitted by email to the contact 
listed below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
JoLynn Anderson, (971) 313–1718 or 
jolynn.anderson@usda.gov. Individuals 
who use telecommunications devices 
for the hearing impaired may call 711 to 
reach the Telecommunications Relay 
Service, 24 hours a day, every day of the 
year, including holidays. You may 
register to receive email alerts regarding 

Forest Service directives at https://
www.fs.usda.gov/about-agency/ 
regulations-policies/national-directives. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Proposed and Interim Directives 

Consistent with 16 U.S.C. 1612(a) and 
36 CFR part 216, the Forest Service 
publishes notice of the opportunity for 
public comment on Agency Directives 
that formulate standards, criteria, and 
guidelines applicable to Forest Service 
programs. Agency procedures for 
providing public notice and opportunity 
to comment are specified in Forest 
Service Handbook (FSH) 1109.12, 
Chapter 30, Providing Public Notice and 
Opportunity to Comment on Directives. 

No Directives were published for 
comment between January 1, 2025, to 
March 31, 2025. Additionally, there are 
no proposed or final Directives 
scheduled to be published for comment 
in Fiscal Year 2025 Quarter 3. 

The following Directives have been 
published in previous quarters: 

Final Directives That Have Been Issued 
in Fiscal Year 2025 Quarter 1 

1. FSM 2040 National Forest System 
Monitoring. 

Final Directives That Have Been Issued 
in Fiscal Year 2025 Quarter 2 

1. FSH 2209.16-chapter 10 Allotment 
Management Handbook; 

2. FSM 3800 Landscape Scale 
Restoration. 

Stephen Morse, 
Program Analyst, Policy Office, National 
Forest System. 
[FR Doc. 2025–06098 Filed 4–8–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3411–15–P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Notice of Public Meeting of the 
Montana Advisory Committee to the 
U.S. Commission on Civil Rights 

AGENCY: U.S. Commission on Civil 
Rights. 
ACTION: Notice of public meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission) and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, that 
the Montana Advisory Committee 
(Committee) to the U.S. Commission on 

Civil Rights will hold a public business 
meeting via Zoom at 3 p.m. MT on 
Wednesday, May 21, 2025. 
DATES: Wednesday, May 21, 2025, from 
3 p.m.–4:30 p.m. Mountain Time. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held 
via Zoom Webinar. 

Registration Link (Audio/Visual): 
https://www.zoomgov.com/webinar/ 
register/WN_FQ254iVVQ4GZ
JrXhgeADgQ. 

Join by Phone (Audio Only): (833) 
435–1820 USA Toll-Free; Meeting ID: 
161 815 1574. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ana 
Victoria Fortes, Designated Federal 
Officer, at afortes@usccr.gov or (202) 
681–0857. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
committee meeting is available to the 
public through the registration link 
above. Any interested member of the 
public may listen to the meeting. An 
open comment period will be provided 
to allow members of the public to make 
a statement as time allows. Per the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, public 
minutes of the meeting will include a 
list of persons who are present at the 
meeting. If joining via phone, callers can 
expect to incur regular charges for calls 
they initiate over wireless lines, 
according to their wireless plan. The 
Commission will not refund any 
incurred charges. Callers will incur no 
charge for calls they initiate over land- 
line connections to the toll-free 
telephone number. Closed captioning 
will be available for individuals who are 
deaf, hard of hearing, or who have 
certain cognitive or learning 
impairments. To request additional 
accommodations, please email Liliana 
Schiller, Support Services Specialist, at 
lschiller@usccr.gov at least 10 business 
days prior to the meeting. 

Members of the public are entitled to 
submit written comments; the 
comments must be received in the 
regional office within 30 days following 
the meeting. Written comments may be 
emailed to Ana Victoria Fortes at 
afortes@usccr.gov. Persons who desire 
additional information may contact the 
Regional Programs Coordination Unit at 
(202) 681–0857. 

Records generated from this meeting 
may be inspected and reproduced at the 
Regional Programs Coordination Unit 
Office, as they become available, both 
before and after the meeting. Records of 
the meetings will be available via the 
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file sharing website, www.box.com. 
Persons interested in the work of this 
Committee are directed to the 
Commission’s website, http://
www.usccr.gov, or may contact the 
Regional Programs Coordination Unit at 
the above phone number. 

Agenda 

I. Welcome & Roll Call 
II. Administrative Announcements 
III. Concept Stage Presentation 
IV. Discuss Topics for Study 
V. Public Comment 
VI. Next Steps 
VII. Adjournment 

Dated: April 3, 2025. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2025–06032 Filed 4–8–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Notice of Public Meeting of the 
Maryland Advisory Committee to the 
U.S. Commission on Civil Rights 

AGENCY: U.S. Commission on Civil 
Rights. 
ACTION: Notice of virtual business 
meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission) and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, that 
the Maryland Advisory Committee 
(Committee) to the U.S. Commission on 
Civil Rights will a public meeting via 
Zoom. The purpose is for the committee 
to meet as a newly appointed 
committee. 

DATES: Wednesday April 30, 2025, at 1 
p.m. Eastern Time. 
ADDRESSES: 

Registration Link (Audio/Visual): 
https://tinyurl.com/mrjhth77. 

Join by Phone (Audio Only): 1–833– 
435–1820 USA Toll Free; Webinar ID: 
160 006 0777 #. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Brooke Peery, Designated Federal 
Officer, at bpeery@usccr.gov or 1–202– 
701–1376. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Committee meetings are available to the 
public through a registration link 
(above). Any interested members of the 
public may attend committee meetings. 
An open comment period will be 
provided to allow members of the 
public to make oral statements as time 
allows. Pursuant to the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act, public 
minutes of each meeting will include a 

list of persons who are present. If 
joining via phone, callers can expect to 
incur regular charges for calls they 
initiate over wireless lines, according to 
their wireless plan. The Commission 
will not refund any incurred charges. 
Callers will incur no charge for calls 
they initiate over land-line connections 
to the toll-free telephone number. 
Closed captioning is available by 
selecting ‘‘CC’’ in the meeting platform. 
To request additional accommodations, 
please email ebohor@usccr.gov at least 
10 business days prior to the meeting. 

Members of the public are entitled to 
submit written comments; the 
comments must be received in the 
regional office within 30 days following 
the scheduled meeting. Written 
comments may be emailed to Evelyn 
Bohor at ebohor@usccr.gov. Persons 
who desire additional information may 
contact the Regional Programs 
Coordination Unit at 1–202–656–8937. 

Records generated from this meeting 
may be inspected and reproduced at the 
Regional Programs Coordination Unit 
Office, as they become available, both 
before and after the meeting. Records of 
the meetings will be available via the 
file sharing website, https://tinyurl.com/ 
mnshz8n9. Persons interested in the 
work of this Committee are directed to 
the Commission’s website, https://
www.usccr.gov, or may contact the 
Regional Programs Coordination Unit at 
ebohor@usccr.gov. 

Agenda 

I. Welcome & Roll Call 
II. Chair’s Comments 
III. Introductions 
IV. Committee Discussion 
V. Next Steps 
VI. Public Comment 
VII. Other Business 
VIII. Adjourn 

Dated: April 3, 2025. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2025–06042 Filed 4–8–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[B–21–2025] 

Foreign-Trade Zone (FTZ) 50, 
Notification of Proposed Production 
Activity; Logitech; (Audio, Visual, and 
Gaming Equipment); Ontario, 
California 

On behalf of Logitech, Arvato USA 
LLC submitted a notification of 
proposed production activity to the FTZ 

Board (the Board) for its facility in 
Ontario, California within FTZ 50, Site 
59. The notification conforming to the 
requirements of the Board’s regulations 
(15 CFR 400.22) was received on April 
1, 2025. 

Pursuant to 15 CFR 400.14(b), FTZ 
production activity would be limited to 
the specific foreign-status material(s)/ 
component(s) and specific finished 
product(s) described in the submitted 
notification (summarized below) and 
subsequently authorized by the Board. 
The benefits that may stem from 
conducting production activity under 
FTZ procedures are explained in the 
background section of the Board’s 
website—accessible via www.trade.gov/ 
ftz. 

The proposed finished products 
include peripherals (audio, computer, 
sim racing), content creation equipment, 
and video conference devices (duty 
rates are duty-free). 

The proposed foreign-status 
materials/components include: 
microphones (streaming; video 
conference); speakers (Bluetooth with 
single driver; Bluetooth with multiple 
drivers; personal computer; personal 
computer with single driver); headsets 
(wired; wireless); virtual reality pens; 
remotes (gaming; presentation); 
conferencing displays; desktop 
streaming LED lights; sim racing 
components (wheels; pedals); flight 
simulators; adaptive gaming controllers; 
webcams; conference webcams; video 
conferencing components (systems; 
cameras; table mounts; wall brackets; 
scheduler touch screen devices); USB 
receivers; pads (wireless charging; 
mouse); keyboards (wired; wireless); 
mouses (wired; wireless); palm rests 
(duty rate ranges from duty-free to 
2.0%). The request indicates that certain 
materials/components are subject to 
duties under section 1702(a)(1)(B) of the 
International Emergency Economic 
Powers Act (section 1702), and section 
301 of the Trade Act of 1974 (section 
301), depending on the country of 
origin. The applicable section 1702 and 
section 301 decisions require subject 
merchandise to be admitted to FTZs in 
privileged foreign status (19 CFR 
146.41). 

Public comment is invited from 
interested parties. Submissions shall be 
addressed to the Board’s Executive 
Secretary and sent to: ftz@trade.gov. The 
closing period for their receipt is May 
19, 2025. 

A copy of the notification will be 
available for public inspection in the 
‘‘Online FTZ Information System’’ 
section of the Board’s website. 

For further information, contact 
Juanita Chen at juanita.chen@trade.gov. 
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