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where the use of such information by 
the DOJ is deemed by FERC to be 
relevant and necessary to the advice or 
proceeding, and such proceeding names 
as a party in interest: (a) FERC; (b) any 
employee of FERC in his or her official 
capacity; (c) any employee of FERC in 
his or her individual capacity where 
DOJ has agreed to represent the 
employee; or (d) the United States, 
where FERC determines that litigation is 
likely to affect FERC or any of its 
components. 

8. To non-Federal Personnel, such as 
contractors, agents, or other authorized 
individuals performing work on a 
contract, service, cooperative agreement, 
job, or other activity on behalf of FERC 
or Federal Government and who have a 
need to access the information in the 
performance of their duties or activities. 

9. To the National Archives and 
Records Administration in records 
management inspections and its role as 
Archivist. 

10. To the Merit Systems Protection 
Board or the Board’s Office of the 
Special Counsel, when relevant 
information is requested in connection 
with appeals, special studies of the civil 
service and other merit systems, review 
of Office of Personnel Management 
(OPM) rules and regulations, and 
investigations of alleged or possible 
prohibited personnel practices. 

11. To appropriate Federal, State, or 
local agency responsible for 
investigating, prosecuting, enforcing, or 
implementing a statute, rule, regulation, 
or order, if the information may be 
relevant to a potential violation of civil 
or criminal law, rule, regulation, order. 

12. To appropriate agencies, entities, 
and person(s) that are a party to a 
dispute, when FERC determines that 
information from this system of records 
is reasonably necessary for the recipient 
to assist with the resolution of the 
dispute; the name, address, telephone 
number, email address, and affiliation; 
of the agency, entity, and/or person(s) 
seeking and/or participating in dispute 
resolution services, where appropriate. 

13. To Office of Personnel 
Management (OPM) and Government 
Accountability Office (GAO) during the 
course of on-site inspections or human 
resources audits. 

POLICIES AND PRACTICES FOR STORAGE OF 
RECORDS: 

Records are maintained in paper or 
electronic format. Electronic records are 
stored on a Shared Drive. Access to 
electronic records is controlled by the 
organization’s Single Sign-On and 
Multi-Factor Authentication solution. 
Paper records are maintained in 
lockable file cabinets in a lockable 

room. Data center buildings are guarded 
and monitored by security personnel, 
cameras, ID checks, and other physical 
security measures. Physical access to 
the server rooms is limited to authorized 
personnel only. Access to electronic and 
paper records is restricted to those 
employees whose official duties require 
access. 

POLICIES AND PRACTICES FOR RETRIEVAL OF 
RECORDS: 

Records may be retrieved by 
employee’s name or employee ID 
number. 

POLICIES AND PRACTICES FOR RETENTION AND 
DISPOSAL OF RECORDS: 

Records are retained and disposed of 
in accordance with the schedule 
approved under the National Archives 
and Records Administration’s General 
Records’ Schedule 2.3: Employee 
Relations Records—as follows: 

• Item 010: Disposition Authority: 
DAA–GRS2022–0001–0001. Temporary. 
Destroy when 3 years old, but longer 
retention is authorized if required for 
business use. 

• Item 020: Disposition Authority: 
DAA–GRS2022–0001–0002. Temporary. 
Destroy 3 years after employee 
separation from the agency or all 
appeals are concluded, whichever is 
later, but longer retention is authorized 
if required for business use. 

ADMINISTRATIVE, TECHNICAL, AND PHYSICAL 
SAFEGUARDS: 

See Policies and Practices for Storage 
of Records. 

RECORD ACCESS PROCEDURES: 
Individuals requesting access to the 

contents of records must submit a 
request through the Freedom of 
Information Act (FOIA) office. The 
FOIA website is located at: https://
www.ferc.gov/foia. Requests may be 
submitted through the following portal: 
https://www.ferc.gov/enforcement-legal/ 
foia/electronic-foia-privacy-act-request- 
form. Written requests for access to 
records should be directed to: Director, 
Office of External Affair, Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First Street 
NE, Washington, DC 20426. 

CONTESTING RECORD PROCEDURES: 

See Records Access Procedures. 

NOTIFICATION PROCEDURES: 

Generalized notice is provided by the 
publication of this notice. For specific 
notice, see Records Access Procedure, 
above. 

EXEMPTIONS PROMULGATED FOR THE SYSTEM: 

This system of records is exempted 
from certain provisions of the Privacy 

Act under Exemption 2 of the Freedom 
of Information Act which exempts from 
mandatory disclosure records that are 
‘‘related solely to the internal personnel 
rules and practices of an agency. The 
exemptions claimed for this system are 
pursuant to 5 U.S.C. 552a(k)(2). 

HISTORY: 
65 FR 21748 (April 24, 2000); 86 FR 

64923 (November 19, 2021). 
Dated: November 14, 2024. 

Carlos D. Clay, 
Acting Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2024–27163 Filed 11–20–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. AC25–19–000] 

MarkWest New Mexico, L.L.C.; Notice 
of Filing 

Take notice that on November 5, 
2024, MarkWest New Mexico, L.L.C., 
submitted a request for a two-year 
waiver of the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission’s (Commission) 
requirement to provide its certified 
public accountant (CPA) certification 
statement for the 2024 and 2025 FERC 
Form No. 2 on the basis of the calendar 
year ending December 31. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. Anyone filing a motion 
to intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. On 
or before the comment date, it is not 
necessary to serve motions to intervene 
or protests on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (https://
www.ferc.gov). From the Commission’s 
Home Page on the internet, this 
information is available on eLibrary. 
The full text of this document is 
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1 18 CFR 157.9. 

available on eLibrary in PDF and 
Microsoft Word format for viewing, 
printing, and/or downloading. To access 
this document in eLibrary, type the 
docket number excluding the last three 
digits of this document in the docket 
number field. 

User assistance is available for 
eLibrary and the Commission’s website 
during normal business hours from 
FERC Online Support at 202–502–6652 
(toll free at 1–866–208–3676) or email at 
ferconlinesupport@ferc.gov, or the 
Public Reference Room at (202) 502– 
8371, TTY (202) 502–8659. Email the 
Public Reference Room at 
public.referenceroom@ferc.gov. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings of comments, protests 
and interventions in lieu of paper using 
the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at https://
www.ferc.gov. Persons unable to file 
electronically may mail similar 
pleadings to the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First Street 
NE, Washington, DC 20426. Hand 
delivered submissions in docketed 
proceedings should be delivered to 
Health and Human Services, 12225 
Wilkins Avenue, Rockville, Maryland 
20852. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, environmental justice 
communities, Tribal members and 
others, access publicly available 
information and navigate Commission 
processes. For public inquiries and 
assistance with making filings such as 
interventions, comments, or requests for 
rehearing, the public is encouraged to 
contact OPP at (202) 502–6595 or OPP@
ferc.gov. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on December 16, 2024. 

Dated: November 14, 2024. 
Carlos D. Clay, 
Acting Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2024–27139 Filed 11–20–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP25–12–000] 

Rover Pipeline LLC; Notice of 
Application and Establishing 
Intervention Deadline 

Take notice that on October 31, 2024, 
Rover Pipeline LLC (Rover), 1300 Main 
Street, Houston, Texas 77002, filed an 

application under section 7c, of the 
Natural Gas Act (NGA), and Part 157 
and 284 of the Commission’s regulations 
requesting authorization for its Rover– 
Bulger CS and Harmon Creek MS 
Expansion Project (Project). The Project 
consists of constructing certain facilities 
necessary to expand the existing 
Harmon Creek Receipt Meter Station 
and Bulger Compressor Station located 
at Rover’s existing Bulger Compressor 
Station in Washington County, 
Pennsylvania. The Project will provide 
Rover’s customers with an expanded 
source of supply and is designed to 
receive up to an additional 400,000 Dth/ 
d. Rover estimates the total cost of the 
Project to be $21,995,477, all as more 
fully set forth in the application which 
is on file with the Commission and open 
for public inspection. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (https://
www.ferc.gov). From the Commission’s 
Home Page on the internet, this 
information is available on eLibrary. 
The full text of this document is 
available on eLibrary in PDF and 
Microsoft Word format for viewing, 
printing, and/or downloading. To access 
this document in eLibrary, type the 
docket number excluding the last three 
digits of this document in the docket 
number field. 

User assistance is available for 
eLibrary and the Commission’s website 
during normal business hours from 
FERC Online Support at (202) 502–6652 
(toll free at 1–866–208–3676) or email at 
ferconlinesupport@ferc.gov, or the 
Public Reference Room at (202) 502– 
8371, TTY (202) 502–8659. Email the 
Public Reference Room at 
public.referenceroom@ferc.gov. 

Any questions regarding the proposed 
project should be directed to Blair 
Lichtenwalter, Senior Director, 
Regulatory Affairs, 1300 Main Street, 
Houston, Texas 77002, by phone at 
(713) 989–2605, or by email at 
Blair.Lichtenwalter@energytransfer.com. 

Pursuant to section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure,1 within 90 days of this 
Notice the Commission staff will either: 
complete its environmental review and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding; or 
issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 

milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or environmental assessment (EA) for 
this proposal. The filing of an EA in the 
Commission’s public record for this 
proceeding or the issuance of a Notice 
of Schedule for Environmental Review 
will serve to notify Federal and State 
agencies of the timing for the 
completion of all necessary reviews, and 
the subsequent need to complete all 
Federal authorizations within 90 days of 
the date of issuance of the Commission 
staff’s FEIS or EA. 

Water Quality Certification 
Rover stated that a water quality 

certificate under section 401 of the 
Clean Water Act is required for the 
project from the Pennsylvania 
Department of Environmental 
Protection. When available, Rover 
should submit to the Commission a 
copy of the request for certification for 
the Commission authorization, 
including the date the request was 
submitted to the certifying agency, and 
either (1) a copy of the certifying 
agency’s decision or (2) evidence of 
waiver of water quality certification. 

Public Participation 
There are three ways to become 

involved in the Commission’s review of 
this project: you can file comments on 
the project, you can protest the filing, 
and you can file a motion to intervene 
in the proceeding. There is no fee or 
cost for filing comments or intervening. 
The deadline for filing a motion to 
intervene is 5:00 p.m. Eastern Time on 
December 5, 2024. How to file protests, 
motions to intervene, and comments is 
explained below. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, environmental justice 
communities, Tribal members and 
others, access publicly available 
information and navigate Commission 
processes. For public inquiries and 
assistance with making filings such as 
interventions, comments, or requests for 
rehearing, the public is encouraged to 
contact OPP at (202) 502–6595 or OPP@
ferc.gov. 

Comments 
Any person wishing to comment on 

the project may do so. Comments may 
include statements of support or 
objections, to the project as a whole or 
specific aspects of the project. The more 
specific your comments, the more useful 
they will be. 
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