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PERSON TO CONTACT FOR INFORMATION: 
Judith Ingram, Press Officer. Telephone: 
(202) 694–1220. 

Shawn Woodhead Werth, 
Secretary and Clerk of the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2016–02593 Filed 2–5–16; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 6715–01–P 

FEDERAL MARITIME COMMISSION 

[Docket No. 16–02] 

D.F. Young, Inc. v. NYK Line (North 
America) Inc.; Notice of Filing of 
Complaint and Assignment 

Notice is given that a complaint has 
been filed with the Federal Maritime 
Commission (Commission) by D.F. 
Young, Inc., hereinafter ‘‘Complainant,’’ 
against NYK Line (North America) Inc., 
hereinafter ‘‘Respondent.’’ Complainant 
states that it is an ocean transportation 
intermediary licensed by the 
Commission and a Pennsylvania 
corporation. Complainant alleges that 
Respondent is a New York corporation 
and a common carrier of goods by water. 

Complainant alleges that Respondent 
has violated the Shipping Act, 46 U.S.C. 
41102, and the Commission’s 
regulations at 46 CFR 515.42 ‘‘by 
refusing to compensate Complainant for 
the freight forwarding services 
performed on Ford [Motor Company] 
shipments placed on vessels owned/and 
or operated by Respondent and/or its 
agents or affiliates, for which 
Respondent received freight charges, 
according to the terms of the 
Respondent’s applicable tariffs . . . .’’ 

Complainant seeks an award of 
reparations in the amount of 
$252,776.89, plus interest and attorneys 
fees, ‘‘a payment of additional amounts, 
not exceeding twice the amount of any 
award for injuries’’ if violation of 46 
U.S.C. 41103(3) be shown, and ‘‘other 
such relief or award as the FMC shall 
determine.’’ 

The full text of the complaint can be 
found in the Commission’s Electronic 
Reading Room at www.fmc.gov/16–02. 

This proceeding has been assigned to 
the Office of Administrative Law Judges. 
The initial decision of the presiding 
officer in this proceeding shall be issued 
by February 3, 2017, and the final 
decision of the Commission shall be 
issued by August 17, 2017. 

Karen V. Gregory, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2016–02453 Filed 2–8–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6731–AA–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

GENERAL SERVICES 
ADMINISTRATION 

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND 
SPACE ADMINISTRATION 

[OMB Control No. 9000–0145; Docket 2016– 
0053; Sequence 7] 

Information Collection; Use of Data 
Universal Numbering System (DUNS) 
as Primary Contractor Identification 

AGENCY: Department of Defense (DOD), 
General Services Administration (GSA), 
and National Aeronautics and Space 
Administration (NASA). 
ACTION: Notice of request for public 
comments regarding an extension to an 
existing OMB clearance. 

SUMMARY: Under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act Regulatory 
Secretariat Division will be submitting 
to the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) a request to review and approve 
an extension of a previously approved 
information collection requirement 
concerning use of the Data Universal 
Numbering System (DUNS) as primary 
contractor identification. The DUNS 
number is the nine-digit identification 
number assigned by Dun and Bradstreet 
Information Services to an 
establishment. 

DATES: Submit comments on or before 
April 11, 2016. 
ADDRESSES: Submit comments 
identified by Information Collection 
9000–0145, Use of Data Universal 
Numbering System (DUNS) as Primary 
Contractor Identification, by any of the 
following methods: 

• Regulations.gov: http://
www.regulations.gov. Submit comments 
via the Federal eRulemaking portal by 
searching the OMB control number. 
Select the link ‘‘Submit a Comment’’ 
that corresponds with ‘‘Information 
Collection 9000–0145, Use of Data 
Universal Numbering System (DUNS) as 
Primary Contractor Identification’’. 
Follow the instructions provided at the 
‘‘Submit a Comment’’ screen. Please 
include your name, company name (if 
any), and ‘‘Information Collection 9000– 
0145, Use of Data Universal Numbering 
System (DUNS) as Primary Contractor 
Identification’’ on your attached 
document. 

• Mail: General Services 
Administration, Regulatory Secretariat 
Division (MVCB), 1800 F Street NW., 
Washington, DC 20405. ATTN: Ms. 
Flowers/IC 9000–0145, Use of Data 
Universal Numbering System (DUNS) as 
Primary Contractor Identification. 

Instructions: Please submit comments 
only and cite Information Collection 
9000–0145, Use of Data Universal 
Numbering System (DUNS) as Primary 
Contractor Identification, in all 
correspondence related to this 
collection. Comments received generally 
will be posted without change to 
http://www.regulations.gov, including 
any personal and/or business 
confidential information provided. To 
confirm receipt of your comment(s), 
please check www.regulations.gov, 
approximately two to three days after 
submission to verify posting (except 
allow 30 days for posting of comments 
submitted by mail). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Mr. 
Curtis E. Glover, Sr., Procurement 
Analyst, Office of Governmentwide 
Acquisition Policy, GSA 202–501–1448 
or via email at curtis.glover@gsa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

A. Purpose 
The Data Universal Numbering 

System (DUNS) number is the nine-digit 
identification number assigned by Dun 
and Bradstreet Information Services to 
an establishment. The Government uses 
the DUNS number to identify 
contractors in reporting to the Federal 
Procurement Data System (FPDS). The 
FPDS provides a comprehensive 
mechanism for assembling, organizing, 
and presenting contract placement data 
for the Federal Government. Federal 
agencies report data on all contracts in 
excess of the micro-purchase threshold 
to the Federal Procurement Data Center 
which collects, processes, and 
disseminates official statistical data on 
Federal contracting. Contracting officers 
insert the Federal Acquisition 
Regulation (FAR) provision at 52.204–6, 
Data Universal Numbering System 
(DUNS) Number, in solicitations they 
expect will result in contracts in excess 
of the micro-purchase threshold and do 
not contain FAR 52.204–7, Central 
Contractor Registration. The majority of 
offerors submit their DUNS through 
CCR as required by FAR 52.204–7, and 
not under the FAR provision at 52.204– 
6. 

B. Annual Reporting Burden 
Respondents: 22,070. 
Responses per Respondent: 3. 
Annual Responses: 66,210. 
Hours per Response: .1666. 
Total Burden Hours: 11,031. 

C. Public Comments 
Public comments are particularly 

invited on: Whether this collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of functions of the FAR, 
and whether it will have practical 
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