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packaging, labeling, or compounding 
necessary to prepare the substance for 
that delivery.’’ Id. section 24:21–2. 

Here, the undisputed evidence in the 
record is that Registrant currently lacks 
authority to dispense controlled 
substances in New Jersey because 
Registrant’s New Jersey controlled 
dangerous substance license is inactive. 
As discussed above, an individual must 
hold a New Jersey controlled dangerous 
substance license to dispense a 
controlled substance in New Jersey. 
Thus, because Registrant lacks authority 
to handle controlled substances in New 
Jersey, Registrant is not eligible to 
maintain a DEA registration. 
Accordingly, the Agency will order that 
Registrant’s DEA registration be 
revoked. 

Order 

Pursuant to 28 CFR 0.100(b) and the 
authority vested in me by 21 U.S.C. 
824(a), I hereby revoke DEA Certificate 
of Registration No. BM8723795 issued 
to Serge Menkin, M.D. Further, pursuant 
to 28 CFR 0.100(b) and the authority 
vested in me by 21 U.S.C. 823(g)(1), I 
hereby deny any pending applications 
of Serge Menkin, M.D., to renew or 
modify this registration, as well as any 
other pending application of Serge 
Menkin, M.D., for additional registration 
in New Jersey. This Order is effective 
July 10, 2025. 

Signing Authority 

This document of the Drug 
Enforcement Administration was signed 
on June 3, 2025, by Acting 
Administrator Robert J. Murphy. That 
document with the original signature 
and date is maintained by DEA. For 
administrative purposes only, and in 
compliance with requirements of the 
Office of the Federal Register, the 
undersigned DEA Federal Register 
Liaison Officer has been authorized to 
sign and submit the document in 
electronic format for publication, as an 
official document of DEA. This 
administrative process in no way alters 
the legal effect of this document upon 
publication in the Federal Register. 

Heather Achbach, 
Federal Register Liaison Officer, Drug 
Enforcement Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2025–10502 Filed 6–9–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–09–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Proposed 
Consent Decree Under the 
Comprehensive Environmental 
Response, Compensation, and Liability 
Act 

On June 3, 2025, the Department of 
Justice lodged a proposed Consent 
Decree with the United States District 
Court for the District of Idaho in the 
lawsuit entitled United States, et al. v. 
Nu-West Mining Inc. and Nu-West 
Industries, Inc., Civil Action No. 4:25– 
cv–00287–AKB. 

The proposed Consent Decree would 
resolve claims the United States has 
brought against defendants pursuant to 
Sections 106 and 113(g) of the 
Comprehensive Environmental 
Response, Compensation, and Liability 
Act, 42 U.S.C. 9606, and 9613(g), as 
amended by the Superfund 
Amendments and Reauthorization Act 
of 1986 (‘‘CERCLA’’) regarding the East 
Mill Dump Sub-Operable Unit 
(‘‘EMDSOU’’) at the North Maybe Mine 
Site in Idaho. The Decree would also 
resolve claims by the State of Idaho 
(‘‘State’’) and Shoshone-Bannock Tribes 
(‘‘Tribes’’), pursuant to CERCLA Section 
107 and 113(g)(2), seeking recovery of 
response costs incurred in response to 
releases of hazardous substances at the 
Site and a judgment on liability for 
response costs that will be binding on 
any subsequent action or actions to 
recover further response costs pursuant 
to Sections 107 and 113(g)(2) of 
CERCLA, 42 U.S.C. 9607, 9613(g)(2). 

Under the Consent Decree, 
Defendants will perform response 
actions at the EMDSOU pursuant to the 
September 1, 2022, Interim Record of 
Decision. Defendants will also pay 
funds for oversight costs to the State, 
Tribes and the United States Fish and 
Wildlife Service. In exchange, the 
United States will provide covenants 
not to sue or to take administrative 
action against defendants pursuant to 
Sections 106 and 107(a) of CERCLA, 42 
U.S.C. 9606 and 9607(a) for the Work. 
The State and the Tribes also provide 
covenants not to sue or take 
administrative action against defendants 
regarding the Work, State Response 
Costs, and Tribal Response Costs under 
any of Sections 106 and 107(a) of 
CERCLA, the Idaho Environmental 
Protection & Health Act, Idaho Code 
secs. 39–101 to 39–130, the Hazardous 
Waste Management Act of 1983, Idaho 
Code secs. 39–4401 to 39–4432, and the 
Idaho Water Quality Act, Idaho Code 
secs. 39–3601, et seq. Defendants 
provide corresponding covenants to the 
United States. 

The publication of this notice opens 
a period for public comment on the 
Consent Decree. Comments should be 
addressed to the Assistant Attorney 
General, Environment and Natural 
Resources Division, and should refer to 
United States, et al. v. Nu-West Mining 
Inc., et al., 4:25–cv–00287–AKB, D.J. 
Ref. No. #90–11–3–1776/10. All 
comments must be submitted no later 
than thirty (30) days after the 
publication date of this notice. 
Comments may be submitted either by 
email or by mail: 

To submit 
comments: Send them to: 

By email ....... pubcomment-ees.enrd@
usdoj.gov. 

By mail ......... Assistant Attorney General, 
U.S. DOJ—ENRD, P.O. 
Box 7611, Washington, DC 
20044–7611. 

Any comments submitted in writing 
may be filed by the United States in 
whole or in part on the public court 
docket without notice to the commenter. 

During the public comment period, 
the Consent Decree may be examined 
and downloaded at this Justice 
Department website: https://
www.justice.gov/enrd/consent-decrees. 
If you require assistance accessing the 
Proposed Consent Decree, you may 
request assistance by email or by mail 
to the addresses provided above for 
submitting comments. 

Kathryn C. Macdonald, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division. 
[FR Doc. 2025–10509 Filed 6–9–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–11–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request; Request 
for Electronic Service of Orders— 
Waiver of Certified Mail Requirement 

ACTION: Notice of availability; request 
for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor 
(DOL) is submitting this Office of 
Workers’ Compensation Programs 
(OWCP)-sponsored information 
collection request (ICR) to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA). Public comments on the ICR are 
invited. 
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