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and FY 2014 inventory and a summary 
of the inventory on the DNFSB 
homepage at the following link: http:// 
www.dnfsb.gov/open. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Questions regarding the service contract 
inventory should be directed to Sherrill 
King at 202–694–7070 or Mailbox@
dnfsb.gov. 

Dated: June 1, 2015. 
Mark T. Welch, 
General Manager. 
[FR Doc. 2015–13708 Filed 6–4–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3670–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

[Docket No.: ED–2015–ICCD–0031] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget for Review 
and Approval; Comment Request; 
Formula Grant EASIE Annual 
Performance Report 

AGENCY: Office of Elementary and 
Secondary Education (OESE), 
Department of Education (ED). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. chapter 3501 et seq.), ED is 
proposing a new information collection. 
DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before July 6, 
2015. 

ADDRESSES: Comments submitted in 
response to this notice should be 
submitted electronically through the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal at http://
www.regulations.gov by selecting 
Docket ID number ED–2015–ICCD–0031 
or via postal mail, commercial delivery, 
or hand delivery. If the regulations.gov 
site is not available to the public for any 
reason, ED will temporarily accept 
comments at ICDocketMgr@ed.gov. 
Please note that comments submitted by 
fax or email and those submitted after 
the comment period will not be 
accepted; ED will only accept comments 
during the comment period in this 
mailbox when the regulations.gov site is 
not available. Written requests for 
information or comments submitted by 
postal mail or delivery should be 
addressed to the Director of the 
Information Collection Clearance 
Division, U.S. Department of Education, 
400 Maryland Avenue SW., LBJ, 
Mailstop L–OM–2–2E319, Room 2E117, 
Washington, DC 20202. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
specific questions related to collection 

activities, please contact Kimberly 
Smith, 202–453–6459. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Department of Education (ED), in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA) (44 U.S.C. 
3506(c)(2)(A)), provides the general 
public and Federal agencies with an 
opportunity to comment on proposed, 
revised, and continuing collections of 
information. This helps the Department 
assess the impact of its information 
collection requirements and minimize 
the public’s reporting burden. It also 
helps the public understand the 
Department’s information collection 
requirements and provide the requested 
data in the desired format. ED is 
soliciting comments on the proposed 
information collection request (ICR) that 
is described below. The Department of 
Education is especially interested in 
public comment addressing the 
following issues: (1) Is this collection 
necessary to the proper functions of the 
Department; (2) will this information be 
processed and used in a timely manner; 
(3) is the estimate of burden accurate; 
(4) how might the Department enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (5) how 
might the Department minimize the 
burden of this collection on the 
respondents, including through the use 
of information technology. Please note 
that written comments received in 
response to this notice will be 
considered public records. 

Title of Collection: Formula Grant 
EASIE Annual Performance Report. 

OMB Control Number: 1810—NEW. 
Type of Review: A new information 

collection. 
Respondents/Affected Public: State, 

Local and Tribal Governments. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Responses: 1,300. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Burden Hours: 20,800. 
Abstract: The purpose of Indian 

Education Formula Grant to Local 
Agencies, as authorized under Title VII, 
part A, subpart 1 of the Elementary and 
Secondary Education Act, as amended 
(sections 7111–7119, 20 U.S.C. 7421– 
7429) is to assist applicants to provide 
Indian students with the opportunity to 
meet the same challenging state 
standards as all other students and meet 
the unique educational and culturally 
related academic needs of American 
Indian and Alaska Native students. The 
Indian Education Formula Grant (CFDA 
84.060A) is not competitive or 
discretionary and requires the annual 
submission of the application from 
either a local education agency (LEA) 
and/or tribe. The amount of the award 

for each applicant is determined by a 
formula based on the reported number 
of American Indian/Alaska Native 
students identified in the application, 
the state per pupil expenditure, and the 
total appropriation available. The 524B 
Annual Performance Report (APR) was 
designed for discretionary grants, 
however the title VII program is a 
formula grant program. Therefore, the 
EASIE APR goes beyond the generic 
524B APR and facilitates the collection 
of more specific and comprehensive 
data due to grantees entering project 
specific data into an online database. 
This will allow for a comparison of 
LEAs across objectives. By entering 
information into the EASIE APR 
database, data will be able to be 
generated quickly and uniformly to 
facilitate data collection, as required 
under 34 CFR 75.720, and 2 CFR part 
200.301. This APR will improve the 
quality of data collected that can be 
used for evaluation and to help make 
policy decisions, reduce burden on the 
grantees, and allow ED to inform 
Congress on the outcomes of this grant 
program. 

Dated: June 1, 2015. 
Tomakie Washington, 
Acting Director, Information Collection 
Clearance Division, Office of the Chief Privacy 
Officer, Office of Management. 
[FR Doc. 2015–13720 Filed 6–4–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

[Docket No.: ED–2015–ICCD–0033] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget for Review 
and Approval; Comment Request; 
Transition to Teaching Evaluation 

AGENCY: Office of Innovation and 
Improvement (OII), Department of 
Education (ED). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. chapter 3501 et seq.), ED is 
proposing an extension of an existing 
information collection. 
DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before July 6, 
2015. 
ADDRESSES: Comments submitted in 
response to this notice should be 
submitted electronically through the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal at http://
www.regulations.gov by selecting 
Docket ID number ED–2015–ICCD–0033 
or via postal mail, commercial delivery, 
or hand delivery. If the regulations.gov 
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site is not available to the public for any 
reason, ED will temporarily accept 
comments at ICDocketMgr@ed.gov. 
Please note that comments submitted by 
fax or email and those submitted after 
the comment period will not be 
accepted; ED will only accept comments 
during the comment period in this 
mailbox when the regulations.gov site is 
not available. Written requests for 
information or comments submitted by 
postal mail or delivery should be 
addressed to the Director of the 
Information Collection Clearance 
Division, U.S. Department of Education, 
400 Maryland Avenue SW., LBJ, 
Mailstop L–OM–2–2E319, Room 2E117, 
Washington, DC 20202. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
specific questions related to collection 
activities, please contact Beatriz Ceja, 
202–205–5009. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Department of Education (ED), in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA) (44 U.S.C. 
3506(c)(2)(A)), provides the general 
public and Federal agencies with an 
opportunity to comment on proposed, 
revised, and continuing collections of 
information. This helps the Department 
assess the impact of its information 
collection requirements and minimize 
the public’s reporting burden. It also 
helps the public understand the 
Department’s information collection 
requirements and provide the requested 
data in the desired format. ED is 
soliciting comments on the proposed 
information collection request (ICR) that 
is described below. The Department of 
Education is especially interested in 
public comment addressing the 
following issues: (1) Is this collection 
necessary to the proper functions of the 
Department; (2) will this information be 
processed and used in a timely manner; 
(3) is the estimate of burden accurate; 
(4) how might the Department enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (5) how 
might the Department minimize the 
burden of this collection on the 
respondents, including through the use 
of information technology. Please note 
that written comments received in 
response to this notice will be 
considered public records. 

Title of Collection: Transition to 
Teaching Evaluation. 

OMB Control Number: 1855–0018. 
Type of Review: An extension of an 

existing information collection. 
Respondents/Affected Public: State, 

Local and Tribal Governments. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Responses: 42. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Burden Hours: 42. 

Abstract: This is a request for 
approval to collect information from 
Transition to Teaching (TTT) grantees 
that will be used to describe the extent 
to which local education agencies that 
received TTT grant funds have met the 
goals relating to teacher recruitment and 
retention described in their application. 
TTT grantees are funded for a period of 
five years. Currently, grantees are 
required by statute to submit an interim 
project evaluation to the Department of 
Education (ED) at the end of the third 
project year and a final project 
evaluation at the project’s end. In turn, 
the TTT program is required to prepare 
and submit to the Secretary and to 
Congress interim and final program 
evaluations containing the results of 
these grantee project evaluation reports. 
An analysis of these reports has 
provided some data on grantee 
activities, prior to the usage of the TTT 
survey, missing or incomplete data 
made it difficult to aggregate data across 
grantees in order to accurately describe 
to Congress the extent of program 
implementation. This data collection 
allows ED to gather data on a common 
set of indicators across grantees in order 
to describe and improve program 
implementation with the end goal of 
improving program performance. 

Dated: June 1, 2015. 
Tomakie Washington, 
Acting Director, Information Collection 
Clearance Division, Office of the Chief Privacy 
Officer, Office of Management. 
[FR Doc. 2015–13721 Filed 6–4–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 13163–004] 

Bishop Tungsten Development, LLC; 
Notice of Application Accepted for 
Filing, Soliciting Comments, Motions 
To Intervene, and Protests 

Take notice that the following 
hydroelectric application has been filed 
with the Commission and is available 
for public inspection: 

a. Type of Application: Request to 
amend exemption. 

b. Project No.: 13163–004. 
c. Date Filed: March 3, 2015, and 

supplemented March 31, 2015, and May 
14, 2015. 

d. Applicant: Bishop Tungsten 
Development, LLC. 

e. Name of Project: Pine Creek Mine 
Water Discharge System Sites 1 and 2 
Project. 

f. Location: On the applicant’s mine 
water discharge system in Inyo County, 
California. 

g. Filed Pursuant to: Federal Power 
Act, 16 U.S.C. 791a–825r. 

h. Applicant Contact: Mr. Lynn 
Goodfellow, Bishop Tungsten 
Development, LLC, 679 Marina Drive, 
Boulder City, Nevada 89005, (702) 293– 
1627, lgoodfellow@
goodfellowcrushers.com. 

i. FERC Contact: Mr. Jeremy Jessup, 
(202) 502–6779, Jeremy.Jessup@ferc.gov. 

j. Deadline for filing comments, 
motions to intervene, and protests, is 30 
days from the issuance date of this 
notice by the Commission. The 
Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filing. Please file comments, 
motions to intervene, and protests using 
the Commission’s eFiling system at 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/
efiling.asp. 

Commenters can submit brief 
comments up to 6,000 characters, 
without prior registration, using the 
eComment system at http://
www.ferc.gov/doc-sfiling/
ecomment.asp. You must include your 
name and contact information at the end 
of your comments. For assistance, 
please contact FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, (866) 
208–3676 (toll free), or (202) 502–8659 
(TTY). In lieu of electronic filing, please 
send a paper copy to: Secretary, Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426. 
The first page of any filing should 
include docket number P–13163–004. 

k. Description of Request: The 
application explains that the applicant 
installed generating equipment that is 
different than the equipment approved 
in the exemption. The applicant is 
requesting to revise the authorized 
installed capacity of the project from 
150 kW to 250 kW to reflect the 
generating equipment installed at the 
project. The application states that the 
installation of generating equipment 
with a higher generating capacity does 
not impact the operation and hydraulic 
discharge of the project. 

l. Locations of the Application: A 
copy of the application is available for 
inspection and reproduction at the 
Commission’s Public Reference Room, 
located at 888 First Street NE., Room 
2A, Washington, DC 20426, or by calling 
(202) 502–8371. This filing may also be 
viewed on the Commission’s Web site at 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/
elibrary.asp. Enter the docket number 
excluding the last three digits in the 
docket number field to access the 
document. You may also register online 
at http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/
esubscription.asp to be notified via 
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